o192
- - f 4
UNITED STATES & C’ i

NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION ‘j’ i
WASHINGTON, 0. C. 20555 ~

MAY |

l."C

Docket No. 50-142 Hdqtrs, PDR

The Regents of the University of
California

Mr. Harold V. Brown

Los Angeles, California 90024

Gentlemen:

We are enclosing herewith an amendment to your indemnity agreement

reflecting the changes to 10 CFR Part 140, "Financial Protection Requirements
and Indemnity Agreements," effective May 1. 1979. The amendments to

Part 140, a copy of which is also enclosed, give effect to the increase

from $140 million to $160 miliion in the primary layer of nuclear energy
liability insurance provided by the American Nuclear Insurers and Mutual
Atomic Energy Liability Underwriters.

Although the increase in the primary layer of insurance will be reflected
in all indemnity agreements as a "boilerplate" revision, only operators
of large power reactors and certain plutonium facility licensees (i.e.,
not 1icensees such as you) will be required to provide this increased
insurance.

we would appreciate your indicating acceptance of the amendments to your
indemr ity agreement in the space provided and returning one signed copy.
If you have any questions about the foregcing, please conta«t us.

Sincerely,

""" Jerome Sa tzégn, Chief
Antitrust & Indemnity
Office of Nuclear Rgéctor Regulation

Enclosures:
1. Amendment to !ndemnity Agreement
2. Amendment to 10 CFR Part 140




UNITED STATES
NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION
WASHINGTON, D. C. 20555

ey

Docket No. 50-142

AMENDMENT TO INDEMNITY AGREEMENT NO. E-16
AMENDMENT NO. 8

Effective May 1, 1979, Indemnity Agrcement No. E-16, between The Regents
of the University of Califorria and the Atomic Energy Commission, dated
October 9, 1962, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

Article 111, Paragrapn 4(b)(2) is amended by deleting the amount
"$140,000,000" and substituting therefor the amount "$160,000,000."

FUR THE UNITED STATES NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION

M
Jerome Saltzman, Chief

Antitrust and Indemni roup
Office of Nuclear Reactor Regulation

Accepted , 1979

By
THE REGENTS OF THE UNIVERSITY OF

CALIFORNIA



832 Federanl Rempster

VoL 4. No 98 |/

Friday. Aprii 6 1879 / Rules and Reguiations

-

This document has becn reviewec 1n
accordance with FmHA Instruction
1901-G, “Environmental Impact
Statements " 1! is the det2rmination of
FmHA that this action does not
constitute @ major Federal action
significantly affecting the quality of the
human environmen! and in accordance
with the Natonal Environmental Policy
of 1968, Pub. L. 91-180, an
Environmenta. lmpact Statement is not
required.

Au:norities: (42 US.C. 1480: deiegation of
e=thority by the Secretary of Agnculture, 7
C¥R 2.23: delegation of suthority by the
Assisian! Secretz+y for Rural Neveiopment 7
CFR 270)

Dated: March 30, 1978.
e

AdIu o Carmers Howme AdEnisistroten.
Pl nsoechor 48|

PR Doc. ™5-10887 “Usd 6670 045 am|
BLLING CODE 3. 10-07 -4

T

NUCLEAR REZGULATORY
COMMISSION

16 CFR Part 140

Financial Protection Requirements and
Indemnity Agreements; Misceilaneous
Amendments

agency: U.S. Nuclear Regulatory
Commission.

acnos: Final Rule.

suUMMARY: The provisions of Section 170
of the Atomic Ene:gy Act of 1854, as
amended. require production and
utilization facility licensees to have and
maintain financial protection to cover
public liability claims resulting from a
nuclear incident.

The Nuclear Regulatory Commission
1s amending its regulations 10 increase
the level of the primary layer of
financial protection required of certain
indemnified licensees. T1 e Commission
is amending its regulations at the
present time (o coincic+, as statutorily
required. with the increase in the level
of the primary layer of insurance
provided by private nuclear liability
im.sursnce pools.

EFFECTIVE DATE May 1, 197%.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Mr. Ira Dinitz. Antitrust and Inderanity
Group. US. Nuclear Regulatory
Commission. Washin~ton. DC 205535,
(Phone: 301-482-8336)
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The
provisions of Section 170 of the Atomic
Energv Act of 1954, as amended. (the
Act) require production and utilization
facility licensees ‘0 have and maintain
financial protection to cover public

liability claims resulting from a nuciear
incident. Section 170 of the Act. requires
the Nuciear Regulatory Commissior to
indemnify the licensee and other
persons incemnified. up to the statutory
luaitation on liability. against public
liability claims in excess of the amount
»f financial protection required.
Subsection 170b. of the Act requires that
for facilites designed for producing
substant's. 2*aounts of electricity an<
having & rated czpacity of 100 electrical
megawatts or more, the amount of
financial protecticn * required shall be
the maximum amount available from
private sources. For other licensees. the
Commissicr: may require lesser amounts
of financiai protection. Primary financial
protection may be in the form of private
insurance, private contractual
indemnities, seli-insurance or other
proof of financial responsibility, or
combination of such measures.

The iusurers who provide the nuclear
liability insurance, American Nuclear
Insurers (ANI) and Mutual Atomic
Energy Liability Underwriters (MAELU),
have advised the Commission that
effective January 9. 1879, the maximum
amount of primary nuclear energy
liability insurence available was
increased from $140 million to 130
m.ilion. Pursuant to the provisions of
subsection 170b. of the Act, the amount
of pnmarv financia! prc:ection required
fer facilities having a rated capacity of
170 electrics’ megewatts or more will be
aressed to 5160 million, effective May
1, i#"% in addition. in compliance with
10 CFR Part 140, those persons licensed
to possess piutonium in the amount of §
kilograms or more and persons licensed
to process pilutonium in the amount of 1
kilogram or more for use in plutonium
processing and fuel fabrication plants
wil! also be requiied to provide financial
protection in the amount of $160 million.

Since the amendments set - * below
conform the Commussion's r itions to
a statutory requrement. the mmission
has found that good cause exists for
omitting & +atue/impact analysis, public
notice of proposed rule makurg and
publi: procedure thereon as
ATDeCLEsAry.

Pursuenti to the Atomic Energy Act of
1954, as amended, the Energy
Keorganuzation Act of 1874, as an.ended.

'The Act does not by its precise language require
mamntenance of & “pramary” (Le.. nuciec hability
insurance | layer and & “secondary” [Le.
retrospectve premuum ) layer of financal protection
but merely considers the combination of these rwo
layers a2 financial protection.” However 10 CTR
Part 140. of the Commuamon © reguistions tha!
impieent the Act. disunguishes Defween lhe
prunary and secondary layer of inancial
protection The amenaments tn Uus rule relate
solely 10 inCreases 1o the prumary layer of financial
protechon.

and sections 552 and 553 of Title 5 of the
United States Code, the following
amendments to Title 10, Chapter L. Part
140. Code of Federal Regu.- tions. are
nublished &s & documen: sudject 1o

codificatioa.

§ 14011 [Amended]

1. Section 140.11(a)(4) is amended by
deleting “$140,000.000" and subsututing
therefor “$160,000,000.”

§140.13a [Amended)

2 S-~tion 140.13a(a) is amended by
deleti.; the term “$140,000.000" and
suostituting therefor “$160,000.000.”

§ 14291 [Amenced)

3. In § 142.01, Appendix A, Caaditon
4 is amended by revising the foc-mote 2
reac as follows: “For policies issued by
Nucic ar Energy Liability-Property
Insurance Association the amount will
be “$12+ 000,000"; for policies issued by
Mutual Atomic Energy Liability
Underwriters, the amount will be
**$36,000,000."

¢ In § 140.91, Appendix A, paragraph
il of the “Optional Amendatcry
Endorsement” is amended by revising
the footnote to read as follows:
“For policies issued by Nuclear Energy
Liability-Property Insurance Association
the amount will be “$124.000,000"; for
policies issued by Mutual Atomic
Energy Liability Underwriters the
amount will be “$36,000,000."

§ 140,92 [Amended)

5. Section 140.92. Appendix B, Arcle
IL paragraph 8(a), is amended by
deleting the amount “$108,500,000"
wherever it appears and substituting
therefor “$124.000,000."

6. Section 140.82. Appendix B, Article
Il paragraph 8(b), is amended by
deleting the amount “$31.500,000"
wherever it appears and substituting
therefor “$36.000,000.”

7. Section 140.92, Appendix B, Article
[ paragraph 8(c), is amended by
changing the amount “$140,000,000" to

8. Section 140.892. Appendix B, Article
[Il. paragraph 4(b)(2). is amended by
changing “$140.000,000" to

§ 14083 [Amended)

9. Section 140.93, Appendix C. Article
Il. paragraph 8. 1s amended by changing
'$140.000,000" to “$160.000.000."

10. Section 140.93. Appendix C. Article
{Il. paragraph 4(b}(2). 1s amended by
changing “$140.000.000" to




Faderal Register | Vol. 4. No. 88 / Friday. Apnl 8. 1979 | Rules and Regulations
S ——

§ 14094 (Amended)

1. Section 140.94. Appendix D. Article
[l paragraph 8. is amended by changing
"$140.000.000" to “$160.000.000."

§140.98 (Amended)

12. Section 140.95. Appendix E, Article
(L paragraph 4(bj(2). is amended by
changing “$140.000.000" to

§140.107 [Amended)

13. Section 140.107, Appendix C,
Article [I. paragraph 8(z), is amended by
deleting the amount “$108,500,000"
wherever it appears and substituting
therefor “$124.000.000."

14. Section 140.107, Appendix G,
Article Il paragraph 8(b), is amended by
deleting the amount “$31,500.000"
wherever it appears and substituting
therefor “$38,000.000."

15. Section 140.107. Appendix G,
Artucie [l paragraph 8(c), is amended
by changing the amount “$140.000,000"
to “$160,000.000."

1€. Section 140.107, Appendix G,
Article [II, p<.agraph 4(' ), is amended
by changing the amount “$140.000,000"
o “$180 000,000."

§ 140,108 [Amanded)

17. Section 140.108, Appe- lix G.
Article [I. paragraph 8. s amendec by
che:ging the amount “$140.000,00¢" to
“$180.000 7 ¥,

{4, Section 140.108, Appendix H.
Articie [l paragraph 4(u), is amendes
. v “hangine the amount “$140,000.000"
1o "$160.000.000."

EFFECTIVE DATE: The foregoing
amendments become effective on May 1,
1979

(Secs. 181. Pub. L. 83-703, 88 Stat. 948 (42

U.S C 2201); Sec. 170, Pub. L. 35-258 =1 Stat.
578 Pub. L. 94-197 99 Stat. 1111 (42 US.C.
2210): Sec. 201. Pub. L. 93438, as amended. 38
Stat.1242. 39 Stat 415 (42 US.C. 5841))

Dated at Washington. D.C., this 2nd day of
April 1979

For the Nuclear Regulatc v Commission.
Semnnd |. i,

Secretry of the Commear
FR Doc "-1008) Mled 45" 248 am/|
BLLNG CODE "800

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE
CORPORATION

12 CFR Parts 307 and 327
Assumption and Assesament of
Deposit Lizbilities of Insured Banks;

Veoluntary Termination of-insurance
Status

AGENCY: Federal Deposit 'nsurance
Qrps_nnon.

ACTION: Final rule.

SUMMARY: [he Federal Deposit
Insurance Carpovation has jecided to
revise and amend §§ 307.3 and
327.2(b)(3) of its regulations to: (1)
implement Sections 304 and 310 of the
Financial Institutions Reguiatory and
[nterest Rate Control Act of 1978
(FIRIRCA) which pertain to the
assumption and assessment of deposit
liabilities of insured banks, and (2)
correct an inaccurate reference.
EFFECTIVE DATE April 8, 1979,

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Jerry L. Langiey, Senicr Attorney,
Federal Deposit [nsurance Corporation,
550 17th Street. N.W., Washington, D.C.
20429, telephone (202) 389-4237.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section
304 of FIRIRCA amends Section 8(q) of
the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (FDI
Act) to provide that whenever the
deposit izhilities of an insured bank are
assume ¢ -7 another insursd bank,
whether by merge:. -nsoi'dation. or
other statutecy sssuptios. or by
contracc (1 the insured status of the
bank whose deposits are assumed shall
terminate on the date the Corporation
receives satisfactory evidence of the
assumption: (2) the separate insurance
of al! insured deposits so assumed shall
terminate six months after the date the
assumption takes effect or, in the case of
any time deposit, the eariiest matunty
de‘e after the six-month period: and (3)
the continuing bank shail give notice of
the assumpton to the depositors of the
bank whose deposits are assumed
within 30 days after the assumption
takes effect. Section 307.3 has been
revised to implement these provisions
and to correct an incorrect citation by
changing the reference “§ 304.3 (s) and
(t]" in Section 307.3(b) to "§ 304.3 (1)
and (v)"

Section 310 of FIRIRCA amends
Section ~ of the FDI Act to exciude
deposits accumulated for *he repayment
of personal lcans from the ¢«iaition of
deposits for insurance assessment
purposes. Section 327 .2(b)(3) of FDIC s
reguiations has been amended to aline
its definution of the term “deposit” for
assessment purposes with that of
Section 310 of FIRIRCA.

Since the changes are procedural in
nature or necessitated by statutory
amendment, the Board of Directors of
the Federal Deposit [nsurance
Corporation has determined. under
Section 302.6 of its rules and regulations
12 CFR § 302.8), that notice of =rd
public s ticipation in. this rulemaking
is unnecessary and that good cause
ex:sts for the waiv.r of the 30-day
deferral of the effective date for the

Acy ordingly, 12 CFR 307.3 and 327.2

subparagraph (b) are changed as
follows:

PART 307—VOLUNTARY
TERMINATION OF INSURANCE
STATUS

1. 12 CFR 3073 is revised to read:
§307.3 Steps to be taken and records to

be u nished the Corporation where
Geposits are assumed by another insured
banic

(a) Whenever the deposit liabilities of
an insured bank are assumed by another
insured bank, whether by merger,
consolidation, or other statutory
assumption, or by contract. the
continuing bark shall give notice of the
assumption to the depositors of the bank
whose deposits are assumed within 30
days after th2 assumption takes effect.®
Such notice shall be (1) mail+d to each
depositor at the depositor's 'ast address
o’ record as shown upon the hooks of
the bank. (2) published in not less than
two issues of a local newspaper of
general circulation, and (3) in form
substantially as follows:

Date)
Notice to Depositors:

Please be advised that the deposit
liabilittes shown on the books of (Name of
Assumed Baok) (City or town)

(State) as of close of
on

assumed by the undersigned bank. The
nsured sistus of (Name of assumed bank)
will 'ernunate at the time proviaed in section
8(g) of the Feders. "i2posit [nsurance Act
The separate insurance of its deposits will
therefore termunate at the end of six months
from the above date or, in the case of 2 time
dsposit. the earliest matunty cate after the
sux-month period.

You are advised that the undersigned bank
'8 an insured bank and that your deposits will
coatinue 'o be nsured by the Federal Deposit
[nsurance Corporation in the manner and o
the extent provided in said Act
(Name of Bank)
[Address)

There may be inciuded in such notice
any additional :nformation or advice the
bank may deem desirable.

"The notice requirement does not appiy 1o
‘Phantom ' bank mergers as defined n loomote 2a
of Section 303.11(a}(9!.



Vol Rules and Regulations

Federal Register 44. No. 80 / Tuesdav. April 24. 1979

NUCLEAR REGULATORY
CONMISSION

10 CFR Part 140

Financial Prote<tion Requirements and
Indemnity Agreements; Misceaneous
Amendaments

Caorrection

In FR Doc. ' $-10853. appearng at
vaye 20832. 1. e 1ssue of Fnday. Apnl
6 1979. on page 20637. make the
iollow:ng corrections

(1) In the first column in paragraph 18,
n ths second lin:, correct “Article (1" to
ead "Artcle Il

2) In »aragraps
correct A oendix G

n the firct line
o rea:
Appendix H

BLLING CODE 15080 1-

- m—

DEPARTME MY OF ENERCY
10 CFR Par 205

Administrative Procedures and
Sanctions; 1979 Interpreiations of the
Genera! Counsel

AGENCY: N
ACTIG#"

tment of Energy
tice of Interpretations
SUMMARY: Attached is the Interpretation
ssued by the Office of General Counsel
of the Department of Energy under 10
CFR Part 208, Subpart F. during the
penod March 1. 1979, through March )
1979

Appendix B identifies those Requests
for Interpretation which have been
lismissed dunng the same penod
FOR FURTHER INFORMA TION CONTACT:
Diane Stubbs. Office of General
Counsel. Department o ergy. 12th &
Pennsylvania Avenue NW . Room 1121
Wasnington. D.C. 2047 . {202) 633-8070
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMA | ‘ON:
Interpretations issued pursuant to 10
CFR Part 205, Subpart F. are published
in the Federal Registor in accordance
with the editorial and classification
criteria set forth in #2 FR 7923 (February
8. 1977). as modifie< n 42 FR 46270
September 15. 1977)

These Interpretations depend for their
autherity on the accuracy of the factual
s'atement used as a basis for the
Interpretation (10 CFR 205.84(a)(2)) and
may be rescinded ar med:fied at any
time (§ 2% 85(d)}. Only the persons to
whom '~ terpretations are ressed and
cther .w:sons upe .« whor
Interpretations are served ase eriut!ad to
rely on them (§ 205.85ic)). An
nterpretation is modified by a
subsequent amend nen: 'o the
reguiation(s) or ruling(s) inte preted
thereby to the extent ! the
Interpretai.on is inconsistent with the
amended reguiat:on(s) or ruling(s)

(§ 205.85(e)). The Interpretations
pubdlished below are not subject 1o
appeal.

Issued in Washiugton. D.C.. Aoe
Everard A Maersogta 1.

As1 sont Cenerw
“

“oarsei ‘or interprew: ne
® O aner Lowrset

wnciair O Corporation "
Res woton [nterpreted 10 CFR 210.62{a)
e GCW —Pl—~Normal business practices
s

The Sinclair Oul rporation. a smalil and

ndependent refiner subwect 1o 10 CFR Part
Marsets petroleum procucts
Sinclarr Marketing

Swciair! Since Mav 1973

Dart &
ugh 18 subsidiary
ANOciar e
nrac's with joobers and dealers
f 2a%0!ine have required
javs. Pavment in

) Gavs Nas eLtitied a purchaser 'o

G4rd

he sale of mot
vment n fuil wertin
I whn

yercen! Jiscoun! on the purchase pnce
nsigereqd 4n account

y more than

air Nas
ding D aavs ‘o be 'n
1 Ana subect suit. In that instance

fon Costs wouwd De assignabie '0 ‘he

account. AL i@ present time, Singlair desires
to modify its standard coatracts for the sale
of motor gasoline to require a finance charge
of one and one-haif (1%) percent monthi: on
the balance of all accounts not paid wathin X
davs. No other credit terms are 10 be
changed

S.e

es Sinciair s proposal 'o assess a finance
narge on all Jelinquent accounts consntute
ne mopcsition of 3 more strngent credit term
Nan ‘he creq:! 'erms n effect on Mav 15
1973 wathun the meaning of 10 CFR 108204

[nte-oretat:oh
)r the reasons set forth delow *he
rement of Energy | DOE! nas deter.aned

I Snciar s nciusion ot
v finance chame on ail
JO gavs ‘n s standara

) 4 1 % percent
accounts no
“ontracts

~
2uDDlIers wili Gen

for the sale of motar gasoline wouid
onstitute the :mpositica of a more stringent
cred:t ‘erm than ‘he credit terms n effect on
May 15. 1973 n nation of § 210624
The General Allocation and Price Rules
forth at 10 CFR Part M0 and adopted on
anuary 14. 1974 .3 FR 1824 /|anuary 15
1974;. were intended to set forth the
provisions applicadie to both the Mandatory
P:troleum Allocation Regulations (10 CFR
Part 217) and the Mandatory Petroieum Price
Reguiancns (10 CFR Part 212). The allocaron
anc pnce regulatons were adopted '0
implement the statutory mandate of Section
4(a) of the Emergency Petroieum Allocation
Act of 1973 (£PAA), as amended. Pub. L. No.
93-158 (Nov: ~ber 27 1973
Section 2° da) regulates crecit terms as a
function of ¢ ~ recognition of the varying
roies that cr=uit «o.d other cond tions of sale
play in the “uw of product.’ Section 210.62!a
provides 11 re.evant part
with purchasers ¢
allocated product < “corain
Dusin ss practices in effect during the base
period spacified in Part 211 for that allocated
product. and no supplier may modify any
no mal b '~ 288 pracce 30 as to result in the
circumvention of any provision of this
chapter Credit terms other than those
associated with seasonal creu’ programs are
inciuded as a part of the ‘ay ' ,, 1971 pnce
charged 0 a class of purchaser under - art
21< of this Chapeer rung in thes ps sgraph
shall be construed to ~~quire suppiters 10 §
0 purchasers who do so1 ar’s e proper
credit or payment for ailocsied products. as
customarly asinciated w ass of
purchass« an May 1§ 1973
Howevs: 13 supplier may require or impose
mare @ent credit terms or payment
schedu 1 purchasers than those in effect
for tha: “.ass of purchaser on May 15
1973 o
According 'o the facts presented by
Sinciair. neither at the present ime nor on

fan

'0 normai

that

1SUSC 731 e seq (1978)

'Since the decision by *he Temparary Emergency
Court of Appeais i Marethor O/ C
F2d 1140 [TECA 1975). there can d* no b
concermung 'he suthor'y of the Fegeral Enery
Adminmistranon (FEA| and its successor. the DOE o
reguiate crecit terms incident o the mandatory
petroleum pnce reguiations. ln addinon. the DOE
has resoived issues simuar 10 the one presented by
Sinclair concernung whether changes n crecit terms
are permissidie 1n view of the provisions of
§ 21082!4). See Exxon Companv. 5.4 2 DOE
L L tober 28 1978\ Crvsta/ O/ Co. 1 FEA
920.181 (Cctober 8 1973) | O
interpretation 1977-38. & T 15260 Octover 3
197" the DOE found tha' requinng purchasers of
BWotor gasoline 10 .ncur ‘or the first 'ime ‘he
adg tonal cost of O0taIMING erters of or
uaranteeng payment o Transit wouid have the
erfect of ‘mposing a More stmngent sregit ‘erm han
he crea.t terms in offect o0 Mav 15 1977 n

yaton of § 21082
previousiv ons a a
Ne where ‘he Jroposed

op nis

Transit Corp

However e DOE Nas nort
A9¢ 3UCH 1% Nhe Dresen

N4ange n credit ‘eems
wWOouig 4 Mer ‘Re Jurcnase Hnce ue n




