UNITED STATES
NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMM:SSION
WASKINGTON, D. C. 20555

may + 1979

Docket No. 50-150

The Ohio State University
ATTN: Mr. Edward Q. Moulton
Vice President Business & Administration
190 North Oval Mall
Columbus, Ohio 47210

Gentlemen:

We are enclosing herewith an amendment to your indemnity agreement

reflecting the changes to 10 CFR Part 140, "Financial Protection Requirements
and Indemnity Agreements," effective May 1, 1979. The amendments to

Part 140, a copy of which is also enclosed, give effect to the increase

from $140 million to £:60 million in the primary layer of nuclear energy
liability insurance provided by the American Nuclear Insurers and Mutual
Atomic Eneray Liability Underwriters.

Although the increase in the primary layer of insurance will be reflected
in all indemnity agreements as a "boilerplate” revision, only operators
nf large power reactors and certain plutonium facility licensees (i.e.,

not licensees such as you) will be required to provide this increased
insurance.

We would appreciate your indicating acceptance of the amendments to your
indemniiy agreement in the space provided and returning one signed copy.
If ycu have any questions about the foregoing, please contact us.

Sincerely,

G~

Jerome Saltzman, Chi
Antitrust & Indemnj
Office of Nuclear Reactor Regulation

Enclosures: 8
1. Amendment to Indemnity Agreement
2. Amendment to 10 CFR Part 140




S . UNITED STATFS

& "; NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION
« wad e WASHINGTON D. C. 20555
" .

% 'y

Y i LS &

5,’ hoad ‘0
Taran®

Docket No. 50-150

AMENDMENT TO INDEMNITY AGREEMENT NO. E-8

AMENDMENT NO. 9

Erfective May 1, 1979, Indemnity Agreement No. E-8, between The Ohio

State Universtiy and the Atomic Energy Commission, dated September 21,
1862, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

Article III, Paragraph 4(b)(2) is amended by deleting the amouunt
“$140,000,000" and substituting therefor *he amount "$160,000,000."

FOR THE UNITED STATES NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION

Vs

Jerome Saltzman, Chie
Antitrust and Ind

y Group
Office of Nuclear Keactor Regulation
Accepted , 1979
By

THE OHI0 STATE UNIVERSITY




Feders. Remster

Vol 44. No 86 / Fnday. Apri 6 1§79

Rules and Regulations

ke v

This document has been reviewed n
ac: ordance with FmHA Instruction
1%1-0, “"Environmenial Impact
Statements.” It is tue determinaton of
FmiiA that thus action does not
constitule a major Federal acion
significantly affecting the quality of the
human environment and in accordance
with the “=uural Eavironmental Policy
of 1968, . L 91-180, an
Enviroomenta! lmpact Statement i not
required.

Authoritie: (42 1.S.C. 1480 delegation of
suthor''y by .he Secretary of Agnculture, 7
CFR 2.23: delegation of authonty by the
Assistant Secretary for Rural Development. 7
CFR 270}

Dated: March 30 147%.

e e e—

Adirnstrasor . mery Home Admusiesaton
(PotiA nstrwchon 4445

PR Doc. 7510880 Fued 4578 845 am|
BLLNG COUE 3410-07 4

MUCLEAR REGULATORY
COMMISSION

10 CFR Part 140

Financial Protection Requirements and
indemnity Agreements; Misceilaneous
Amendments

Aaency: U.S. Nuclear Regulatory
Commuission.

AcTion: Final Rule.

suUMMARY: The provic.ous of Section 170
of the Atomic Energy Act of 1854. as
amended. /equire production and
utilization facility licensees to have and
maintain financial protection to cover
public liability claims resulting from a
nuclear incident.

The Nuclear Regulatory Commission
is amending its regulations 10 increase
the level of the primary layer of
financial protection required of certain
indemnified licensees. The Commission
is amending its regulations at the
present time 1o coincide, as statutorily
required. with the increase in the level
of the primary layer of insurance
provided oy private nuclear liability
insurance pools.

EFFECTIVE DATE May 1. 197%.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Mr. lra Dinutz, Antitrust and Indemmu.y
Group. U.S. Nuciear Reguiatory
Commussior.. Washungton. DC Z0558.
(Phoue: 301-472-8336)
SUPPLEMENTARY INFOWMATION: The
provisions of Section 170 of the Atomic
Enerev Act of 1954, as amended. (the
Ac ' require production and utilization
facility licensees 10 have and mainiain
financiai protectioa to cover public

liability claums resultng from a nuciear
incident. Secuon 170 of the Act. requires
the Nuclear Reguiatory Commussion to
indemnify the licensee and cther
persons indemnified. up to the statutory
lim:tation ou Liability. against public
liability claims in excess of the amount
of finaw.cial protection required
Subsection 170b. of the Act requures that
for faciiites designed for producing
substantial amounts of electricity and
having a rated capacity of 100 electrical
megawatts or more, the amount of
financial protection ' required shall be
ths maximum amount available from
private sources. For other licensees. the
Commisr ,u may require lesser amounts
of financ:al protection. Primary financial
protection may be in the form of private
insurance, private contractual
indemnities. self-insurance or other
proof of financial responsibility, or
combination of suchk measures.

The insurers who provide the nuclear
liability insurance, American Nuclear
Insurers (ANI) and Mutual Atomic
Energy Liability Underwriters (MAELU),
bave advised the Commission hat
effective January 9. 1979, the maximum
amount of primary nuclear energy
liability insurance available was
incrensed from $140 million to $160
million. Pursuart to the provisions of
subsection 170b. of the Act, thy amount
of primary fiuancial protection required
for facilities ke ving a rated capaaty of
100 electrical megawatts or more will be
increasec to $160 million. effec’ive May
1, 1879. In addition, in compliance with
10 CFR Part 140, those persons licensed
to possess plutonium in the amount o’ 5
kilograms or more and persons licensed
to process piutonium in the amount of 1
kilogram or more for use ir plutonium
processing and fuel fabricauon plants
will also be required to provide fizancial
protection in the amount of $160 million.

Since the amendments se’ out below
conform the Commission's regulations to
a starutory requirement. the Commission
has found that good cause exists for
omutting a value/impact analyms. public
notice of proposec ~ule making and
public proc:‘ure thereon as
unnecessary

Pursuant to th Atomic Energy Act of
1954, as amendec. ine Energy
Reorganization Act of 1874, as amended.

"The Act goes not v ity precse language require
o Atenance of & “pu wary” (Le. nuciear Lability
o rance! Wyer and & secondan [Le.
retrospective pretuum | laver of financial protection
but mereiv considem the combination of Wese two
layers as financiai protection. However 10 OFR
Part 1:0. of the Commussion 3 reguiations tha!
unplement the Acl distng ushes Detweern the
primary and seconcary .ayers of {inancia!
protection The amendments 10 Jus nue reia'e
soleiy 10 - cresses o Lhe prunary aver of financial
protecthor

and sections 552 and 553 of Title 5 of the
United States Code the following
amendments to Title 10. Chapter | ’an
140. Code of Fede ul Regulations. are
published as & document subjec! 10
codification.

§140.11 [Amended)

1. Section 140.11(a)/'4) 1s amendec by
deleting “$140,000.000" and substituting
therefor “$160,000,000."

§140.138 [Amended]

2 Section 140.13a(a) is amended by
deleting the term “$140.000,000" and
substituting therefor “$160,000.000.”

§ 14091 [Amended]

3. In § 140.91, Appendix A. Condition
4 is amended by revising the footnote to
read as follows: “For policies issued by
Nuclear Energy Liability-Property
Insurance Association the amount will
be “$124.000.000"; for policies issued by
Mutual Atomic Energy Liability
Underwriters, the amount will be

4. In § 14091, Appendix A, paragraph
[ of the “Optional Amendatory
Endorsement” ic #men-ed by revising
the footnote to read as iollowa:
“For policies issued by Nuclear Energy
Liability-Property Insurance Associgtion
the amount will be “$124,000,000"; for
policies issued by Mutual Atomic
Energy Liability Underwriters the
amount will be “$36,000,000."

; 140.92 |Amended)

5. Section 140.82, Appendix B, Article
[l paragraph &(a). is amended by
deleting the amount “$108,500,000"
wherever it appears & d substituting
therefor “$124,000,000.”

8. Section 140 82. Appendix B. Article
[l. paragraph 8(b), is amended by
deleting the amount “$31,500,000"
wherever it appears and substituting
therefor “$36.000,000."

7. Section 140.82, Appendix B, Article
[I. paragraph 8(c). is ax «nded by
changing the amount “$140,000.000" to

8. Section 140.92, Appendix B, Articie
[Il, paregraph 4(b)(2). is amended by
changing “$140,000.000" to

§ 14023 [Amendea]

S. Section 140.93, Appendix C. Article
Il. paragraph 8. i1s amended by changing
$140.000,6u0" to “$160,000.000."

10. Section 140.93. Appnendix C. Article
IIl. paragraph 4(b}(2), 1s amended by
changing “$140.000.000" to
$160.000,000."




Federal Register

Vol. 4. No. 88

Friday. Apnl 8. 197
S

Rules and Regulatons

20833

§ 14094 [Amenced)

11. Section 140.94. Appendix D, Artic'e
(I paragraph 8. is amended by zhanging
$140.000.000" 10 $160.000.000

§140.56 [Amended|

12. Section 14C 95. Appendix E. Article
(L paragraph 4(b)(2), is amended by
..anging '$140.000,000" to
"$160.000.000.

§ 140,107 [Amended)

13. Section 140.107, Appendix G,
Article [I. paragraph 8(a), 1s amended by
deleting the amount “$108.500.000"
wherever it appears and substitutng
therefor “$124.000,.000."

14. Section 140.107. Appendix G,
wrticle [1 paragraph 8(b), 1s amended by
deleting the amount “$31,500.000"
whersver it appears and substituting
therefor "“$36,000.000."

15. Section 140.107. Appendix G,
Article [II. paragraph 8(c, s amended
Dy changing the amount “$140.000,000"
' "$160,000.000."

18. Section 140.107, Appendix G,
Article [IL. paragraph 4(b), is amended
Oy changing the amount “$140.000,000"
to "$16¢ 000,000."

§140.108 [Amended)

17. Section 140.108, Appendix G,
Article [l paragraph 8. 1s amended by
changing the awount “$140.000.000" to
“$160.000.000."

18. Section 140.108. Appendix {1,
Article [Il. paragraph 4(b), is amended
by changing the amount “$140.000,000"
to "$740,000.000
EFFECTIVE DATY: The foregoing
amendments become effective ua May 1,
1979
Secs. 181, Pub. L 83-702, 83 Stat. 348 (42
US.C. 201): Sec. 1™ Pub. L. 85-258. ™1 Stat.
578. Pub. L. 94-197 ® Stat. 1111 (42 US.C.
2210): Sec. 201. Puo L. 93434, as amended. 38
Stat.1242. % Stat <15 (42 US.C. 5841)!

Date st Washingron, D.C.. this 2nd day of
April 1979

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission
St | Ol
Secrery o Ne Comunsesion
R Doc 510880 Fled &-5-"v 248 am/

BLLNG COOE "306. 714

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE
CORPORATION

12 CFR Parts 307 and 327
Assumption and Assessment of
Deposit Liabilities of insured Banks;

Voluntary Termination of-insurancs
Status

AGENCY: Federal Deposit [nsurance
Corporation.

ACTION: Final mile.

SUMMARY: The Federal Deposit
nsurance Corporation has decidea to
revise and amend §§ 307.3 and
27.2(b)(3) of its regulations to: (1)
implement Sections 304 and 310 of the
Financial [nstitutions Regulatory and
[nterest Rate Control Act of 1978
(FIRIRCA) which pertain to tie
assumption and assessment of deposit
liabilities of insured banks, and (2)
correct an inaccurate reference.
EFFECTIVE DATE April 8, 1979,
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
lerry L. Langley, Senior Attorney.
Federal Nerosit [nsurance Corporation,
550 17th Street. N.W., Washington, D.C.
20423, telephone (202) 3894237
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section
304 of FIRIRCA araends Section 3(q) of
the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (FDI
Act) to provide that whenever the
deposit liabilities of an insured bank are
assumed by another insu. +d bank,
whether by merger, consolidation, or
other statutory assumption, or by
contract: (1) the insured status of the
bank whose Jeposits are sasumed shall
termunate on the date the Corporation
receives satisfactory evidence of the
assumption: (2) the separate insurance
of all insured deposits so assumed shail
terminate six months after the date the
assumotion takes effect or, in the case of
any tme deposit, the eartiest matunity
date ater the six-month period: and (3)
the continuing bank shall give notice of
the assumption to the depositors of the
bank whose deposits are assumed
within 30 days after the assumption
takes effect. Section 307.3 has heen
revised to implemert these provisions
and to correct an incorrect Gtation by
changing the reference "§ 304.3 (8} and
t)” in Section 307.3(b) to *§ 304.3 (u)
andg (v}"

Section 310 of FIRIRCA amends
Section 7 of the FDI Act to exciude
deposits accumuiated for the repayment
of personal locans from the defimition of
deposits for :nsurance assessment
purposes. Section 327 2(b)(3) of FDIC's
rTeguiations las deen amended '0 aline
ts definition of the term “deposit” for
assessment purposes with that of
Section 310 of FIRIRCA.

Since the changes are procedural in
nature or necessitated by statutory
amendment, the Board of Directors of
the Federal Deposit [nsurance
Cemoration has determined. under
Secuon 302.6 of its rules and regulations
(12 CFR § 302.8), that noticz of. and
public participation in. this rulemaking
is unnecessary and that good cause
exists for the waiver of the 30-day
deferral of the effective date for the
changes.

Accordingly, 12 CFR 307.3 and 327.2
subparagraph %) are changed as
follows:

PANT 307—=VGLUNTARY
TECRAMINATION OF INSURANCE
STATUS

1. 12 CFR 307 .3 is revised to read:

§307.3 Steps to be taken and records to
be fumished the Corporation whare
deposits are assumed Dy another insured
banx.

(a) Whenever the deposit liabilities of
an insured bank are assumed by another
insured bank, whether by merger,
consolidation, or other statutory
assumptio:, or by contract. the
continuing bank sha.' give notice of the
assumption to the depositors of the bank
whose depusits are assumed within 30
days after the assumption takes effect.?
Such notice shail be (1) mailed tc each
depositor at the depositor's last iddress
of record as shown u:pon the bocks of
the bank. (2) published in not less than
two issues of a lucal newspaper of
general circulation, and (3) in form
substantially as follows:

Date)
Notice to Depositors:

Please be advised that the deposit
liabilities shown on the hooks of (Name of
Assumed Bank) (City or town)

(State) as of close of
Dusiness oo 19— have been
assumed by the undersigned bank. The
insured status of (Name of assumed bank)
will termunate at the time provided n section
8(q) of the Federai Deposit Insurance Act
The separate insurance of its deposits will
ther 2fore termunate at the end of six months
from the above date or. in the case of 3 ime
deposit the earliest matunty date after the
six-motith period.

You are advised that the undersigned bank
8 an insured bank and that your depcsits wall
coutinue 'o be nsured by the Federal Deposit
(nsurance Corporation in the manner a~d to
the extent provided n said Act
Name of Bank)

Adcdres.

There may be included in such notice
any additiona! information or advice the
Dank may deem desirable.

"The notce “squirement does not apply ‘o
Dhantom dank mergers as defined n ‘comote 2a
of Section X03.11(a K9




I/ Federal Register / Vol. 44. No. 80 / Tuesdav. Aoril 24. 1979 / Rules and Regulations
e e A A A

24045

NUCLEAR REGULATORY
COMMISSION

10 CFR Part 140

Correction

In FR Doc. 79-10853. appearing at
page 20632. in the 1ssue of Fnday. Apni
6. 1979, on page 20633 make the
following corrections

(1) In the first col ‘an in paragrapi: 15.
in the second line, cueract “Article (I to
read “Article II”

i2) In paragraph 17 in the first line.
correct “Appendix G to read
“Appendix H”

BLLNG CODE 150%-01-M

D S ——
UEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

10 CFR Part 205

A viristratvs Procedures and
Sanctions; 1979 interpretatior - of the
General Coursel

AGENCY: Cepartment of Ezergy.
AcTioN: Notice of [nterprstations.

SUMMARY: Attached is the Interpretation
issued by the Office of General Counsel
of the Department of Energy under 10

Appendix B identifies those Requests
for [nterpretation which have been
dism:ssed dunng the same period

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
rans Stubbs. Office of Ceneral
Couzizel, Department of Energy. 12th &
Pennsylvania Avenue NW . Room 1121,
Washington, D.C. 20461 (702) 633-8070.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMA NON: i
Interpretations issued pursuant to 10
CFR Part 208, Subpart F. are published
in the Federal Register in accerdance
with the editonal and classification
cniteria set forth in 42 FR 7923 (February
8. 1977), as modified in 42 FR 46270
(September 15. 1977).

These Interpretations depend for their
authority on the accuracy of the factual
statement used as a basis for the
Interpretation (10 CFR 205 84(a}(2)) and
may be rescinded or modified at any
time (§ 205.85(d)). Only the persons to
whom Interpretations are addressed and
other persons ugon whom
Interpreis ons are served ase entitled to
rely on them (§ 205.85(c)). An
Interpretati~n is modified by a
subsequer amendment to the
regulation:s) or ruling(s) 'nterpreted
thereby to the extent tha. the
Interpretation is inconsistent with the
amended regulationis) or ruling(s)
|§ 205.85(e)). The Interpretation=
published below are not subiect 1o
appeal.

lssued in Washington. D.C.. Apni 10. 1979.

CFR Part 205, Subpart F. during the Everard A Marsegiia. |1
?;;r;dMarch 1, 1979, through March 31, mmmu » 2na Auireps
Apoencix A—interpretanons
L) To Dasw Camegory “ea MO
L0 5= T Senciaw Cu C a S MaOnS . PNOR . A9

loterpretation “979-3
To Sinciair Oul Corporation 4
Reguiation [nterpreted: 10 CFR 210.62(a)
Code: GCW—Pl—Normal business practices
racts

The Sinclair Oil Corporation. a smalil and
ndependent efiner subiect to 10 CFR Part
212, Subpart E. markets petroieum products
through (ts subs fiary. Sinclarr Marketing,
inc. Sinclairt Since Mav 1973, Sinclair s
standard contracts with joDbers and dealers
for the sale of motor gasotine have requirec
pavment in fuil within 30 davs. Pavment in
full withun 10 gays nas entitied a purchaser !0
a 1 percent Jiscount on the purchase prmce
Sit el nas considered an account
ulstanding ‘or more than 30 aavs to be n
defauit ana subect o suit. in that instance
collection costs wouid be assigna®™ « o ‘he

account. At the present fime. Sincic * desires
to modify its standard coatracts for h= saie
of motor gasoline to require a finance charge
of one and one-half (1%) percent monthiy on
the balance of ail accounts not paid within %0
davs. No other cred:t terms are 10 be
changed.

Issue

Do«s Sinciair s proposal 'o assess a finance
charge on all deninquent accounts conshtute
the imposition of a3 more stringent credit term
than the crecit '2rms n effect on Mav 15.

1973, within the meaning of 10 CFR 210.821a?

Inte~oretat:oh

Far 'he ~eascns se! forth beiow 'he
Department of Energv |DOE] nas determined
that Sunciair s nclusion of 4 |~ sercent
monthiv finance charge on ail accounts not
paia witun J) davs 'n :ts standard contrac's

for the sale of motor gasoline would
zonsttute the :mposition of a more stringent
credit ‘erm than the credit terms n effect on
May 151973, n viciation ¢f § 210 8214)

The Generai Allocation a:.4 Price Rules. set
forth at 10 CFR Part 210 ang adopted on
lanuary 14. 1974. 39 FR 1924  |anuary 15,
1974). were intended to set forth the
provisions applicatie to both the Mandatory
Petroieum Allocation Reguiaucns (10 CFR
Part 211) and 'he Mandatory Petroleum Price
Reguianons (10 CFR Part 212) The ailocation
and price regulahons were adopted ‘o
impiement the statutory mandate of Section
4ia) of the Emergency Petroieum Allocation
Act of 1973 (EPAA). as amended. Pub. L No
93-157 ‘November 27, 1973).'

Section 210.82{a! regulates crecit te™™s as a
funcron of price in recognition of the varying
roies that credit and other conditions of sale
piay in the flow of produc: *Section 210.62{a)
provides (n relevant part

“Suppiiers will deal with surchasers of an

sfiocated product sccora:isg 'o normal
Dusiness practices in ei'vcr durng the base
period specified in Part 211 [or that ailocated
product and no suppiier may modify any
normal business practice so as (o resull in 'he
circumvention of any provision of this
chapter . Credit terms other than those
associated with seasonal credit programs are
included as & par* of the May 15. 1973 pnce
charged 1o a class of purchaser under Part
212 of this Chapeer. N Fing in this paragraph
shall be cons rued ! require suppliers ‘o seil
to purchasers who do not arrange proper
credit or payment for allocated products. as
customaniy associated with that ciass of
purchaser . . . on May 15.1973 . . . .
However. no supplier may require or impose
more stringent credit terms or payment
scheduies on purchasers than those in effect
for that class of purchaser . on May 15.
1973. e

According 10 the facts presented by
Sinclair. neither at the present time nor on

"ISUSC 731 e seq (1978)

!Since the decision by the Temporary Emergency
Court of Appeals in Marather Oi/ Co v. FEA. 547
F 2d 1140 (TECA 1978). there can be no doubt
concerming the suthorty of the Federai Energy
Aamunistration (FEA) and its successor. the DCE. 10
reguiate Teait terms d to the mandatory
petroleus. - ce reguiations. In add:tion. the DO
hAs “*s0ive | sues sumular to the one presented by
Snciair o rung whether changes n crecit lerms
are permissidie ;n view of the privisions of
§ 2108214} See Exxon Company U5.4. 2 DOE
990,150 'October 28 1978} Crvsto: Ovf Co. 1 FEA
920.161 (October 8. 1973). In Ov/ Tronsit Corp.
Interuretanon (977-35, 42 FR 34269 Octover 3.
197 the DOE found tha' requinng surchasers of
@otor gasoline ' incur ‘or the first ime ‘&
40 1onail cost af 00taImIng ‘erters of crea.:
uarsnteeing payment 0o Ol Transit wowid have ‘he
etfect of ‘moosing 3 more stmngen! credit ‘erm ‘han
‘he crea:t lerms in effect on May 15 1972 n
vioiation of § 21082141 Howevs, 'he DOE has not
PEVIOUSIV LONMARreC 4 Case 1uch is ‘he Dresent
Ine where the DMpPOsSed “N4ange 1 Credit erms
would aCDIv TV 31ler the 2 rThase DMce 'C Jue ‘n
fail




