File ty,
Commonwealth Edison Compa

ONE FIRST NATIONAL PLAZA & CHICAGO, ILLINOIS

. id

nddrass Reply to

FOSY OFFICFEF BOX 7467 & CHICAGO, LLINODOIS 40890

Al

i
(W

March 6, 1972 V\iﬁ?

Mr. Jerome Saltzman, Chief
Indemnity and Export Control Branch

Division of State and Licensee Relations
U, S« tomic Energy Commission
Washingten, D, C. 20545

Dear Mr., Saltzman:

Enclosed is an executed cupy of Amendment No, 16

to Indemnity Agreement Yo, B-1lO,

Very truly your:j

R. D. Poole
Insurance Administrator

8010100 L 28 %




UNITED STATES
ATOMIC ENERGY COMMISSION

WASHINGTON, D C. 20545

AMENDMENT NO, 16 TO INDEMNITY AGREEMENT NO. B-10 i

Effective March 1, 1972, Indemnity Agreement No. B-10, between Commonwealth
Edison Company and the Atomic Energy Commission, dated December 14, 1961,
as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

Article II, Paragraph 8(a) is amended by deleting the amcunt
"$63,550,000" wherever it appears and substituting therefor
the amount "$73,625,000."

—————— e

Article II, Paragraph 8(b) is amended by deleting the amount
"$18,450,000" wherever it appears and substituting therefor
the amount "$21,375,000."

Article II, Paragraph 8(c) is amended by deleting the amount
"$82,000,000" wherever it appears and substituting therefor
the amount "$95,000,000."

Article III, Paragraph 4(b)(2) is amended by deleting the
amount "“$82,000,000" and substituting therefor the amount
''$95,000,000."

Item 2a. of the Attachment to the indemnity agreement is delzted
in its entirety and the following substituted therefor:

Item 2 - Amount of financial protection

a. $60,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., September 28, 1959, to
12:00 midnight, December 31, 1965, inclusive)
$74,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., January 1, 1966, to
12:00 midnight, January 31, 1969, inclusive)
$82,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., February 1, 1969, to
12:00 midnight, February 29, 1972, inclusive)
$95,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., March 1, 1972)

FOR THE UNITED STATES ATOMIC ENERGY COMMISSION

__JW‘%

Jerome Saltzman,
Indemnity and ExpoTrt Cont:rol Branch
Division of State and Licensee Relations

Accepted Mareh 2 , 1972
By \LE (\t‘ %C'w e
COMMONWEALTH, EDISON COMPANY ‘6 e
Vice-President



L8 T ¥ ?

. ey Y ’f___ et o
rroM: Commonweal th Edison Company DATE OF DOCUMENT DATE RECEIVED NO. -
Chicago, Illinols 60690 March 6, 1972 Maxch 9, 1972 \ >
LTR. MIMO; REPORT; OTHER:
R x
g5 — +—De Poole SHiGa cc: oTHER;
1
Sal tzman [ ACTION NECESSARY (] [concurnence 0 DATE ANSWERED:
E | NO AcTion NecessARY [] | comment . BY: ]
CLASSIF. POST OFFICE FILE CODE; =
U _ REG. NO; m‘r)’, =249 ,’
ESCRIPTION: (Must be Unclassified) REYER ™S DAT:M rm RECEIVED BY DA".J
{
Saltzman in g
Ltr, trans: WITys e 4
|
Losunes, (l c’. t”'d.)
Amenduent No. 16 tn IA No. B~10 L i |
|
B
4
L Y RLNAN L T
ACRREVALGED |
AUXS; Wi
istribution: 3-File cys. [
3-PDR cys, WY Ahe Tl ey
1-0G¢ RRT acmidpt 3 ;
1-Leith bJQ |

ft U S. Government Printing Office: 1968 — 296 ~ 614

U.s. Afohi?tn“zi?ﬁc’ﬁiﬁxsixéTﬁmeﬁoTﬁﬁb' N —

FORM »om naw

-

&

ey
ERrTay

bt o9

0 4004

[y

TR



