-

.
“ITANDARD FGRm 30, JULY 178

At

-

S Wedveits admsastianom AMENDMENT OF SOLICITATION/MODIFICATIC't OF CONTRACT 1
T A NOmENT MOV ICATON NG T EIECIVE OATE |3 REGUSITION PURCWASE BEQUEST NO % PROIECT NO ' 1] appinahie:
~ Four (4) 2/1/80 RES-77-145 dated 5/7/80

3 D o CODE  ADWSTERED &Y (1) sther than biack 3 CuDE |

U. S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Division of Contracts
Washington, DC 20555

——
7 CONTRACTOR CODE | FACILITY CODE |

J

| NAME AND ADDRESS

r

| Southwest Research Institute

A Sureer. oy,

-

| 6220 Culebra Road
o P P. 0. Box 28510
aa San Antonio, TX 78284

£ _l

AmENDMENT OF
D SOUCITATION NO

{ See block 9)

NRC-04-77-145

DaTED

MODIFCATION OF
[ conreact onoer no

9/12/ 77 _ (See bluct 117

DATED

(9 THIS BLOCK APPLIES ONLY TO AMENDMENTS OF SOLCITATIONS
D e above numbered soliciahion & amended o4 st fomh . block 12
Oferon mutt scanowiedge ecapl of thi amenamant prar 1o he how and sole pecfied . the ol claten. 3 o

(01 By ngring 8nd reNINING o copas 8] Bis amendment, (B By ochmow!
which necludes @ relare co to e soliciaton ond amendment aumbers FAIL
DATE SPECIMED MAY RESULT iN REJECTION OF YOUR OFFER

sdging recapt 8! IR amendment on each
URE OF YOUR ACKNOWIEDGEMENT TO

W, by wrtue of this amendment you deve to change on ofter alr
d~ant gnd o rete ved proor o Me opening Nour ond dote pec fed

The hour and dote wecled tor recept of Ofeny D + eetended D s net exiended

amenced, by one of the ‘glowing methods

copy o the ofer swbmited. o (¢) By reparate (ef e o telegrz ™
8¢ RECEIVED AT THE ISSUING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE HOUR AND
sody swhbmmed, swch change may be made by ‘elegram

@ @ner, 90s 008 seh R agiam o aner moaes (elerence to the solichation and this gmer

10 ACCOUNTING AND APPROPRIATION DATA (I required)

B&R No. 60311105
___B&R No. 60191105

(Total Increase)
$275,500.00

FIN No. B7019($30,000.00)
FIN No. B5605(5245,500.00)

1 TS ROCK aPPES DMLY TO mMODIFICATIONS OF CONTRACTS/ ORDERS
o) D N Chonge Order o 1aved pursveant to
e Changes wi for n bock 12 are made i the cbove numbered comraa orser

oot order s mod fied 1o reflect e sdmnatiative AGNges 1uch O CRangel n paying oo oppropration dete. ete | wt farth . block 12

Y D The obove Aumbeied
the mutual agreement of both parties

it Ii ‘[ ™t Supplemental Agresment iy antered Mo puriuant %o avthorty of

* modifes tha obove numbered contract o set lomn a block 12

12 OESCRPTION DF AMENDMENT MODE ZATION

& Under Article 11, Period of Performance, the Period of Performance 15§
exterded from “January 31, 1980" thru "July 31, 1981."

“he purpose of this contract extension is to allow completion of the
statement of work described in Article I of the Cont-act Nc. NRC-04-77-145,
as amended on 9/12/78. Azcomplishment of this objective requires the
completion of the following tasks according to the attached schedule.

(1) Improve the signal-tn-noise ratio of the current SAFT UT
examination system. This will be accomplished by improving
ultrasonic search units and by obtaining an improved display
method; and, if necessary, improvements will be madc to
processing algorithms and the SAFT UT scan mechanism.

POOR ORIGHIAL

Eacopt or promeed hermn 3l ermy ond conditons of the Jocument relerenced n Blach 8 o1 hersmtore chonged remewn unchongee and i il force 9nd oFact

'
. CONTRACTOR/OFFERCR 1§ NQT REQUIRED

O SIGN THIS DOCUMENT m COMTRACTOR/ OFFEROR 1S “QU'!!DVO SIGN TWIS DOCUMENT AND ”TUNA.___CO’I!S 10 SSUING OFICE

- p—

Ve -{a CcOnN (OFFEROR 17 (1) £S5 OF amt | J
..__\_._...-\-F\X} -.:\.2 b .~ .,,\g;) .&;ﬂ% ¥ K&C&W.‘
{ (Sgronre of peron oumonied '8 LA TS gnature of chwqw _
15 NAME AND TITLE OF SIGNER ¢ Type or SIGNED - OFVFICER 7 Type or primit ) 19 CATE $IGNSD
John F. Sprencel.' 'nu".' : m’- QA Sys. kg " ;M; ]a m“;m’:: t( i <
& Engrg. Div. 8/20/80 BEEGRR LS Ty S éi, 9-
G5 SOVIRHMLNT PR NTING OFRICE 19N o= ta -4

30-101

8069190718



(2)

(3)

(&)

(5)

ch

(7)

VOt Tinatigir wO. % 10
Contract No. NRC-04-77-145
Page 2 of 3

Subject the improved SAFT UT systez to a test matrix to conclusively
demonszrate its perforzance for characterizing flaws contained in struc-
tures represanting nuclear power reactor pressure vessels and cocponents.
In these tests, SAFT UT results will be comparzd to the results of conven-
tional ultrasonic exazinations to deterzine the relative perforzance of

the two methods.

Following the laboratory test descrided in (2) above, the improvad SAFT
UT system will undergo a series of field tests conducted at comzercial
nuclear power reactors in coordination with scheduled exazinations con-
ducted by SwRI personnel. SAFT UT results will be compared and evaluated
against results obtained from conventional UT.

A series of laboratory tests will be conducted to continue evaluation and
validation of SAFT UT. In these tests, SAFT UT will be compared with
conventional UT on large-scale cowponents containing real flaws that are
subsequently characterized by destructive examination,

Experience accrued through the preceding activities will be used in forau-
lating calibration and operational procedures. These guidelines will be
continually updated as experience is gained.

Topical reports will be prepared for each of the activities listed.

These reports will be useful for a Code case presentation. The Institute
will also cooperate with ASME to establish the acceptance of SAFT UT iato
the Code fcr flaw characterization during inservice inspection.

Throughout the prograz, SwRI will preseant topical reports and presanta-
tioas at various NDE conferences. These activities are intended to ecu-
cate industry and regulatory persons as to the capabilities anc advan<
tages of SAFT UT in order to promote widespread acceptance of the szethod,

Throughouc the progras, §wRI and the University of Michigan will hold
periodic meetings for cocrdinacing the SAFT UT activities of the two
groups. The purpcse of these meetings is to provide pro=pt transier of
experimental resul’s and coordinating planning sessions 0 maxinize the
useful results obtained from the two programs. Tentative plans call for
meetints at 6-week intervals tc be held «t the two facilities on an
altern ting schedule. Representatives from the NRC will participate in
these eetings to whatever extent tney desire.



tiodification No. 4 to
Contract No. NRC-04-77-145
Page 3 of 3

Under Article IIl, Consideration, A., Estimated Cost and Fixed F» , make
the following changes:

Paragraph 1 - Delete “$260,924.00" and substitute in lieu
thereof "$518,424.00."

Paragraph 2 - Delete "$18,265.00" and substitute in lieu thereof
“$36,265.00."

Paragraph 3 - Delete "$279,189.00" and substitute in lieu thereof
“$554,689.00."

The contract amount is hereby increased by $275,500.00 from "$279,189.20"
to "$554,689.00."

The total estimated amount for this additiona’ year of effort is
3297,354.00. It is estimated that the amount currently allotted by

this modification ($275,500.00) will cover performance thru December 31,
1980.




PROGRAM_SCHEDULE

MONTHS
0 3
]
Improve Signal-to-Noise Ratio
2

-

------------------------——

Compare SAFT-UT to
Conventional UT (Laboratory]

-

Planning and Coordinating %ectings Between SwR1 and thq University of Michigan

Solid lines den)ite intense activity.
Dashed 1ines deote intermittent activities,

Activities are numbered accor lina to task statements.

|

13
Compare SAFT-UT to Conventig

a

nal UT {Field)

SAFT-UT on Large-Scale Com
Later Characterize Destructi

- -

inent {Laboratory)
vely :

-

- -




