
n o ..c :. ., c. n i c . ,, . . . . u i
- - - -. - . . . . , ~

g g g -,
i . , s i ..r . . u x ., : . .. ,. a 2 onmi o.g 3 .am .,s.:..o .1: a sr No . ,,3,t Cr ,.2 ,if.,n.,.,u,,g '"'erTwo (2)

IM I 4 'l=0 RFPA l'o. RES-79-210

U.S. fluclear Regulatory Commi[ss' ion
.

. nsso coin s >: ~.as:veo s, ut .,8,, ,w. a . n .cout |
Division of Contracts *

Washington, DC 20555
1..

- . - -

1. Co cs. tics CODL | | TACILITY LODE | 8.. -

Nas ( .s0 AC:t!S5 autN*,wfN7 C,

C 500Ca:AI.CN NQ
f flational Academy of Public Administration~l '

C ATE D ($., Wi 9)
r s. . . ,,. ,. .. Foundation -

a g y,|,"''- 1225 Connecticut Avenue, fl W. g|$',ff'f,', No. flRC-04-79-210
Ca,i Washington, DC 20036.

(_ _j 8/14/79cano f ,,,3,,,, ,,,.

9. Tri i.C * a Ai,Ut $ c Niv TO A-isovi%,5 c, Sci 6s.I Afs;.*.5
.

-

_ o,......~.....~....,.....,,,.-.,....,.....,......,c,...a.......~,e.
- |

. . . .. . .. . . .. a a. ,
c.....a...u.....,..r.s..,.....,... e

.
,,s......,c..m.,................a....,....,.,, . . . . . . . , . .

m. , . . , , . a ..s . ,.,, , . y . . . , ~ . . . e-. m , . u . ...w.., .. . . . . . e ,s . . . . a.. . ., . . . o. . . n .. . . . . . . . m .. a. .. m i , . . , . ... . .. , . . . . c . .. . -
, a . . . ......... .. . ..:...<. .a .. a,... . .e . , . ,nia c v e. : , m.e c.m s: m n e r:tr.u. ,i r,.i u s uc c.nce n,cuo .e c. , , 3,

.

c An .,.a.:o -1 a3. , m meex 4 c, ,cu< cn n i,. i , . ,.. g ., .. . . . ~. . , ~ <. . . . . . o , . . .. . r. . .... c . .a . a . . a r . . ., . . , s. -. e. i , .. . . .. ..

..r.....,...<as....,,.......o,...............a..u,....a,t....,c,..a....:...a.........o,,.. ..,,.a,....,...r..,. t.

w ,ea.~u.. s> m ..c.ou casa a;,,r....o },.

B&R fio. 60-19-11-01 ' Fill No. B6792 Increase $13,623.04 i
-. -

10 .*00 8. Cat:0N5 Cf CcND'..G 5 /C ,.3HS '
ti t. Tv5 t,0*:.; s 7U!S CN.Y

m O r'. c . 2. e . . .. ... . ..... . i'

rs.cw ,. ",. v.a u.. a......o....a s .-.~ue -

'

m g] is.
.s... .e..a .~.m,f..<.... a ra .... ,.u.. a, ...... ..%.;..:...s... .~..;...,.,s . % . m .or.....<r..co e

;. v.a n.c1ause no. 4 entitled " Limitation of Colt"_of the
| qm [ 1. . s.n .s ...c er..-...i.....ai,...n....,,....s...,.,

. | f

w r..... c..s...s. a u...s......rcs..e.a u. Generel Provisions.
h L s~.~.G & %~.Giq:,~iGTT'cn ~

..,

?
a

Whereas, Coni.ract No. NRC-04-79-209 was entered into on August 14, 1979, with an expiration ddate of December 1,1979.

Whereas, this contract was modified on December 1,1979, to exter"f the expiration date to [December 31, 1979, and to revise th.e report requ.irements due to a significant
increase in the amount of information to be included in the required reports. "

-

Whereas, the Contractor notified the Contracting Officer (CO) by letter dated December *

.

10, 1979, that an increase in contract amount would be required due to ancther
significant increase in the magnitude of the required report and due to Government
caused delays resulting from the late provision of the NRC/Tf11 Special InquiryGroup draf t evaluation.

Whereas, the NRC was to provide the flRC/TMI Special Inquiry Group dra f t evaluation to the
Contractor no later than October 15, 1979. The NRC did not provide-the afore-
mentioned draf t until November 2,1979. -

. .

,

.. .

,... ..... .a .. ,,.....,,i..,,,,,, .7. .,,.. ........a.,e. .i. .... s... .,a..... ,,, ~ v.,,.. ..,,o
g 77 <r. ce e;3... n e:

,

.t /
g c., m. . ,, ., ,, u.m ,, . e,, .,,, m.,.,1.,. 3

c, a ua

,.y.5 . .~ ,.,,,,g,., c:,.., ,o ,s 7 . c.. a

e. e.we. .:, :..w / . ir e.
i . s -,

wc Goc. ,f .

,, A sV*y s:.). f,,,,e / .

& =.s|.w.k
/ / - -

/

,p/;-1,(./ e4[b^.7;^.G.^Z7.5's'f~i;.7) .7,a.w)-- -i,'~s Mr ,; ,.. 3$m c-:(- ;--f:.Ti?.;;Q-:7; " ,T d i".ase: ~

',
,s . . . . . , . . . . - u. ~ .

L 0 i o: '
,,

.j) M. y4 i/, y ,)i h y . a 'f & Mary Jo fla ttia WY 1.i p~q)
::.nc, ()

. . . . . . - . .n " . " -

8005230105
t _ _



__

.

- - _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ - _ _ _ - _ _ _ _ _ _ ,

'

./ .. .

y
'.x

,
,

-2-

Whereas, the contract has expired and the Contractor's fina'l report has been
accepted by the fiRC Project Officer.

Whereas, the Contractor by letter dated !! arch 26, 1980, has submitted a breakdown
of actual costs incurred in performance of this contract and such
breakdoun includes overrun costs in the amount of $14,440.52. This
overrun amount was comprised of other direct costs, general administrative
expenses, and fee. The C0 determined the requested amount to be excessive
as it included additional fee. .On April 11, 1980, the Contractor agreed
to reduce the amount requested to $13,623.04 which represents actual overrun
costs exclusive of fee. ' '

'

..

flow therefore, the following changes are hereby made:

1. Regarding the face page of the contract block 21, delete the amount
"$89,395.00" and substitute in lieu thereof of the amount "$103,018.04."

2. Regarding Part II - The Schedule, Subsection E.2, Estimated Cost, Fixed Fee
and Obligation the following changes are made:

a. Paragraph a, lines 2 and 3, delete the amounts "89,395.00" and "$84,335.00"
respectively and substitute in lieu thereof the amounts "$103,018.04" and
"$97,958.04." .

b. Paragraph c, line 2 delete the amount "$89,395.00" and substitute in
lieu thereof the amaunt "$103,013.04."

3. Under Subsection H.1 - Period of Performance, line 3, delete the date " December
31,1931," as previously changed by modification no.1, and substitute in lieu
thereof the date " April 24, 1980."

:

.

I
u.

d

a

!
1


