TSRt as Fuim 30, JULY 15606

GINEbAL SURVICES Armmmmou] AM..ND?V\ENI OF SOULITA]lON/MODlHCA“O‘ OF CONH-\A‘.Y

1

& |

2

U. S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Division of Contracts
Washington, DC 20555

NAME AND ADDRESS

r

i Battelle Columbus Laboratories
counm. wawe. 505 King Avenue
ai’®  Columbus, OH 43201

L-

7 CONTRACTOR CODE | ] FACILITY COUE |

-

N

B — |

DATED

MODIFICATION OF
[X] contmactorpEx

_l/__l_/.zs__- o (See blk 11)

AMENDMENT OF
D SOUCITATION NO

. fo PROC REG (41 CPE; 1218 10) |
1 AMENDMENT/ MODFICATION NO 2 EFFECTIVE DATE 3 REQUISITION /PURCHA ¢ REQUEST NO & PROJICY WO (If appirviabie)
6 4/16/79 RES-76-293-03
S ISSUED Y CODE & ADMINISTERED BY (1S other than bloik 3) CODE l

DATED o (See block

wo NRC-04-76-293-03

9)

9. THIS BLOCK APPLIES ONLY TO AMENDMENTS OF SOUICITATIONS

or lemer, provided such wlegrom or lemer mokes

V6 ACCOUNTING AND AFROPRIATION DATA (1] requimed)
B&R NO. 60-19-10-05 FIN NO. B5609

11 THIS KOCK APRIES OMLY 1O MODIHCATIONS OF CONTRACTS/ORDERS
{e! D This Change Ocder s 1sved purse M %o ————

(0] By sgning 0ad rerurming__copes of this amendment, (b) By ocknowisdging recerpt of this cmer ©
which includer o reference to the soliciotion ond omendmen! numbers. FARURE OF YOUR ACKNOWLED. ~ MENT TO 8%
DATE SPECIFIED MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF YOUR OFFER. I, by virtue of this amendment you desire o .

relerence to the solicitotion ond this omendment, ond u rece: wed prior to he opening hour ond dote -pnv'»od

D The chove numbe-ed 10l Ac’ on is amended ot set forth s block 12, The hour and do wpec fied for recept of OﬁnnD n evtended D is not extended

Ofeion must ocknowledge receipt of this omendment prior to the hour and date specifed i the solictotion, or oy omended, By one of the follow.ng methads
~ent on eorh copy of the cfer swbmated, or (¢) By seporote leher
RECEIVED AT THE ISSUING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE HOUR AND |

o telegrom

- an ofier cirecdy submimed, such chonge moy be mode by telegrow

$24,199.98

The Changes w! forth in block 12 ore mode Yo the cbove numbered comract/order
b D The obove nurbered coiact /order s mod Ned 1o 1efiect the odminatrat.ve (honn
Q) [_E s Suppl ol Ag i entered mic pursvent to authority of T T

® modifies he obove aumbered contiact o set forth in block 12
12 DES. RFTION OF AMENDWENT/ MODIICATION

additional wurk is added:

1979."

following revisions are effected:

A. In Appendix A, as described in Paragraph 1,

“The Contractor shall provide during FY
of two representatives on the Pipe frack Study Group. These
services shall be in accordance with the understandings sec
forth in the Contractor's letter, Eiber/Serpan, dated March 7,

s.

Scope of Work,

.F‘;***Q-%:"
. 1 N
: éiw;mw«éd-

the following

'79 the services

B. In Paragraph 3, Estimates of Cost, Fixed Fee, Obligations of Funds, the

18 NAME AND TITLE OF

(1)

(2)

CONTRACIOR/OFFER
[0 16 scn s Dby (O FEQUIRED  [] cONTRACTOR/OFITROR 1S REQUIRED TO I

4 NWJ conTR l_c‘)l_:o-u;&v iy ' . 7

Ll oo ol A ot el WP | -
ﬁqw.d outhor. l-d'tt’\]

® (T e or primt) ]vo DATE SIGNED 18 NAME OF CONT

FRAHK L L
GONTRACTING OFFICER

In Subparagraph A, Estimate of Cost, delete the amount

“$360,751.00" and insert the amount "$383,193.72" in
lieu thereof; 7907100006

In Subparagraph B, Fixed Fee, delete the amount "$28,249.00"
and insert the amount "$30,006.26" in lieu thereof;

MAY 1 01979 Fellogg Ve

NG OFHICER [ Type or print) .
Morton MAY

e opt --roodndhrrn d e -mmdeond'm of the document referenced | in black L3 °""""°‘°‘""° ged, mman wnchanged ond in bl force ord ety 7 l (\‘ i
s ¥t ond condom of e o hanged o 42 . UL
NT AND RETURN 4 _COPIES TO 1BSUING OFFICE

.

1 DATE SIGNED

23 1978

——

Jg-101

U4 GLeinwmiNT PRINTIAL CTRICE

e

LRI R



B

e e e e

Medification No. 6
Supplemental Agreenent to
Contract No. NRC-04-76-293-03
Page 2 of 2

(3) In Subparagraph C, Obligation of Funds, delete the
amount “$389,000.00" and insert the amount "$413,199.98"
in lieu thereof.




