
, . . , <m .m o e s m .. m n u,
AMENDMENT OF SOLICITAllON/MODlHCAllON OF COh'if.ACT 1 2c.i o u u.. a 5 A o.N 5u AT.ON

..o P x nc m Cn, i-ie ici
.

I. Auf NDetNT/MOOiFICATION NO 2 IFFECTivt D Af t 3 t *Cvi$tisON / Put CM A * REQUEST NO 4 PRO >t CT #40 ,l/ aff a.wNt /

6 4/16/79 RES-76-293-03-

.

5 iS5siD n r.ooE e Ao-i~:3n nD er of .a.,, ,A 6a 4 3, com |

U. S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Division of Contracts

- Washington, DC 20555

1 CONTE ACTOR CO[JE [ Allt.11Y LOGE [ 9

N AMl AND ADDEI55 AwENOME NT OP

0 SOL c'T ATioNNO

F- 7
cAno - (5<< a' * 9>Battelle Columbus Laboratories

r si.~,. a.rr.

50a. King Avenue
.

Sco"D,,,CATcNo,
MO NRC-04-76-293-03....,,.,w,.

"^c"o'o'' "OTj,f"' , Col umbus', OH 43201

L _1 7/ /76oAuD " = > > > >

9. TH:5 STOCK APPil($ ONLY TO Awf NDMINTS OF SOL 8 CIT ATION5

N .ke a.ml. ed '< ." .a . amea..id .. ..dh .a blod 12. T h. h . . d d .p.o d for .es e 4p, .' 04. , e .s**ad.d. O . ' d.d.r

O a.. ... .u a ia.. ... . ,. ., ,,,.. . .a - . ,. .. . +. so .a o s o.. . .r.s .a r. i44 a. . -o.d. 6, oa. . ,*. .et.- .a. ~~ a. -

.,4..~. . ., .. ., ,s . . . . .a m . , oa . % ,., .. . . . . , , s. . c . . . -.a..a.,..,,.,,s......s........i3i,......i......i.....
m e , v, a. .

P AILUtf OF YOUR ACKNovettA'uf NT TO BE Rf CEIVED AT THE ISSU'N3 077tCE PR OR TO THE HOUR AND.oe . .e .. e ,k. ..I.. .e ..a .ad .me ad e e a, a. a+e..f= h.a in.

D ATE SPECaflE D M AY tt SULT IN af f tCTION OF Yout OrrfI If, b , .. .. .I th.. . m ad m e as , d. .... . .- - ePe 2.odr..b*.ae d. ..a d a ,. a..y b. -. de b , .. f. g'. *

.. i. ... .. .s a ..a ..... t. ... a........ .. . . i.e . . ,s.. . ~ a. .a ........a . . ... . , ... . o.... .er..
.

I C . A C C OL NhNG A ND AU R P S. A fiON DATA (l/ rr,, s. red)

B&R NO. 60-19-10-05 FIN NO. B5609 $24,199.98

I I . TH5 B.OCK APPL!E5 ONLY 10 MOD,F.CATONS OF CON'1 LACT 5/Orcit5

i. i o .. C . . e . .. . ...a -. _ ,. . _ g, gpn 3gn W ,= 3

m a ~ n .. ~ ...... ,......-a ... .. ....-.. p . g .s y; ey.. .@L
~ ~ . . _ - ,2 .. - . . . - . ~ .m .a,..e,. b K .; ot ..< .w

Mp,y.4..g.a,.L
n, [g . 5....-.a., A......a...a...a.a,....a......., __

, -a < . . . . _. . - -s. , a . _,. .- .. . .- . a e .a , 2 .

I2. DE5sE 1 TION OF AM E NDu t NT / woDi' ICAT ON

A. In Appendix A, as described in Paragraph 1, Scope of Work, the following
additional wcrk is added:

"The Contractor shall provide during FY '79 the services
of two representatives on the Pipe crack Study Group. These
services shall be in accordance with the understandings sec
forth in the Contractor's letter, Eiber/Serpan, dated March 7,
1979."

8. In Paragraph 3, Estimates of Cost, Fixed Fee, Obl_i_cma tions of Fun _d_s , the
following revisions are effected:

(1) In Subparagraph A, Estimate of Cost, delete the amount
"$360,751.00" and insert the amount "$383,193.72" in
lieu thereof; 7007100004

(2) In Subparagraph B, Fixed Fee, delete the amount "$28,249.00"
and insert the amount "$30,006.26" in lieu thereof;

.-_ n./7. . . . ,, . . .. .~ . .ma . . . . . . ,. .. , a . ,, ,_ , . a m ,_ . . a . ph .>i.......w..a..,......a.a...a..,.. ""-Jo
- AND n ~-- 4 a m 5 TO m ~o c* m0 |O 5" " ' '' . '5 | " 'f ', ,'' " ' " " (i) CON, AoO 'c=Oa is "OU=' TO r -5cc

N T

ry) -

h //g| '

m 5, .i. ~ , - , CO~n ,0. m,n OR ,, c.
,

'

f
<5_..., . . _ - - _ ,

_-- ,/n .

.m.. _ . . . . _ . . . ,

> F w A 4 m a 0, w .,, ,1 3 ,. 7,,,,, i. cAu m.N,0 ,,N., C,,<cs ,. ~o O. . ,a . , , ,7, - , , , .o n e.u 5m

FPRIK J. LUKZ
GONTRACTING OFFirER

9/AY 101979 Kellogg v. Morton t'AY '' 3 E79
, , , w......,... .. w .a. ....c-.-

3o.,0,



IMdification fio. 6
'

Supplemental Agreen.ent to-.

.. Contract lio. I4RC-04-76-293-03
-

Page 2 of 2

.

(3) In Subparagraph C, Ob_ligationarid 'inseF_of Funds _, delete theamount "$389,000.00" t the ai50unt "$413,199.98"
~ ~

in lieu thereof.

. -
-3., 0U3IJ


