Glueckert, Dave (LS Jensen)

From: Harry Seaman [hseaman@seamannuclear.comj
Sent: Friday, May 31, 2013 1:17 PM

To: Glueckert, Dave (LS Jensen); SNC

Subject: Disposal

Dave,

Confirming our phone call, the disposal cost for your gauge is $895.

Best regards,
Harry

Harry Seaman, Vice President
Seaman Nuclear Corporation
7315 5, First St.

Oak creek, WI 53154

Tel: 414-762-5100

Fax: 414-762-5106

hseaman@seamannuclear . com

www . seamannuclear, com
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I 0 Blahnik Construction 7 S. Jensen Construction & Paving

"Request.For Check
0 Helena Sand & Gravel, Inc. O Nupac

Payable To SE_C{ JUATC VAN N U\A-QO\" CO\Y Qo ‘hcm Amount gﬂ 5‘19

Address 13\5’ SM\/\. F\,{“i{ g’k‘\‘ﬂd“ r pate_5-31-{3
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Reason for check MM&MQV' é@u%
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N 1o/ Y40 J Yes 0 No
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Vendors: 116002 - 116002

All Transactions

AP Vendor Drilldown

Months: 05/13 - 09/13 Include Unapproved Invoices? N
Sort by Reference

Vendor
Phone

Address

1 16002| Seaman Nuclear Corp
414-762-5100

73158 1st St
Qak Creek, WI 53154-20985

Posted Invoices

Invoice Due
Mth Ref Trans Date Description Date Gross Payabie  Discount Net
o 71 053113 Disposal of old C-200 Nuclear  06/01/13 89500 0.00 0.00 0.00
Line Description Line Gross Type Co# Job Receiver #
Disposal of old C-200 Nucie 895.00 1 Job 122 50400 .3
Gross Net Paid Pald CM Clear
Seq Amount Discount Amount Status Pay Type Date Bank/CMRef Mth Date
1 89500 000 89500 Paud Exp Rpts/Chk Request 06:05/13 9/4032750 06/13 06/29/13
JCCo: 122 L S Jensen Construction
Job: 50400 3 LSJ Missoula Misc. Jobs
Phase: 50170 Construction Miscellaneous
Cost Type: 40 Supplies
Material:
GLCo: 122 ..S. Jensen Construction
GL Acct: 04400,000,50400 Supplies
Units: 0000 UM: LS
Unit Cost: 000000
Tax Code:
Tax Amt; 0.00
Gross Amt:  885.00
Misc. Amt: 0.00 Included: Y

PUELIC
g/!in’nl‘f"'"'ﬂ Release

Normal Release

NCN-“UE‘L!C
él ’*7, z;e-:. z_;"trw've—Security Related
D L.J‘l.:m::cl-_-u:-e internal
Reviewer: !

122 L § Jensen Construction
Date Format - MM/DD/YY

09/27/13 10:50.28 AM
APVendorLookupMT mpt

Page 1




Seaman Nuclear Corporation

7315 South First Street Oak Creek, WI 53154 USA
info@seamannuclear.com, Tel 414-762-5100 Fax 414-762-5106

Leak Test Certificate

January 31, 2013

A leak test has been performed on meter, serial number L122, a model C-200,
containing the radionuclide Ra 226.

Owned By: Blahnik Construction

759 Highway 93, North
Hamilton, MT 59840

Date Sample Collected: 122113

Coltected By: DMG
Date Sample Analyzed: 13113
Analyzed By: T. Lindemann

Most regulatory agencies consider a source to be leaking if a leak test reveals the
presence of more than 0.005 microcurie of removable contamination.

Analysis found contamination of less than 0.005 microcurie.

Analysis authorized by Wisconsin license 079-1257-01.
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Cook, Jackie

i — e —
From: Bowser, Jerry (Helena Sand & Gravel) [jbowser@oldcastiematerials.com]
Sent: Friday, September 27, 2013 1:32 PM
To: Cook, Jackie
Subject: RE: Amendment Request dated June 25, 2013 - Request for Additional Information
Attachments: Seaman C200 Disposal Documents.pdf; C-200, SN L122; 130122.pdf

Happy Friday Ms. Cook:

We have disposed of the Seaman C-200 nuclear gauge, however Seaman Nuclear Corporation has not sent us any
disposal documentation. We have called them on several occasions, the most recent was August 23" prior to today.
Attached is some email correspondence from Harry Seaman informing us as to the disposal fee (page 1), our check
request to our accounts payable department (page 2) and the accounts payable account status (page 3), showing that
the check was cut and processed. | know that we need to submit the disposal documentation to the NRC and will as
soon as we receive it.

Also attached is a copy of the leak test results for the gauge, from January 22, 2013.

The third item in your email concerns Missoula, Montana as a location of use. We do still need to have Missoula
specified as a location of use, for the remaining gauges identified in our license.

If you have any questions concerning or if | can be of further assistance, then reply to this email.

Jeremiah B. Bowser, P. E.

Environmental Manager

Helena Sand & Gravel PUELIC .
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From: Cook, Jackie [mailto:Jackie.Cook@nrc.gov]

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2013 4:47 PM

To: Bowser, Jerry (Helena Sand & Gravel)

Subject: Amendment Request dated June 25, 2013 - Request for Additional Information
Importance: High

Good Afternoon Mr. Bowser:

You informed us that you have contracted with Seaman to dispose of a nuclear gauge. Please submit documentation
showing that the gauge was transferred to Seaman & Seaman now has the gauge in their possession. In addition, please
confirm if you still want the Missoula, Montana location specified as a location of use. If not, please submit a copy of the
latest leak test and a statement that the gauge never leaked while at the Missoula, Montana location.



| apologize for the short turnaround time but if you could submit this information by COB tomorrow, September 27,

2013, it will be greatly appreciated.

Thanking you in advanced for your cooperation, understanding, and prompt response to the above. Please do not
hesitate to contact me at the phone numbers and/or email address listed below if you have additional questions or need

clarification.

Sincerely,

1 E. "1 ﬁ- " ﬁ). e ﬁ
Senior Health Physicist

Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
Nuclear Materials Safety Branch B

1600 E. Lamar Blvd., Arlington, TX 76011
817-200-1132 (office)/817-200-1263 (fax)
e-mail address: Jackie.Cook@nrc.gov
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