.

Lodhi, Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com on behalf of Neftali Candelario [ncs@rivcon.net]
Sent: Tuesday, November 13, 2012 11:55 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar

Subject: Re: Response to your |etter

No. I thought we had to wait for your approval before transfering it (That's what I was asking) . I will call them
today to see if they can pick it up tomorrow.

On Tue, Nov 13, 2012 at 12:33 PM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.Lodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:

Your signature on NRC Form 314 certified that you have already transferred the gauge. Is it not true?

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [mailto:talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario
Sent: Tuesday, November 13, 2012 7:52 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar
Subject: Re: Response to your letter

Ok. So I can go ahead and give them the machine?

On Tue, Nov 13, 2012 at 7:59 AM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.LLodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:

No, you do not need our permission to transfer your gauge to anyone who has authorization (License) from
NRC or an Agreement State to possess the model number of the device that you are transferring. As for the
fee matters, Lynn Bates is the person to whom you should direct your inquiries.

Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [mailto:talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario
Sent: Monday, November 12, 2012 10:27 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar
Subject: Re: Response to your letter
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Sattar:

Please let me know when I would be able to transfer the gauge over to Constructora I Melendez? Do I have to
wait for your approval?

I'm also working out a payment plan for the fees owed, Lynn Bates sent me a draft for the payment plan and we
just want to confirm that there will be no other fees involved in this process since we notified the NRC before
October 31st that we would be disposing of the gauge. We will aggree to pay the $4,800 in fees owed as soon as
the NRC confirms this.

Thanks again,

On Fri, Nov 9, 2012 at 9:31 AM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.Lodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:

Neftali:

This looks good. We will proceed with your termination request. Good luck

Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [mailto:talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario
Sent: Friday, November 09, 2012 7:38 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar
Subject: Re: Response to your letter

Sattar:

We received the leak test report and I'm Including it along with form 314 in this email. I completed the form to
the best of my knowledge, please let me know if there is anything I should change. I would also like to know
how to proceed with the transfer of the equipment. Can I hand it over to Constructora Melendez right now or do
I have to wait for the NRC's permision?
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On Thu, Nov 1, 2012 at 11:57 AM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.l.odhi@@nrc.gov> wrote:

Neftali:

Yes, you can still transfer the license along with your gauge to any company provided the company assumes

the responsibility of your license as is, and agrees in writing to abide by alll commitments and conditions specified on your
license. Please refer to Section 5 of NUREG 1556, Vol 15 for the documentation that you have to provide to NRC before
you can be authorized to transfer the license. For fee matters you should directly contact Lynn Bates or Billy Belany at
the numbers that I had included in my letter.

I thought you were going to transfer your gauge to Constructora I Melendez. That would have been the easiest method,
but it is your choice. I am currently on official travel and that is the reason for delay in responding to your emails.

Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario [ncs@rivcon.net]

Sent: Wednesday, October 31, 2012 11:22 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar
Subject: Re: Response to your letter

Hi Sattar:

The leak test was done on monday. I'm exploring the option of Paying my current fees and transfering ownership of the
machine along with my license to someone else instead of terminating my license. Can it still be done?

On Wed, Oct 31, 2012 at 10:53 AM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.Lodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:

Neftali:

As I mentioned to you earlier, you do not need to get NRC's permission to transfer the gauge. All you have to do is to:
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1. Check if the recipient's current license authorizes the model of your gauge;
2. Leak test your gauge before tranferring the gauge;
3. Keep a copy of the recipient's license; and then

4. Complete the NRC Form 314 to request termination of your license.

As for payment plan for the fees, please contact Lynn Bates or Billy Blaney in our Fees department. I have their numbers
in my letter that I sent to you earlier. Good Luck

Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario [ncs@rivcon.net]

Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2012 12:59 PM

To: Lodhi, Sattar
Subject: Re: Response to your letter

Hi Sattar:

Sorry to bother you again. Please let me know if we can File for an Ownership transfer for the machine and start a
payment plan for the fees owed for last year.

On Mon, Oct 29, 2012 at 10:43 AM, Neftali Candelario <ncs@rivcon.net> wrote:

Sattar:

Iwould like to know if it's possible to transfer ownership of the machine. I would also like to know if we can enroll in a
paymentr plan for the Fees owed.

Sincerely,

On Wed, Oct 24, 2012 at 10:39 AM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.Lodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:
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Yes, we héve received information from Constructora Melendez that they want to acquire another gauge, and I knew that
it was your gauge that they wanted to acquire. I am glad it worked out for you.

Sattar

From: talosinfo@gmail.com [talosinfo@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Neftali Candelario [ncs@rivcon.net]
Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2012 9:55 AM

To: Lodhi, Sattar

Subject: Re: Response to your letter

Just wanted to let you know that Constructora I Melendez has agreed to Accept our gauge. the have applied for an
ammendment to their license for an extra gauge and once the ammendment is accepted by the NRC we will start the
transfer process.

On Wed, Oct 17, 2012 at 3:55 PM, Lodhi, Sattar <Sattar.Lodhi@nrc.gov> wrote:

Neftali:

The attached letter is in the mail. Good luck

Sattar

Neftali Candelario Soto, PE
Executive Vice-President

Rivero Construction Corporation
787-76Q-2790 Office
787-760-2740 Fax
939-644-4111 Mobile

ncs@riveon.net
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