
FOIA Resource 

From: nobody@www.nrc.gov 
Sent: Wednesday, May 16, 20126:22 PM 
To: FOIA Resource 
Subject: WWW Form Submission 

Below is the result of your feedback form. It was submitted by 

() on Wednesday, May 16,2012 at 18:21 :32 

FirstName: Samuel 

LastName: Elswick 

Company/Affliation: Morgan & Morgan PA 

Address1: 20 N. Orange Ave., 14th Floor 

Address2: 

City: Orlando 

State: FL 

Zip: 32801 

Country: United_States 

Country-Other: 

Email: selswick@forthepeople.com 

Phone: 407-841-9520 

Desc: I hereby request that a copy of the following information and/or documents be provided pursuant to the 
Freedom of Information Act. 

Any and all documents pertaining to the asbestos-containing equipment, asbestos-containing machinery, 
asbestos-contain,ing products, and asbestos-containing materials (hereinafter "ACM") installed during the 
construction of Unit #1 and Unit #2 of the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two Creeks, Wisconsin, during 
the 1967-1974 time period. This request includes, but is not limited to the following: 

1. Equipment and Machinery Documents and Lists: 

Please produce all documents (e.g., invoices, bills of lading, bill of materials, etc.) and/or a listing of all 

equipment and machinery (e.g., reactor, turbines, boilers, turbine generators, steam generators, condensers, 

demineralizers, pressurizers, liquid metal pumps, compressors, pumps, blowers, valves, generators, steam 

generators, heaters, superheaters, furnaces, fuel stokers, steam condensers, air heaters, evaporators, 

condensate pumps, feed water pumps, etc.) installed during the construction and/or maintenance of Unit #1 

and Unit # 2 at the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time period 1967­
1974. 


mailto:selswick@forthepeople.com
mailto:nobody@www.nrc.gov


For each specific piece of equipment and/or machinery identified in response to this request, please provide 
the following information: (1) the name of the manufacturer of each piece of equipment or machinery; (2) the 
brand name of each piece of equipment or machinery; (3) the model number of each piece of equipment or 
machinery; and (4) the ACM used on or in each piece of equipment or machinery. 

2. Asbestos Containing Products Documents and Lists: 

Please produce all documents (e.g., invoices, bills of lading, bill of materials, etc.) and/or a listing of all 
asbestos-containing products and ACM (e.g., asbestos-containing pipe insulation, asbestos-containing block 
insulation, asbestos-containing cements and mastics, asbestos-containing blankets and textile materials, 
asbestos-containing gaskets, asbestos-containing packing, asbestos-containing spray-on insulation, asbestos­
containing gunning materials, asbestos-containing cement pipes, asbestos-containing refractory materials, 
asbestos-containing tape, asbestos-containing mineral wool, asbestos-containing transite boards, asbestos­
containing wire, asbestos-containing cloth, asbestos-containing electrical components, raw asbestos, 
asbestos-containing and/or asbestiform talc, vermiculite, etc.) used in the construction and/or maintenance of 
Unit #1 and Unit #2 at the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time period 
1967-1974. 

For each specific asbestos-containing product and/or ACM identified in response to this request please provide 
the following information: (1) the name of the manufacturer of each asbestos-containing product and/or ACM; 
(2) the brand name of each asbestos-containing product and/or ACM; (3) the asbestos content of each 
asbestos-containing product and ACM; and (4) the intended use of each asbestos-containing product and 
ACM. 

3. Contractors and Subcontractors: 

Please produce all documents and/or a listing of all contractors and subcontractors who participated in the 
construction and/or maintenance of Unit #1 and Unit #2 at the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two 
Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time period 1967-1974. Please provide a separate listing and/or documents 
pertaining to all contractors and subcontractors who performed insulation and/or masonry related services in 
the construction and/or maintenance of Unit #1 and Unit #2 at the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two 
Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time period 1967-1974. 

4. Suppliers/Distributors 

Please produce all documents and/or a listing of all Suppliers and/or Distributors of the equipment, machinery, 
asbestos-containing products and ACM identified in response to Request Number 1 and Request Number 2 
above. 

Please be advised that I am not seeking blueprints, plans, schematics, construction engineering plans, 
architectural drawings, etc., related to the construction, maintenance or logistics of Unit # 1 and Unit # 2 of the 
Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant located at Two Creeks, Wisconsin. Further, I am not seeking information 
related to the configuration, layout or operation of Unit # 1 and Unit # 2 of the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant 
located at Two Creeks, Wisconsin. I understand that these documents could contain information that may pose 
a threat to national security. 

I am merely seeking information regarding the asbestos-containing equipment, asbestos-containing machinery, 
asbestos-containing products and asbestos-containing materials used in the construction and maintenance of 
Unit #1 and Unit #2 at the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time period 
1967-1974, in order to determine the asbestos-containing equipment, asbestos-containing machinery, 
asbestos-containing products and asbestos-containing materials that my client was exposed to while working 
at Unit #1 and Unit #2 of the Point Beach Nuclear Power Plant in Two Creeks, Wisconsin, during the time 
period 1967-1974. 

The maximum dollar amount I am willing to pay for this request is $500. Please notify me if the fees will exceed 
$250.00. Thank you for your cooperation in this request. 
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