Blaney, Stephanie

From: Jonathan Greene [jgreene@widetronix.com] FOIAPA
Sent: Monday, March 28, 2011 2:32 PM Case No.- ) -
To: Blaney, Stephanie No.: AN O
Subject: Re: FOIA/PA-2011-0108 Request - Fee Estimate Ot Rec'd: Q SO
‘Specialist: Nee
Hi Stephani Tl :
ephanie, ; :

We received the document - thank you!

As [ mentioned there are several pages of information we would like to have in addition to the 12 that were sent
last week. Page 6 of 12 mentions several references - [ would like to request that we receive all of the
supporting references on Page 6 of 12 from this document. How can we go about getting this information,

Thank you!

Jon Greene
On Mar 25, 2011, at 10:36 AM, Blaney, Stephanie wrote:

Jonathan,

You should have the response any day now. | contacted the office responsible for the information and the
person who handled this is on vacation. Once you receive the response, please review it and let me know if
there is anything else you may need.

Let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
Thank you,

Stephanie Blaney

FOIA/PA Specialist

FOIA/Privacy Section, Information Services Branch
Information & Records Services Division

Office of Information Services

U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
301-415-6975 (Phone)

3071-415-5130 (Fax)

From: Jonathan Greene [mailto:jareene@widetronix.com]
Sent: Friday, March 25, 2011 10:10 AM

To: Blaney, Stephanie

Subject: Re: FOIA/PA-2011-0108 Request - Fee Estimate

Stephanie - typically the bulk of the SSDR applications are in the attachments - wondering if what you sent me
includes that attachments. Because that is the information that is relevant from our point of view. [f that is the
case and it was not included do I need to make a separate request?

Regards,


mailto:jgreene@widetronix.comJ

Jon

On Mar 23, 2011, at 1:15 PM, Blaney, Stephanie wrote:

Thank you. No, it is being released in full. | will hopefully have it in the mail to you no later than tomarrow
morning.

M — —
From: Jonathan Greene [mailto:jgreene@widetronix.com
Sent: Wednesday, March 23, 2011 12:12 PM

To: Blaney, Stephanie
Subject: Re: FOIA/PA-2011-0108 Request - Fee Estimate

Stephanie,

Thank you - here is the electronic version and the fax should follow. I am a little surprised it is only 12 pages
long - was information in the SSDR redacted or excluded for some reason.

Regards,
jon

On Mar 23,2011, at 11:41 AM, Blaney, Stephanie wrote:

Jonathan,
Attached is a “Statement of Estimated Fees for Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) Request”.

If you agree to pay the fees noted in the attached Statement of Estimated Fees, please sign the Statement and
return it to me by fax at (301) 415-5130, by April 6, 2011. We will bill you at the completion of the request.

Thank you,

Stepthanie Blaney

FOIA/PA Specialist

FOIA/Privacy Section, Information Services Branch
Information & Records Services Division

Office of Information Services

U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
301-415-6975 (Phone)

301-415-5130 (Fax)

<2011-0108 fee est..pdf>
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This E-mail and any attachments may contain confidential or privileged information which is intended for use by the individual or entity
to which the transmission is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, dissemination,
copying or distribution of this transmission or its attachments is prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify
the sender by electronic mail or notify the system administrator by telephone (607) 330-4752 immediately and delete the transmission
and its attachments.
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This E-mail and any attachments may contain confidential or privileged information which is intended for use by the individual or entity
to which the transmission is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, dissemination,
copying or distribution of this transmission or its attachments is prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify
the sender by electronic mail or notify the system administrator by telephone (607) 330-4752 immediately and delete the transmission
and its attachments.
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