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From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com

Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 11:14 AM

To: Blaney, William

Cc: Jessie, Janelle; marilyn.kray@exeloncorp.com; david.distel@exeloncorp.com;
Joshua.Trembley@exeloncorp.com

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Attachments: NRC 3Q10 Invoice.pdf

Billy,

| appreciate the prompt response, but | am somewhat confused by the content. Attached is a copy of an invoice for 3Q10
(2Q10 FY) we received for VCS ESP work, which also shows docket number 052-00042. | know the NRC staff did a fair
amount of work between 9/26/10 and 12/18/10 since we had multiple interfaces such as the Hydrology audit and ER
Scoping meeting in late November / early December.

Can you please double check on this estimate? As much as my budget would love the value below, | have a hard time
believing it is correct. | am copying Janelle Jesse as well to keep her in the loop and to solicit any thoughts she may have
on how a “0” value came up.

Thank you,

Chris Kerr
Exelon

From: Blaney, William [mailto:William.Blaney@nrc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 11:04 AM

To: Kerr, Christopher J:(GenCo)

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Chris,

| reviewed my report and contacted the regional office for confirmation and have confirmed that O billable hours
were charged to this docket number between 09/26/2010 — 12/18/2010. Please let me know if you have any
questions.

Thanks,
Billy Blaney

License Fee Analyst
0CFO/DC/ARPB
(301) 415-5092

From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com [mailto:christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 9:27 AM

To: Blaney, William

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Billy,
We’'re 05200042 for the Victoria ESP.

Thank you



From: Blaney, William [mailto:William.Blaney@nrc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 9:26 AM

To: Kerr, Christopher J:(GenCo)

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Chris,
| do have the report to provide an estimate. What docket number(s) do you need the estimates for?

Thanks,
Billy

From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com [mailto:christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 9:07 AM

To: Blaney, William

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Billy,

Just a friendly reminder on an estimate for NRC fees for Exelon’s ESP project for 4Q10 (1Y11). | have to provide my
estimate by no later than 1200 2/2.

Thank you,

Chris Kerr
Exelon

From: Blaney, William [mailto:William.Blaney@nrc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2011 11:42 AM

To: Kerr, Christopher J:(GenCo)

Cc: Jessie, Janelle

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10

Chris,

I may be able to provide some sort of estimate by 2/1/2011. We are waiting on the report to complete that we
will send to the offices for certification hopefully within the next day or 2. As long as this report processes | can
provide you with the estimate off of this report. If you have not heard from me by 2/1, please check with me via
again and | can provide you with an update.

Thanks,

Billy Blaney

License Fee Analyst
OCFO/DC/ARPB
(301)415-5092

From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com [mailto:christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2011 11:37 AM

To: Blaney, William

Cc: Jessie, Janelle

Subject: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10



Billy,

| believe when we talked in early January, you informed me that the NRC was going through a conversion on its
accounting systems and you did not have any estimate for what our 4Q10 (FY1Q11) costs would be. | need to provide an
estimate of this cost as part of my January cost reporting since we show it as being paid in January. | understand we will
not get the official invoice until February, and that is not a problem, but | need to at least provide some estimate by
2/1/2011.

Any information you can provide on this is appreciated.
Thanks,

Chris Kerr
Exelon

sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk s sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk skeosk sk skeoskesk sk sk ThlS e_maﬂ and any Of ltS attaChmentS may
contain Exelon Corporation proprietary information, which is privileged, confidential, or subject to copyright
belonging to the Exelon Corporation family of Companies. This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and
attachments to this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,

please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any
printout. Thank You. sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk st s sie sk sk sk sk s ske sk sk st sk sie sk sk sk st sk sk ske sk sk st sie sk ske sk sk steosieoskeoske sk seoskeoskeske sk skoskok

sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk s ske sk sk sk sk st ske sk sfe sk sk st sk sk sk st sk st sk ske sk sk sk st sk sle sk skeoskeosteosko sk sieskeoskeske sk sk skeoskok ThlS e_maﬂ and any Of ltS attaChmentS may
contain Exelon Corporation proprietary information, which is privileged, confidential, or subject to copyright
belonging to the Exelon Corporation family of Companies. This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and
attachments to this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,

please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any
printout‘ Thank You. sk 3t sk sk sk s sk s e sk sk sk sk sk s ke sk sk sk sk sk sk ke sk sk sk sk sk s ke sk sk sk sk sk s ke sk skeosk sk sk sk skosk sk sk

sk sk sk sk sk sk sk s sk st s sk sk s sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sfe sk sk sk sk sk skeskeosk skesk ThlS e_maﬂ and any Ofits attachments may

contain Exelon Corporation proprietary information, which is privileged, confidential, or subject to copyright
belonging to the Exelon Corporation family of Companies. This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and
attachments to this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,

please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any
printout. Thank You- sk sk sfe sk ske sk sk sk ke sfe sk sk sk sk sk sk sk sk ske sk sk sk sk ske sk sk sk sk sk ske st sk sk sk sk sk skeoske stk sk sk skoske sk sk

sk sk s sk sk ke sk sk sk s sk s sk sk sk sk s ke s sk sk sk sk s sk s sk sk sk sk s sk sk sk sk s sk s sk sk skosk sk skoskosk ko sk ThlS e_mail and any Ofits attaChmentS may
contain Exelon Corporation proprietary information, which is privileged, confidential, or subject to copyright
belonging to the Exelon Corporation family of Companies. This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and
attachments to this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,

please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any
printout. Thank You. sk sk ke s sfe ke s she ke sk she ke sk she ke sk she ke sk she ke sk she ke sk ske ke sk sk sie sk she ke sk sk e sl sk ke sfeoskeosie skeoskeoske ks skosk



Hearing ldentifier: Victoria_ ESP_NonPublic
Email Number: 60

Mail Envelope Properties (AD5966BFAD4EE54D8CEBOOAF6DFS5C395EABGT7)

Subject: RE: Exelon ESP Costs for 4Q10
Sent Date: 2/1/2011 11:13:38 AM

Received Date: 2/1/2011 11:14:.07 AM

From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com
Created By: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com
Recipients:

"Jessie, Janelle" <Janelle.Jessie@nrc.gov>

Tracking Status: None

"marilyn.kray@exeloncorp.com" <marilyn.kray@exeloncorp.com>

Tracking Status: None

"david.distel@exeloncorp.com" <david.distel@exeloncorp.com>

Tracking Status: None

"Joshua.Trembley@exeloncorp.com" <Joshua.Trembley@exeloncorp.com>
Tracking Status: None

"Blaney, William" <William.Blaney@nrc.gov>

Tracking Status: None

Post Office: mobmsxch05.energy.power.corp

Files Size Date & Time
MESSAGE 7178 2/1/2011 11:14:.07 AM
NRC 3Q10 Invoice.pdf 178198

Options

Priority: Standard

Return Notification: No

Reply Requested: No

Sensitivity: Normal

Expiration Date:
Recipients Received:



U. S. NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION
Part 170 License Fee Invoice
10 CFR 170.21

If paid by Fedwire see attached Terms and Conditions. If paid by check, Invoice No.: RL0220-11
make check payable to the NRC (reference Invoice no.) and mail to:

U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission Invoice Date: 10/25/10
Accounts Receivable Team '

P.O. Box 979051

St. Louis, MO 63197-9000 Contact: BILLY BLANEY

Phone: 301/415-5092

TO: EXELON GENERATION COMPANY

ATTN: MARILYN C. KRAY
200 EXELON WAY

KENNETT SQUARE, PA 19348 REeCE-gonE ::

0CT 25 2010
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Period: 07/04/10 - 09/25/10

VICTORIA COUNTY STATION ESP AAI\FQIL)(PJ (3- kCF%}\\/

TERMS.

NOTES.

Standard Plant Review

388.9 HRS @ $259.00 $ 100,725.10
592.8 HRS @ $257.00 $ 152,349.60

Contract Costs: S 121,028.84

Project Manager: $ 33,263.00

Interest will accrue from the invoice date at the annual rate of 1.000 %. Payment is due immediately. However, interest
will be waived if payment is received within 30 days from the invoice date. Penalty and administrative charges will be
assessed on a delinquent invoice. Additional terms and conditions are attached, if applicable.

If there are any questions about the existence or amount of the debt, contact the individual named above. For NRC debt
collection procedures, including interest and penalty provisions, see 31 U.8.C. 3717, 4 CFR 101-105, and 10 CFR 15.



10/21/10 10:40:38

Detail Line For Invoice RL0220-11
For the Period 07/04/10 - 09/25/10

Page Number:

Job Docket Contractual Cost Applicnt
Code Number TAC/B&R Rate Hourly Costs PM Costs Costs Date Date Names/Remarks
052-00042 RN2001 0.0 257.00 771.00 0.00 0.00 / 11/01/09 VIC Environmental PM Support
052-00042 RN2001 0.0 259.00 2,590.00 0.00 0.00 / 11/01/09 VIC Environmental PM Support
052-00042 RN2002 4.0 257.00 11,308.00 0.00 0.00 / 11/01/09 VIC Portfolio Manager Support
052-00042 RN2002 0.0 259.00 2,331.00 0.00 0.00 / 11/01/09 VIC Portfolio Manager Support
052-00042 RN6522 0.0 257.00 1,670.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VIC NPLS PMs Compile Branch Memo Results and Prepare Intern
052-00042 RN6524 3.9 257.00 65,098.10 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VIC Post-Memo Interactions with Applicant
052-00042 RN6524 2.3 25%.00 33,695.90 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VIC Post-Memo Interactions with Applicant
052-00042 RN6525 1.0 257.00 5,525.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - Surface Water Hydrology 2.4.1 - 2.4.11 2.4.1
052-00042 RN6530 0.0 257.00 7,710.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.1 Site Location and Desc - Initial RAIs P
052-00042 RN6530 0.0 259.00 4,144.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.1 Site Location and Desc - Initial RAIs P
052-00042 RN6531 0.0 257.00 6,168.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.2 Excl Area Authority and Control - Initi
052-00042 RN6531 0.0 259.00 2,072.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.2 Excl Area Authority and Control - Initi
052-00042 RN6532 0.0 257.00 8,224.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.3 Population Disgtrib - Initial RAIs Prepa
052-00042 RN6532 0.0 259.00 8,365.70 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.1.3 Population Distrib - Initial RAIs Prepa
052-00042 RN6538 0.0 257.00 11,308.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.5.4 Stability of Subsurf Matls and Foundati
052-00042 RN6538 5 0.0 259.00 13,079.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.5.4 Stability of Subsurf Matls and Foundati
052-00042 RN6539 7.0 0.0 257.00 1,799.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.5.5 Stability of Slopes - Initial RAIs Prep
052-00042 RN6539 0.5 0.0 259%9.00 129.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.5.5 Stability of Slopes - Initial RAIs Prep
052-00042 RN9008 4.0 2.0 257.00 1,542.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Provide Monthly Project Administration
052-00042 RN9008 70.0 2.0 259.00 18,648.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Provide Monthly Project Administratiom
052-00042 RN9009 4.0 0.0 257.00 1,028.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Coordinating with Army Coxrps of Engineers
052-00042 RN9011 4.0 0.0 257.00 1,028.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Prepare and Issue FR Notice of Intent
052-00042 RN9012 2.0 0.0 259.00 518.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Prepare for visit
052-00042 RN9016 5.0 0.0 259.00 1,295.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 vVCS Phase A - 1.0 Introduction - Initial RAIs Prepared
052-00042 RN9034 10.5 0.0 259.00 2,719.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 2.5.1 Geologic and Seismic Info - Initial RAI
052-00042 9Al1A 48.0 2.6 257.00 0.00 13,004.20 0.00 / / / PM - GENERAL ADMINISTRATION
052-00042 9A1A 11.5 1.3 25%.00 0.00 3,315.20 0.00 / / / PM - GENERAL ADMINISTRATION
052-00042 9AlE 48.5 0.8 257.00 0.00 12,670.10 0.00 / / / PM - STAFF DEVELOPMENT & PROFESSIONAL MEETINGS
052-00042 9AlE 16.5 0.0 259%9.00 0.00 4,273.50 0.00 / / / PM - STAFF DEVELOPMENT & PROFESSIONAL MEETINGS
052-00042 RN6528 55.0 1.0 257.00 14,392.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phage A - 13.3 EP - PSER and RAIs - Initial RAIs Prepar
052-00042 RN6528 18.5 0.0 259%.00 4,791.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 13.3 EP - PSER and RAIs -~ Initial RAIs Prepar
052-00042 RN6529 45.5 0.0 257.00 11,693.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 14.3.10 - EP ITAAC - Initial RAIs Prepared
052-00042 RN6529 17.5 0.0 259.00 4,532.50 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 14.3.10 - EP ITAAC - Initial RAIs Prepared
052-00042 RN9004 12.0 0.0 257.00 3,084.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 13.6 Physical Security Initial RAIs Prepared
052-00042 RN9004 7.0 0.0 259.00 1,813.00 0.00 0.00 / 03/15/10 VCS Phase A - 13.6 Physical Security Initial RAIs Prepared
Q4055 052-00042 RX0721 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 4,231.00 2010/07 / / Victoria Exelon ESP Tsunami Hazard Analysis Safety Review
Q4055 052-00042 RX0721 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 17,318.00 2010/06 / / Victoria Exelon ESP Tsunami Hazard Analysis Safety Review
Q4148 052-00042 RX0632 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 687.00 2010/08 / / PSEG-1 Pre App- Environmental Readiness Assessment
Q4162 052-00042 RX0726 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,499.00 2010/07 / / Victoria ESP Exelon- Technical support for Acceptance Rev
Q4162 052-00042 RX0726 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,469.00 2010/08 / / Victoria ESP Exelon- Technical support for Acceptance Rev
Q4162 052-00042 RX0726 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 2,998.00 2010/06 / / Vietoria ESP Exelon- Technical support for Acceptance Rev
Q4163 052-00042 RX0720 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 16,198.27 2010/06 / / Victoria BESP Hydrology Safety Review SRP 2.4
Q4163 052-00042 RX0720 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,589.03 2010/07 / / Victoria ESP Hydrology Safety Review SRP 2.4



10/21/10 10:40:38

Detail Line For Invoice RL0220-11
For the Period 07/04/10 - 09/25/10

Page Number: 2

Job Docket Reg NonReg Contractual Cost Applicnt

Code Number TAC/B&R Hours Hours Rate Hourly Costs PM Costs Costs Date Date Names/Remarks

Q4238 052-00042 RX0728 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 5,602.73 2010/06 / / Victoria ESP Environmental Review

Q4238 052-00042 RX0728 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 -267.19 2010/08 / / Victoria ESP Environmental Review

Q4246 052-00042 RX0759 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 69,747.00 2010/07 / / USGS review of the Salem Hope Creek Application for Early

Q4246 052-00042 RX0759 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 ~-43.00 2010/08 / / USGS review of the Salem Hope Creek Application for Barly
1,080.0 30.9 253,074.70 33,263.00 121,028.84

Total Invoice Cost:

407,367.00
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