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From: Jessie, Janelle
Sent: Thursday, August 12, 2010 10:52 AM
To: Blaney, William
Cc: Lo, Eileen; Usilton, William; Terry, Tomeka
Subject: RE: NRC Invoices

Hi Billy 
 
I just heard back from Exelon.  Their accounting department has difficulty processing the invoices when 
payment amounts don’t match.  With that being said, Exelon is requesting that a new invoice in the amount of 
$2,998 be sent to them.   
 
Please reissue the invoice only reflecting the $2,998 charges against the VCS COL with a new date.  Also, 
would you mind sending a copy to me?  This way I’ll have a copy to reference if there are any more questions. 
 
Thanks 
 
JJ 
 
From: Blaney, William  
Sent: Thursday, August 12, 2010 9:09 AM 
To: Jessie, Janelle 
Cc: Lo, Eileen; Usilton, William; Terry, Tomeka 
Subject: RE: NRC Invoices 
 
Janelle, 
  
Please let them know and I will take care of reissuing the invoice.  Let them know to go ahead and pay the $2,998.00 
and I will reissue for the correct amount.  I just need to know whether they want to wait to receive a new invoice with 
the correct amount or if they are paying right away.  If they are waiting I will reissue the invoice with a new date and if 
they are paying based on your conversation, I will just reissue with the original date. 
  
Thanks, 
Billy 

From: Jessie, Janelle 
Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2010 2:17 PM 
To: Blaney, William 
Cc: Lo, Eileen; Usilton, William; Terry, Tomeka 
Subject: RE: NRC Invoices 

Hi Billy 
  
With respect to the Exelon invoice for the Victoria County Station review, the charges in the amount of 
$2,998.00 are a maintenance fee for the EARRTH (Environmental Assessment Reactor Review Team Home) 
website.  EARRTH is a document repository and share point site used by the NRC and its environmental 
contractors (national laboratories and commercial contractors) during the environmental review of COLA and 
ESP applications.  It is maintained by the Pacific Northwest National Laboratory (PNNL) and all suspended 
COLA or ESP application reviews that have not been either withdrawn or terminated are charged a monthly 
maintenance fee for EARRTH upkeep.  Because the Victoria COL application was not withdrawn from the 
docket until June, those charges against the COL for EARRTH for the months of March and April of this year 
still apply.  The charges shown in the invoice in the amount of $2,998.00 should still be paid by the applicant.   
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Now that we’ve figured this out, would you recommend that I simply email the applicant explaining this to them 
and requesting that they pay only the charges in the amount of $2,998.00?  Or would you recommend, as a 
cleaner approach, that we reissue the invoice only reflecting charges in the amount of $2,998.00 and a note 
explaining that the charges in the amount of $13, 286.90 were incorrect and therefore have been removed?  
The third option would be a combination…I could explain everything to the applicant and request that they pay 
the $2,998.00 and let them know that the invoice would be reissued only reflecting the charges in the amount 
of $2998.00.   
  
Please let me know how you recommend I proceed 
  
I left a voicemail message for your as well.  
  
JJ 
X6775 
  
From: Blaney, William  
Sent: Wednesday, August 04, 2010 3:22 PM 
To: Jessie, Janelle 
Cc: Lo, Eileen; Usilton, William 
Subject: RE: NRC Invoices 
  
Janelle, 
  
Licensing fee are assessed to recover full costs for a project manager assigned to a specific plant or facility, 
excluding leave time and time spent on generic activities (such as rulemaking).  The charges to this invoice for 
9A1A and 9A1E were for Paul Michalak (052-00031) and for Chandu Patel (052-00031).  Paul is listed as the 
PM from 3/28/10 – 6/19/10  and Chandu is listed as the PM from 03/28/10 – 4/24/10 on the Project Manager 
Docket Affiliation Report.  There are no PM hours charged on this invoice after 6/19/10.  A determination will 
need to be made as to whether Paul should have been listed as the PM during this time frame.   
  
The contract costs can be adjusted, I will need to have something sent to me in writing explaining why the 
adjustment should be made and what adjustment should be done. 
  
I know this is a brief explanation, but please feel free to contact me for additional information.  Also, I see that 
Eileen has sent an email saying that she will meet with you tomorrow to discuss. 
  
Thanks, 
Billy Blaney 
License Fee Analyst 
OCFO/DC/ARPB 
(301) 415-5092 
  
  
  
From: Jessie, Janelle  
Sent: Wednesday, August 04, 2010 2:19 PM 
To: Blaney, William 
Cc: Lo, Eileen; Usilton, William 
Subject: FW: NRC Invoices 
  
Good Afternoon Everyone, 
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I received the email below from Exelon regarding the attached invoice.   There are charges shown on the 
invoice associated with TAC/ B & R Code:  9A1A and 9A1E against the Victoria COL (docket numbers 052-31 
and 052-32) in the amount of $13.286.90.  This should not be the case since the review of the Victoria COL 
application has been suspended since September of 2008.  The Victoria ESP (docket 052-042) review is the 
only review that is ongoing at this time.  According to the details on the invoice, these hours were charged for 
PM time, but all of the tacs that we used for the ESP begin with RE.  I have never seen the codes 9A1A and 
9A1E until now.   Is there a way to figure out what the codes 9A1A and 9A1E are associated with and if 
possible who charged time to those codes?  Once this determination is made, if the charges should have been 
made against the Victoria ESP, they’ll need to be reflected as such in order for the applicant to pay them. If this 
is an error and this charge is not associated with the Victoria ESP review, then I am requesting that the charge 
be removed from the invoice.  
  
In addition to this concern, there is also the concern of contractual charges for the environmental contractor.  I 
spoke with the environmental PM about the contractual charges shown in the amount of $2,998.00 which she 
confirmed were showing up on the invoice against the Victoria COL (052-31 and 052-32) because the wrong 
code was used by the environmental contractor.  The environmental PM is in the process of providing the 
contractor with the correct billing info so that future charges will be made against the Victoria ESP (52-042) as 
opposed to the Victoria COL (052-31 and 52-031).  In the meantime, the charges made by the environmental 
contractor in the amount of $2,998.00 will not be paid by the applicant unless the charges are reflected against 
the ESP 052-042.   How do we go about transferring these charges ($2,998.00) over to the 052-042 docket for 
the ESP so that the charge can be appropriately billed to the applicant?  
  
Just FYI:  As of July 20, 2010, the Victoria COL application was withdrawn from the NRC docket. So, no 
charges should be shown against docket numbers 052-31 and 052-32- they are no longer on the books.  
  
I know that this is a lot of info to convey.  Please give me call if more information is needed or if anyone would 
like to discuss this further.  
  
Thanks 
  
Janelle 
X6775 
  
From: christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com [mailto:christopher.kerr@exeloncorp.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, August 03, 2010 8:25 AM 
To: Jessie, Janelle 
Cc: marilyn.kray@exeloncorp.com; david.distel@exeloncorp.com 
Subject: NRC Invoices 
  
Janelle, 
  
We received two NRC invoices yesterday; 
  

1. RL0782-10 for the ESP totaling $664,235, which aligns with what you previously communicated to me last week. 
This invoice is being processed for payment.  

2. RL0781-10 totaling $16,285. This invoice appears to be (once again) for charges against the ESBWR S-COLA. 
The ESBWR COLA docket number is listed on the invoice, and the S-COLA Environmental Report is listed as 
well. We are not planning on paying this invoice since the ESBWR COLA project has been closed, and there does 
not appear to be any ESP related costs listed on this invoice. Please let me know if you believe otherwise.  

  
Thank you, 
  
Chris Kerr 
Exelon Nuclear Project Development 
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************************************************** This e-mail and any of its attachments may 
contain Exelon Corporation proprietary information, which is privileged, confidential, or subject to copyright 
belonging to the Exelon Corporation family of Companies. This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the 
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and 
attachments to this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error, 
please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any 
printout. Thank You. ************************************************** 
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