
'RE: HMC Surety_ __ __Pa ge__e

From: "Cox, Al (Grants)" <ACox@barrick.com>
To: "Ron Linton" <RCL1@nrc.gov>
Date: 08/08/2007 3:54:04 PM
Subject: RE: HMC Surety

Ron,
When I get a moment, I will look into this and respond. Still catching
up from.vacation - which is wicked!!
Thanks ..... Al

----- Original Message -----
From: Ron Linton [mailto:RCL1@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, August 08, 2007 11:36 AM
To: Cox, Al. (Grants)
Subject: HMC Surety

Al:
I was looking over the surety estimate. I see that EP3 construction,
with makes up about 3.5 million in costs, has been eliminated. In light
of the fact that EP3 has not been approved at this time and construction
has not commenced, should the EP3 Pond 3 construction costs remain in
the new cost estimate on page 11 of 23, $3,355,500, $15,000, and
$229,500, or similar costs for next year? If so, please send me a
revised estimate.
Ron

CC: "George Hoffman" <hydro@alluretech. net>



lIcAtempAG) 100001.TMP Paae 1 111ic\e~ \ W OO1 .TM .aa 1.... ..... ii......

Mail Envelope Properties (46BA1F46.9E5 : 0 43493)

Subject:
Creation Date
From:

Created By:

RE: HMC Surety
08/08/2007 3:53:17 PM
"Cox, Al (Grants)" <ACox@barrick.com>

ACox@barrick.com

Recipients
nrc.gov
.TWGWPO01 .HQGWDOO1

RCLI (Ron Linton)

alluretech.net
hydro CC (George Hoffman)

Post Office
•TWGWPO01 ,HQGWDO01

Route
nrc.gov
alluretech~net

Files
MESSAGE
Mime.822

Options
Expiration Date:
Priority:
ReplyRequested:
Return Notification:

Concealed Subject:
Security:

Size
727
2223

Date & Time
08/08/2007 3:53:17 PM

None
Standard
No
None

No
Standard


