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- Re: Summary of phone conversation 8/30/07

From: "Cox, Al (Grants)" <ACox@barrick.com>
To: <RCL1@nrc.gov>, "Kump, Dan (Grants)" <dkump@barrick.com>, <hydro@alluretech.net>,

"Grandy, Ted (Salt Lake City)" <tgrandy@barrickýcom>
Date: 08/30/2007 11:14 PM
Subject: Re: Summary of phone conversation 8/30/07

Ron,
Your summary of conversation is on the target- thanks!

George and Tom Michel-will work with Dan and I to add the pond $$ to the estimate and
I will send the revised spreadsheet to you via e-mail. When you have approved, I
assume we will need to prepare the corp. Parent guarantee docs and get that to you.
Please confirm that understanding. - I will need to coordinate that with corp HQ.
Thanks ........... Al

Sent from my BlackBerry Wireless Handheld

----- Original Message -----
From: Ron Linton <RCLl@nrc.gov>
To: Cox, Al (Grants) <ACox@barrick.com>
CC: Bill VonTill <RWV@nrc.gov>
Sent: Thu Aug 30 12:58:03 2007
Subject: Summary of phone conversation 8J30/07

Alan:
Just to summarize our conversation:

1. NRC would like to come by the HMC - Grants site at around 4:30 pm, Monday Sept 17
for a "drive on the pile" style 45-60 minute tour, stops facing east, north, west,
south, to see the site and the lay of the land. This is really for our Division
Director, Larry Camper, so he can seethe site prior to the Sept 18 meeting. Please
confirm this is doable.

2. I'd like to request Dan or George to get the key from Cibola County prior to 5:00
on Sept 18 and make sure the room is set up for the meeting and PowerPoint slide
presentation, if possible. I will tell Elena at Cibola County the set-up style and
the County is supposed to complete the set-up. However, I'd like someone to double
check prior to the meeting. We (NRC) will likely be in the field on an extended site
tour most of the day. Please confirm this is doable.

The contact there is:
Meeting Information
Cibola County Government Bldg.
515 High Street
Grants, New Mexico 87020
Contact: Elena 505-285-2510 or 287-9431
"Elena Rodriguez" <ecrodriguez@zianet.com>

3. HMC will resubmit electronically the 2008 cost estimate with the pond #3 costs
included.

4. The Pond #3 resolution is HMC priority (and will be my priority after the 9/18
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meeting to get done). We discussed status of Acoma issue.

5. CAP revision is not a NRC/HMC priority and will be worked on after Pond #3 is
resolved.

Please correct any inaccuracies.
Ron
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From: "Cox, Al (Grants)" <ACox@barrick.com>
To: "Ron Linton" <RCLl@nrc.gov>
Date: 08/08/2007 3:54:04 PM
Subject: RE: HMC Surety

Ron,
When I get a moment, I will look into this and respond. Still catching
up from vacation - which is wicked!!
Thanks ..... Al

----- Original Message -----
From: Ron Linton [mailto:RCL1@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, August 08, 2007 11:36 AM
To.: Cox, Al (Grants)
Subject: HMC Surety

Al:
I was looking over the surety estimate. I see that EP3 construction,
with makes up about 3.5 million in costs, has been eliminated. In light
of the fact that EP3 has not been approved at this time and construction
has not commenced, should-the EP3 Pond 3 construction costs remain in
the new cost estimate on page 11 of 23, $3,355,500, $15,000, and
$229,500, or similar costs for next year? If so, please send me a
revised estimate.
Ron

CC: "George Hoffman" <hydro@alluretech.net>
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