[ Betty Garrett - Invoice FL0212-06

From: "Luthiger, Peter” <Peter.Luthiger@BHPBilliton.com>
To: "Michael Raddatz" <MGR@nrc.gov>

Date: 4/26/06 3:21PM

Subject: Invoice FL0212-06 — 40 — g70\(

Mike,

I had a question on the assignment of charges on the above referenced
invoice, which covers expenses for roughly the 1st quarter of CY2006.
The 1st 2 charges are assigned to TAC LU0078 which refiects the Lined
Pond Closure Plan. That plan was approved by NRC in June 2005. | do
not see why any time would be needed on that plan in 2006.

| believe that the correct TAC should be LU0O77 which was assigned to
the Soil Plan, as this is what, | believe you have been spending most of
your time on as it relates to Rio Algom. If this is the case, we will

need to get another invoice which refiects this TAC and references the
"Soil Decommissioning Plan."

Thanks.

Peter

This message and any attached files may contain information that is confidential and/or subject of legal
privilege intended only for use by the intended recipient. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this
message in error and that any dissemination, copying or use of this message or attachment is strictly
forbidden, as is the disclosure of the information therein. If you have received this message in error please
notify the sender immediately and delete the message.



~ Page 1}

fcitempiGWjo0001.TMP

s

Mail Envelope Properties (444FC82F.0FA : 17 : 53498)

Subject: Invoice FL0212-06
Creation Date: 4/26/06 3:21PM
From: "Luthiger, Peter" <Peter.Luthiger@BHPBilliton.com>
Created By: Peter.Luthiger@BHPBilliton.com
Recipients
nre.gov

TWGWPO01.HQGWDOO01

MGR (Michael Raddatz)

Post Office Route
TWGWPO01.HQGWDOO01 nrc.gov
Files Size Date & Time
MESSAGE 1265 04/26/06 03:21PM
TEXT.htm 1951

Mime.822 5836
Options

Expiration Date: None

Priority: Standard

Reply Requested: No

Return Notification: None

Concealed Subject: No

Security: Standard



