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From: “John J. Miller" <jjmiller@intisoid.com>
To: "Tomas Herrera" <TXH1@nrc.gov>
Date: Tue, May 24, 2005 2:47 PM

Subject: RE: USA/5796B(U) Package

Thanks Tomas.

This is good news. Who would | contact to figure out what is required to
change the CoC to show International Isotopes Inc. as the Issued To:
Addressee? | don't think we would need to change our Part 71 QA program
because we are not designing or manufacturing packages.

John

----- Original Message-----

From: Tomas Herrera [mailto:TXH1 @nrc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2005 11:51 AM

To: jimiler@intisoid.com

Cc: Shawn Williams

Subject: Re: USA/5796B(U) Package

John,

In 1992, NRC Staff decided that the package with the contents limited to
capsules which meet the requirements for special form met the Type B(U)
package: requirements (1973 Edition). Since both models are under the same
CoC they would both meet the requirements for the 1973 edition.

Tomas lHerrera

>>> "John J. Miller" <jjmiller @intisoid.com> 05/24/05 09:12AM >>>
Good Morning Tomas,

International Isotopes may have the opportunity to acquire ownership of a
USA/5796B(U) Package. My biggest concern is that the package was constructed
under the 1967 Edition of Safety Series 6 and will only be Grandfathered

until October 2008. The CoC | have for the package expires August 31, 2007.

Is there a way | can determine what criteria this package was fabricated

under? It has to be either the 1967 or 1973 Editions. Also the CoC lists two
models, the 181375 and 181361. Would it be safe to assume that both Models
would have been fabricated under the same Edition since they are listed on

the same CoC? | was going to see what | can find in ADAMS but am not certain

if what | am looking for would be retrievable.

Do you have any information on this CoC?

John J. Miller, CHP

Radiation Safety Officer
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International Isotopes Inc.
4137 Commerce Circle

Idaho Falls, ID 83401

Ph. 20€&.524.5300
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