From: "Young, Jon" <Jon_Young@steris.com>

To: "Marjorie McLaughlin" <MMM3@nrc.gov>
Date: Thu, Sep 1, 2005 9:47 AM

Subject: RE: Financial Assurance for NRC Licenses
Marjorie:

To summarize the series of events mentioned in my phone message to you,
in short, no one at the Bank could find the Standby Trust Agreement.

PNC stated that they sold it to Mellon Bank, who in turn sold it to
JPMorganChase, who claimed that they didn't have it and therefore
wouldn't honor it. PNC called back late yesterday stating that they

still had it and would hold onto it. The trustee information can be

found on the attached document. Coincidently, since PNC believed that
someone else possessed the STA, they never charged us the $2500 annual
fee but will now going forward.

It is amazing how such a simple request can cascade into a near crisis.
Sorry for the delay
Jon Young

----- Original Message-----

From: Marjorie McLaughlin [mailto:MMM3@nrc.gov]
Sent: Monday, August 29, 2005 10:40 AM

To: Young, Jon

Cc: John Kinneman

Subject: RE: Financial Assurance for NRC Licenses

Mr Young:

| hope that the difficulties you faced at your facility the other week

have been resolved. | am again contacting you to inquire about the
Schedule C and when this item will be sent. If there is a financial
department at your company through which you would prefer me to go,
please provide a contact and | will go that route. My management has
requested that | receive this document by the end of this week. Again,
the Schedule C is simply a sentence stating what are the trustee's fees.

Please fax this item to my attention at: 610-337-5269
Thank you for your continued assistance in this matter,

Marjorie McLaughlin
USNRC Region |
Decommissioning Branch
610-337-5240 (phone)
610-337-5269 (fax)

>>>"Young, Jon" <Jon_Young@steris.com> 08/17/05 9:29 AM >>>
Sorry

With all good intentions to take care of this item this week, | am now
onsite at a facility dealing with a source rack issue that has caused a
shutdown of the facility from Monday night and projected through



tomorrow noon. [I'll give you a call during a break period today.
Jon

----- Original Message-----

From: Marjorie McLaughlin [mailto:MMM3@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2005 7:28 AM

To: Young, Jon

Cc: John Kinneman

Subject: Financial Assurance for NRC Licenses

Mr. Young:

| have been trying to get in touch with you regarding the email and

letter | recently sent requesting a Schedule C for the Standby Trust
Agreement for your NRC Licenses. Please provide me with an expected
date of completion for providing the Schedule C. You may fax it to my
attention at 610-337-5269. The original email | sent to you is attached
below with detail on the information we require. Please call or email

me today so that | know you received this.

Thank you for your cooperation,
Marjorie McLaughlin

Health Physicist
USNRC Region |
Decommissioning
610-337-5240
610-337-5269 (fax)

CC: "John Kinneman" <JDK@nrc.gov>
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