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C.T. SOIL & MATERIALS ENGINEERING INC.

CONSULTING ENGINEERS

March 24, 2005

U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Region Il

2443 Warenville Road, Sulte 210
Lisle, linois 60532-4352

Feax: (630) 515-1259

Attention: Mr. Loren Hueter

Re: License No, 21-32136-01

Dear Sir.

Further to our recent conversations, we enclose a copy of our February 17, 2005 ietter
which supercades our January 31, 2004 letter which is in your possession. Also attached, for
your information, is an emall of my correspondence with Ms. Diane Dandois of the NRC. In
summary, we are not requesting the withdrawal of our license &t this time.

We thank you for the information you sent via faceimile transmittal on March 22, 2005 as
this information will prove useful to us should be elect to withdrawn our licensae this fall. A reply to
your March 22, 2005 facsimile tranemittal will be sent under saparate cover.

Yours truly,

C.T. 8ol & Materials Engineering Inc.

= 47%_>
T. ODwyer, P.E,
Consulting Engineer

Enclosures

Int D.H.
AT.

GEOTECHNICAL ENGINEERING AND CONSTRUGTION MATERIALS INSPECTION & TESTING
18111 West 10 Mile Road +Unit A-10 «. Southfield, Michigan - 48075
Phone: 248-388-0730 » Fax: 248-366-0791 + o mall: cisoli@wincom.net +  hitpZwww.wincam.netktsoll
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February 17, 2005 ?\L
U.8. Nudlear Regulatory Commission C

Licanse Fee & Accounts Recefvable Branch
P.O. Box 954514
St Louis, MO 631854514

e: 5 An Is
Pesiod 10/1/2004-9/30/2005

Invoice No AM0S09-05
License No, 21-32136-01

Dear Sir or Madan:
Enclosed, please find a check in the amount of $507.06. We also enciose a copy of your invoice
along with our "Certification of Small Entity Status”, which reduces the payment to $600.00.
The additional $7.05 Is related to interest and penalties.
We trust this letter is sufficient to rescind our letter of January 31, 2005. we will delay our
decision to withdraw our license untl the Fall of 2006.
Should you have any questions, do not hesitate to contact the undersigned.
Youre truly,
C.T. 80N & Mateorials Engineering Inc.

T. O'Dwysr, PE.
Geotachnical Engineer

Enclosures
¢cc: NRC — Region lil (cover ontly)
Ms. Jan Strasma

int. AT.
D.H.
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Tom O'Dwyer —

From: Tom O'Dwyer [todwyer@ctsoil.com]

Sent: February 8, 2005 2:42 PM

To: ‘Diane Dandols'; ‘General Email

Ce: ‘athibert@ctsofl.com’, 'Dave Hailiday’

Subject: RE: Please call NRC regarding your NRC materials license c

Thank Diane ¢

You have been most helpful, We will send you the Small Business form and payment. I
think, since we will have to pay 50% as a minimum, we will process 100% of the payment
and keep our licence active until the Fall of 2005, at which time we will complete Form

314 "Certificate of Disposition of Materials™, unless the business environment changes
for us.

Once again, thank you for your help.

Tom O'Dwyexr, P.Eng., P.E.

Soil & Materials Engineering Inc.

2000 Legacy Park Dr.

Windsor, Ontario, N8W 586

ph: (519) 966-8863 fx: (519) 966-8870
or

C.T. Soil & Materials Engineering Inc.
19111 West 10 Mile Road, Unit A-10
Southfield, Michigan, 48075

ph: (248) 386-0730 fx: (248) 386-0731

http://vwww.ctsoil.com

email: todwyer@ctsoil.com

~=---0riginal Message-=-~-

From: Diane Dandois [mailto:DBD@nrc.gov]

Sent: February 8, 2005 2:25 PM

To: General Email

Cc: athibertéctsoil.com; 'Dave Halliday'

Subject: RE: Please call NRC regarding your NRC materials license

I have not received the letter yet or the small entity form. The address to which you

mailed the letter is our lockbox bank in St. Louis. Could you please fax the small entity
form to 301-415-5387.

The form you need to file for termination is an NRC Form 314 "Certificate of Disposition
of Materials." I cannot currently get ocut to the Public Web Site www.nrc.gov and do not
know whether the form is easily searched and retrieved. I havae a copy and could fax it

to you if you have a fax number available. Let me know.

Furthex, since you held the license on October 1, 2004, the beginning of fiscal year
2005, you are subject to payment of the annval fees. However, since you have filed for
termination between the window of Octobex 1 and Mareh 31, we do offer a 50% proxation of
invoices for which a termination request is filed during that window.

Thus, if you are approved for the small entity of $500 based on average annual gross
xeceipts of the entire business, not just the nuclear portion, including the revenue of

any subsidiaries and affiliates (parent company), and then get the 50% proration, the
amount due for half of FY 2005 will be $250.

Absent payment being received within the next 30 days, we will refer the delinquent debt
to the U. §. Dapartment of the Treasury for collection, administrative offset, tax refund
offsel, credit bursau reporting, etc. Their fees can be as much as 35% on top of tha NRC

1
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doos
debt. Thus, it would be best to get the payment made to NRC in a timely manner.
If you have any questions, please call me at 301-415-7544.
I hope this information is helpful. ? lv

Diane Dandois, NRC CO

>>> "General Email®” <ctsoil@ctsoil.com> 02/08/05 11:08AM >>>
Diane,

Yes, we are having difficulties with our phone lines in ocur Southfield, MI office. We
hope the phone situation will be corrected today.

Did you receive our letters from last week? Just in case you did not, a copy of the Word
files i= attached for your reference.

As you can seq, these letters were addressed to persons other than you, hopefully they
will get to your desk.

Please let me know if you have additional cquestions, and I will call you.

Tom O'Dwyer, PF.Eng., EB.E.

Sgil & Materials Engineering Inc.
2000 Legacy Park Dr.

Windsor, Ontario, N8W 5s56

ph: (519) 966-8863 £fx: (519) 966-8870

or
C.T. Soll & Materiala Engineering Inc.
18111 West 10 Mile Road, Unit A-10 ]

Southfield, Michigan, 48075
ph: (248) 386~0730 fx: (248) 386-0731

http://www.ctsoil.com

email: todwyer@ctsoil.com

----- Original Message—==--

From: Diane Dandois [mailto:DBD@nrc.gov]
Sent: February 8, 2005 10:14 AM

To: ctsoil@ctsoil.com

Subject: Please call RRC regsrding your NRC materimls license

Can’'t reach you by phone. My number is 301-415-7544 and I need to discugs your NRC
matarials license and the unpaid annual fee.

Diane Dandois
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