Sehivmberger Technology Coiperation

260 Gilhingham Lane, MO7 schlumhel‘gep

Sugar Land, TX 77478
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March 19, 2004 o
| MAR 22 gg
Nuclear Regulatory Agency T e
Region IV . Sl
611 Ryan Plaza Drive, Suite 400 \\w«m_m

Arlington, Texas 76011

RE: Source Abandonment in the BP America Production Company: Corona 32-30

Dear Sir or Madam:

This letter is to confirm the abandonment of irretrievable sources in a well in accordance with Part 39,

Section 39.77(d). Information for this abandonment is attached.

Please let me know if you require any further information.

Sincerely,

%}wq/%w(

Thomas S. Wood
Deputy Radiation Safety Officer
Schlumberger Technology Corporation



Source Abandonment in BP America Production Company

Date of Occurrence:
Source ldentification:

Well Identification:

Seal Results:

Recovery Attempts:
Depth of Sources:
Depth of Well:
Identification:
Reports:

Initial Telephone
Contact:

Well: Corona 32-30

03/08/2004

1.7 Ci, Cs 137, Density Source, Serial # A5097

BP America Production Company

Well: Corona 32-30

Field: Jonah

API Number: 49-035-2320

260' of 16.0 ppg cement with Red Oxide Dye was spotted on top of the 4 1/2” drill
pipe at 8,171°. 1,148 of drill pipe remains in the hole from 8,171 - 9,318". Set 419" of
16.0 ppg cement as a ST plug from 5,981'- 6,400

Multiple attempts from 2/26/2004 to 03/08/2004

1.7 Ci, Cs 137, Density Source, Serial # A5097 @ 8,240° MD

10,871°

Plaque as required by Part 39 ordered and will be attached to the well.

No other agency will receive a copy of this report.

Jack Whitten, NRC Region IV on 03/02/2004 @ 0945 CST.
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Database File: bpamp.db
Dataset Pathname: pass5
Presentation Format:  gr-ccl

Dataset Creation: Sat Mar 06 15:17:17 2004 by Log Warrior 7.0 Standar
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SEALED SOURCE LEAK TEST CERTIFICATE

LTSRS
AN dly

M. DENNIS
SCHLUMBERGER WELL SERVICES .
80 RELIANCE ROAD CUSTOMER #: 953
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ACOUNT #: 953

RADIONULCIDE: __CS-137 SOURCE CODE: GSRJ

ACTIVITY: 1.7 - SERIAL NO: A5097

WIPE DATE: __10/2/2003

EFFICENCY: _0.95

GROSS CPM: 38 BKG CPM: 16 NET CPM: 22

NET CPM
EFF X 2.22x10"6 DPM/u ClI

= MICROCURIE

THE ABOVE SOURCE WIPE TEST HAS BEEN ASSAYED IN ACCORDANCE WITH OUR
RADIOACTIVE MATERIAL LICENSE AND THE APPROPRIATE REGULATORY
REQUIREMENTS. THE REGULATIONS DEFINE A LEAKING SOURCE AS ONE FROM
WHICH AN APPROPRIATE WIPE TEST HAS REMOVED 0.005 (5.0X10E-3)
MICROCUIRE OR MORE OF ACTIVITY.

.... .I?.?.?C?.?‘?:?

188,88,
PP

e

THE REMOVABLE ACTIVITY WAS: 1.04E-05 MICROCURIE
3.86E-01 Bq
ASSAY NO.: 10/25/2003 110 DATE: 10/26/2003
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CORONA 32-30

Sublett County, Wyoming
APl Number: 49-035-23420

Wellbore
Schematilc

A

2,504 Surface Casing

7-7/8" Open Hole

I
1
[
1
|
|
|
|
|
|
)
| N._5,981' Begin Side-track

5,981" A RN
L -

16.0ppg Class G | T See Attached
Cement | R _ e
L Directional

6,400" | P
' rogram
]
)
]

7.910" 8 - 260' Class G 16.0ppg Cement

: Dyed Red

8,170' & ]
i :w'i \ \ i--- 8,240' R/A Source
Y
; i_,,‘ _+-- 8,171'- 9,318 Clean-Out Tools
P T Abandoned in Hole (see details)
! !
) )
| |
' 10.9ppg !
i mud |
] [}
) |
! !

____________________________________________________________________

‘DRILLING TOOLS ABANDONED IN HOLE (Details)
i(From Top to Bottom)

i Partial Joint of 4-1/2" Hevi-wate Drill Pipe

i~ 23 Joints of 4-1/2" Hevi-wate Drill Pipe

E- CrossOver sub (4-1/2" NC46 x 4-1/2" IF)

i- 6-1/2" Drilling Jars

i- CrossOver sub (4-1/2" NC46 x 4-1/2" IF)

I- 21 Joints of 4-1/2" Hevi-wate Drill Pipe

i- Bit sub (4-1/2" NC46 x 4-1/2" REG)

I- 7-7/8" Bit




200 ft

Scale 1 cm

<- True Vertical Depth (feet)
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7200
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10000
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11200

BP AMERICA

Location: WYOMING
Field: SUBLETTE COUNTY

~Installation:

Sec.30-T29N-R108W

Slot: Slot#8 CORONA 32-30
Well: CORONA 32-30
Wellbore: CORONA 32-30 (PWB) ST

WELL PROFILE DATA

T.D. & End of Hold - 10775.00 Tvd, 400.00 N 400.00-W

PURVEY POINT - 82/13/04 - 6.24 Inc, 5784.00 Nld 5751 42 TVP‘ 402.?2 VS 1 1 1

[ i i 1 i 1 i 1 i ]

Point MD Inc Azi TVD North | East | deg/100ft | V. Sect
KOP 6000.00 | 6.72 | 304.42 | 5973.00 | 219.76 | -383.08 0.00 426.27
Target 6060.00 | 5.65|299.26 | 6032.65 | 223.19 | -388.56 2.00 43257
End of Build/Turn | 6357.05 | 6.02 | 0.45 | 6328.43 | 245.93 | -401.21 2.00 457.60
End of Hold 767548 (6.02| 0.45 | 7639.58 | 384.20 | -400.12 0.00 554.60
Target 7976.48 | 0.00 | 0.00 | 7940.00 | 400.00 | -400.00 2.00 565.69
T.D. & End of Hold | 10811.48 | 0.00 | 0.00 | 10775.00 | 400.00 | -400.00 0.00 565.69
i Scale 1cm = 40 ft East (feet) ->
. 640 -560 480 400 -320 240 -160 -80 O 80

32-30 TARGET

f Hold - 6.02 Inc, 7675.48 Md, 7639.58 Tvd, 554.60 VS

S/C Tie On & Kick off Point - 6.72 Inc, 6000.00 Md, 5973.00 Tvd, 426.27 VS

End of Hold - 7639.58 Tvd, 384.20 N 400.12 W

32-30 TARGET

Tie ony - 5973.00 Tvd, 219.76 N 383.08 W

-800 -400 -0 400 800 . 1200
sae1am=200¢ Vertical Section (fee

1600

2000
t) ->

2400

Azimuth 315.00 with reference 0.00 N, 0.00 E from Slot #8 CORONA 32-30

Surface 0.00 N O.

SURVEY POINT - 02/17/04 - 1.85 Inc, 8953.00 Md, 8922.03 TVD, 526.88 VS

FINAL MWD SURVEY - 1.49 Inc, 10070.00 Md, 10038.55 TVD, 529.71 VS

480

400

320

240

160

80

(3933)yrioN ->

uwo | sjesg

Hov=

Created by :  Planner
Date plotted :

8-Mar-2004

Rig Datum: Datum #1

Plot reference is CORONA 32-30 (PW8) ST.
Ref weilpath is CORONA 32-30 (PWP#1).
Coordinates are in fest referance Stot #8 CORONA 32-30.
True Vertical Depths are reference Rig Datum.
Measured Depths are reference Rig Datum.

Rig Datum to Mean Sea Level: 7086.00 ft.
Plot North is aigned to TRUE North




F-848

P.002

T-814

2813867838

&Y

Schedule.

able or responsible for any loss, costs, damages, or
agents or employees. These interpretafions are aiso

Comments

d on Inferences from electrical or cther measurements and we ¢annot and do not guarantee the accuracy or correciness

ot, except in the case of gross or williull negligence on our part, be i
subject to our general terms and conditions set out in our current Price

yone resuiting from any interpretation made by any of our officers;,

From-BP

Mar-18-2004 02:48pm

\ . (—— GAMMA RAY
A\ WELLSERY LOG
Intervention Services
Company BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO.
Well CORONA 32-30
3 Field JONAH
§ , |Country SUBLETTE state  WYOMING
< 1 Ofther Services
g T E Location
< 2
X Zm
L OQoD E
moO-Sw -
> Elevation
g & |Permanent Datum GL Elevation 7086 |« @ 7109
—_ £ o .B.
g % = 3 ¥ |LogMeasured From KB23.0FT DF. 7108
8 = 2 8 # |odlingMeasured From KB GL. 7086
Date 03-06-04
Run Number ONE
Dapth Dxiller 10871
Depth Logger 9312
Bottom Logged Interval 9312
Top Lag Interval SURF
Open Hole Size A
Type Fluld MUD
Denglty / Viscosity N/A
Max. Recorded Temp. 172 F
Estimated Cement Top. NA
Time Well Ready 14:00
Time Logper on Botlom 15.00
Equipment Number 23453
Location ROCK SPRINGS
Recorded By MoCOYISHERIDAN
Winessed By MR. TIM ANDERSON
Borehole Record Tublng Record
Run Number Bit From To Size Weight From To
Casing Record Size VRt Top Botiom
Surface String
Prot. String
Produclion String
Liner

of any Interpretaton, and we shall n

<<< Fold Herg >>>

expenses inculired or sustained by an

Allinterpretaiions are opinions base

SOURCE LOCATED @ 8232'
TD @ 9312'

RUN GR LOG TO LOCATE OPEN HOLE SOURCE

| -

MAIN PASS

Intervention Services
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Database File: bpamp.db
Dataset Pathname: passf,
Presentation Format: gr-cc _
Dataset Creation: Sat Mar 06 14:54:20 2004 by Log Warrior 7.Q Standar
Charted by: Depth in Feet scaled 1:240
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Oilfield Services

A Schiumberger

Tel  281-285-8500

Graphics N Metal March 19, 2004
1200 Clausel Street

Mandenville, LA. 70448

(504) 669-6082

(985) 727-2165 (Fax)

Attn: Ernie Jilek,
Please construct the standard abandonment plague with the following information:

Company: BP America Production Company
Well Name: Corona 32-30

Field: Jonah

County: Sublette

State: Wyoming

API#: 49-035-23420

Date of Abandonment: 03/08/2004

Weli Depth: 10,871

Plug Back Depth: 5,891’

Top of Fish: 8,17V

Sources Abandoned: 1.7 Ci, Cs 137, Density Source, @ 8,240° MD

Special Instructions: DO NOT RENTER THIS WELL BEFORE CONTACTING
SCHLUMBERGER TECHNOLOGY COPORATION OR
REGION IV OF THE NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION

Please forward to me the completed plaque and invoice.

Respectfully,

' Tom S. Wood



x x x COMMUNICATICON RESULT REPORT ( MAR. 19.2004 12:09PM )

X ox X

FAX HEADER:
TRANSMITTED/STORED . MAR. 19. 2004 12:02PM
EEEE_IYIC_)?E ____________ C_)EIE(_)N ____________ ADDRESS RESULT PAGE
084 MEMORY TX a3 :919857272165 ok 22

ACSIMILE CONNECTION

Olitield Servicas
fiadistion/Explosives Compliance

2 g Y e Schiumbherger
Tel 281-285.7480

Fax 281-205-8526

Fax Date: March 18, 2004
To Ernie Jilek Fax: 985-727-2165
From Tom Waod Tel: 281-285-7460

Fax: 281-285-8526

Subject Abandonment Plaque Pages 2 (including cover)

Ernie,

Request for abandonment plagque, wall information follows.
Regards,

_—10m

This transmigsion is intended only for the uss of tha individual or antity to which #t is sddressed and may contain information that
Is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosura, distribution or
copying of this information g strictly prohibited. If you have recelved this transmission in error, please notify us immediataly by
telephone and return the original documents to us at the address above via the United States Postal Services.



Schiumberger

RADIATION FISHING & ABANDONMENT REPORT

O Offshore (OCS Waters) [ Land or State Lease Waters
Date Monday 01 March Time 15:00

Company Name (Full Name) BP America Production Company

Well Name or (OCS-G No. or State Lease No.)  Corona 32-30

Offshore St/Field Name: Jonah Rig Name H&P-179

API Number (If Available or CLSD) 49-035-23420

Location of Lease NE Y Sec 30, T29N, R108W

County or Parish  Sublette State Wyoming
District Rock Springs Sales Engr Harry Singh
TD 10760 ft Hole Size 77/8” Deviation
Casing Depth 2514 Casing Size 8 5/8”
Depth of Fish (Top) 10056.4 ft (Bottom) 10100 fi
Source Type (1) GSR-J Source Type (2)
Source Activity (1) 63 Gbgea./ 1.7 Ci ea. Source Activity (2)
Serial No. (1) A5097 Serial No. (2)

Isotope (1) Cs-137 Isotope (2)

Depth (1) 9800 ft Depth (2)

Leak Test Date (1) Leak Test Date (2)
Leak Test Results (1) Leak Test Results (2)

Tool String (Head to Bottom) AIT-M — HRMS — HRCC - HGNS — DTC-H — LEH-QT

Date and Time Stuck Thursday 26 Feb @ 15:00

Date and Time Cement Pumped 03/08/2004 @ 06:00

Hole Conditions Bad hole, Sticky.

Fishing Attempts First attempt doing Cut and Thread Operation

Comments (what happened to get stuck?, etc.,):

Fishing Company: Weatherford

7000 ft of cable left in hole, pipe stuck 2 times coming out with fish.

Long Open Hole section.




NOTE: Regulatory agencies should be contacted ONLY by the Schlumberger Technology Corporation
(STC) Radiation Safety Officer or, if unavailable, his designee.

Notified:

| NRC or O State of :

Name: Jack Whitten Name:
Date: 3/2/2004 Date:
Time: 09:45 a.m. cst Time:

ABANDONMENT

The following is a summary of NRC and/or Agreement States regulations that must be followed when abandoning an irretrievable
well logging source(s). The specific regulations are found in 10 CFR 39.15 and equivalent regulations in Agreement States.

An irretrievable well logging source means any licensed radioactive sealed source that becomes lodged in a well and cannot be
retrieved after reasonable efforts have been made to recover the source(s).

1. Ifa well logging source is irretrievable, the following requirements must be implemented.

a)

b)

)

The source(s) must be immobilized and sealed in place with a cement plug. The cement has to be dyed red in Texas as a
condition of the Texas Railroad Commission (others occasionally).

A mechanical deflection device must be set at some point in the well above the cement plug to prevent inadvertent
intrusion on the source, unless the cement plug and sources(s) are not accessible to any subsequent drilling operations.
The mechanical device can be devices such as a whipstock, old drill bit, etc. For LWD, drillpipe and/or collars left on
top of the BHA usually are approved as a deflection device.

A permanent identification plaque, (supplied by your QHSE Manager) made of stainless steel (or brass, bronze and
monel), must be mounted at the surface of the well unless the mounting of the plaque is not practical (i.e. subsea
completion).

2. The STC RSO (or his designee) will notify the NRC or Agreement State of the abandonment plan developed by/with the client.
The NRC or Agreement State must approve the abandonment plan prior to implementation. The federal and/or state oil and gas
well permitting agency normally will also require that they approve the abandonment plan. The contact with the well permitting
agency is the responsibility of the well owner/client but we should advise him/her of that fact as a courtesy.

3. Ifany changes must be made to the abandonment plan submitted to the NRC or Agreement State, the STC RSO must be
informed so that he/she can get approval of the modification, as appropriate. The actual abandonment must not begin until any
abandonment plan or modification to that plan is approved by the appropriate agency.

4.  The STC Radiation Safety Officer must file a written report with the NRC or Agreement State within 30 days after the
abandonment. The facility management should file a written report within 10 days to the STC Radiation Safety Officer via the
Health, Safety and Environment Manager. The facility report should cover the final abandonment details such as:

a)
b)
<)
d)

e)

Actual date of abandonment.

Any changes in the data sent with the approved abandonment plan.

A new well diagram if different from the that submitted with the approved abandonment plan.

Any information pertinent to the abandonment that the STC RSO may not have for his/her final report.

If all data sent to the STC RSO is still applicable for the final report, an e-mail or fax is to be sent to the STC RSO
confirming that fact so that he/she can be ensured that the data sent to the appropriate agency is totally accurate. Most

facilities send a completely new report since many these documents often are incomplete or are poor quality fax
reproductions.

If there are any questions regarding these procedures, discuss them with your Operations Manager.

FACILITY MANAGEMENT MUST ENSURE THAT THE FINAL ABANDONMENT REPORT IS
SUBMITTED TO THE STC RADIATION SAFETY OFFICER.



Oilfield Services
Radiation/Explosives Compliance

200 Gillingham Lane, MD 7

Sugar Land, Texas 77478 scm"mhepgap

Tel  281-285-7460
Fax 281-285-8526

FaX Date: March 19, 2004
To Ernie Jilek Fax: 985-727-2165
From Tom Wood Tel: 281-285-7460

Fax: 281-285-8526
Subject  Abandonment Plaque Pages 2 (including cover)
Ernie,

Request for abandonment plaque, well information follows.

Regards,

/

Lo lom

This transmission is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, distribution or
copying of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify us immediately by
telephone and return the original documents to us at the address above via the United States Postal Services.



BP
Operations Report

Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING

Page 1 of 3

Report: 24
Date:  2/26/2004

g Accept:
Rig Release:
Spud Date:
WX Date:
Elev Ref:

- 9 - X .
10 838.0 (ft) Casing (MD) 2 504 0 (ft) Daily Mud

(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum. Mud:
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD):10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well:
DOL/DFS/Target: 24.44/21.56/20.70

JENNIFER LUCAS

TOM BOYD

TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179

59,049
20,344
930,781

2/5/2004
ROTARY TABLE (RKB)

KB Elev: 7,108.00 (ft)
Tot. Personnel: 15

Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

Weather:

3DEGSF

urrent Status: CUT & STRIP OVER WIRELINE
4hr Summary: RIH W/DSH- FAILED, RE-RUN DSI LOG, PEX TOOL HUNG UP AT 10098, WO FISH HAND

4hr Forecast

RIG UP TOOLS, CUT & STRIP OVER WL, CATCH FISH, TOOH

ree ays

Last Csg Test Press..
Last BOP Press. Test:
Next BOP Press. Test:

1 ,500 (pSI)
2/8/2004

Last Envir. Incident:

Regulatory Agency Insp:N

2,513.0 (ft)
12.22 (ppg)
28 (psi)
est Pressure: 485 (psi)
chk Tolerance (ppg)

10:00/PIT
10,871. (ft)
111 (°F)
12.50 (ppg)
47 (s/qt)
12.90 (ppg)
25 (cp)

Tlme/Loc
Depth:
Temp:
Density:
Funnel Visc.:
ECD:

10 (1b/100f?)

Pump

4/11/2003

Last Safety Meeting: 2/26/2004

Non-compliance Issued: N

Slow Pump Rates (Circ)
Stroke Rate  Pressure()

Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
Stroke Rate  Pressure Stroke Rate  Pressure()

otating Weig
Pick Up Wt.:
Slack Off Wt.:

Circ. Rate Riser:

Circ. Rate Hole:

Circ. Off Bottom:
Circ. On Bottom:

10 min gels:
Fluid Loss:
HTHP Temp:
HTHP WL:
Cake:

MBT:

y B
Daily Shdlng Hrs 0.00 (hr)

Cum. Bit Hrs:

Ann. Vel. Riser:

Ann. Vel. DC:
Ann. Vel. DP:

13 (Ib/100ft?) | K+:
5.8 (cc/30min)j CaCl2:
150 (°F) NaCl:
22.0 (cc/30min)| Ck:
1.0 (/32") Sand:

20.00 (ppb) HGS:
(ppb) LGS:
0.50 (mL) PHIMf:

np Status -
Eff. |Strokes| Liner Sizej Circ. Rate
iLI 0 0

(ft/min)
459.0 (ft/min
225.2 (ft/min

Solids: 17.96 (%)
Oil: (%)
Water: 82.0 (%)
Oil/Water: /
Daity Cuttings:

Cum. Cuttings:

Lost Downhole:

Lost Surface:

800 (mg/L}
(%)
192.69 (ppb)
44.16 (ppb)
0.20/0.5 (mL/mL)

(bbi)
(bb)
(bbl)
(bb)

Operation

RUN IN HOLE WITH DIPOLE SONIC LOG TOOL, LOGGERS DEPTH =
10870, INCLINOMETER ON TOOL NOT FUNCTIONING

PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH DIPOLE SONIC TOOL, WAIT ON BACKUP
INCLINOMETER FROM ROCK SPRINGS

RUN IN HOLE WITH DIPOLE SONIC TOOL & LOG OUT FROM 10875' -
6000", NO PROBLEMS, LAY DOWN DIPOLE SONIC AND PICKUP
PLATFORM EXPRESS TOOL (PEX), RIH WITH PEX AND LOG OUT
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Daily Operations Report Page 2 of 3

Rig: H&P 179 Report: 24
Event ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/26/2004

WASHOUT/LEDGE AT 10098

10,871

WORK UP AND DOWN IN HOLE WITH PEX TOOL, ABLE TORUN
BACK IN HOLE WITH PEX BUT WILL NOT PULL UP PAST 10098' WITH
MAXIMUM LINE TENSION, CONTINUE TO WORK TOOL WHILE
WAITING ON FISHERMAN AND CUT & STRIP TOOLS

21:30-22:00
10,871

UNLOAD FISHING TOOLS

22:00-22:30
10,871

HELD SAFETY MEETING, REVIEW CUT & STRIP PROCEDURE AND
COMMUNICATIONS

22:30-00:00
08

RIG UP TOOLS FOR CUT & STRIP OPERATION

L CUT & STRIP QVERWIRELINEAT 0600 HRSON 2/04 |

ME-SAVERD

n’r:’rmm_

HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING
HEMPHILL TRUCKING

HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING
RIVERVIEW RENTALS HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING

ESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBUL

Sea Height:
Sea Dir.:
Sea Period:

Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
Rig Rall: Riser Angle/Dir.:
Rig Pitch: Current:

Current Direction:

Prod % Total

% Total

Prod % Total

100.0
85.7%
78 8%

1250 14.3%
8600 21 2%

CT Length:

y Fig: :
CT Cum Ftg: (ft) LSRV 3:
(ft) CT Strength: (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 24
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/26/2004
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BP
Operations Report Page 1 of 3

Rig: H&P 179 Report: 25
Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/27/2004

YR 9 - s . 9 .
10, 838 0 (ft) Casing (MD) 2,504.0 (ft) Daily Mud: Rig Release
(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum. Mud: Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD):10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 25.44/22.56/20.70
JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 16
TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00
Weather: 25 DEGS F

4hr Summary: RU FISHING TOOLS, CUT & STRIP OVER WIRELINE TO 7730', CIRC
4hr Forecast WORK STUCK PIPE

: ree Days:
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003

Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 2/27/2004

No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency lnsp:N Non-compliance Issued: N

Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure()
12.22 (ppg)
28 (psi)

est Pressure: 485 (psi)

ght: y B :
Pick Up Wt.: Daily Slldlng Hrs:0.00 (hr) . i ize| Circ. Rate
Slack Off Wt.: Cum, Bit Hrs: ()
Circ. Rate Riser:
Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser: (ft/min)
Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min
Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min

Time/Loc:  /PIT 10 min gels: 13 (Ib/100ft2) K+: Solids: 17.96 (%)
Depth: 10,871. (ft) Fluid Loss: 5.8 (cc/30min)j CaCl2: Oil: (%)
Temp: 111 (F) HTHP Termp: 150 (°F) NaCl: Water: 82.0 (%)
Density: 12.50 (ppg) HTHP WL: 22.0 (cc/30min)| Cl-: 800 (mglL) Oii/water: /
Funnel Visc.: 47 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: 12.90 (ppg) MBT: 20.00 (ppb) HGS: 192.69 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
25 (cp) ime: (ppb) LGS: 44.16 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
10 (Ib/100ft2) : 0.50 (mL) P/Mf: 0.20/0.5 (mU/mL) | Lost Surface: (bbl)

Operation

RIG UP TOOLS FOR CUT & STRIP OPERATION, CUT WIRELINE, PICK

; UP OVERSHOT & GRAPPLE

04:30-07:00 | 2. CUT & STRIP OVER WIRELINE, RUN IN WITH 6 STANDS WHEN LOST
10,871 AR PRESSURE TO WIRELINE TRUCK WINCH

WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER MECHANIC AND PARTS FROM ROCK

SPRINGS

INSPECT, TEST & WORK ON SCHLUMBERGER WIRELINE TRUCK AIR

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:12:01 PM
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Daily Operations Report Page 2 of
Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 25
.eII: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/27/2004
rom-10 rs ase| las clivity ode peration
Op. Depth | (hr)
11:30-22:30 | 11.00|PROD1{ FISH RiH N CUT & STRIP OVER WIRELINE TO 7730
10,871
22:30-00:00 | 1.50 |PROD1| FISH CRR N PICK UP CIRCULATING SUB & CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
ormation orm. 1op , gmd Gas X np Gas
tem nits sage n Han tem nits sage n Hani
IDIESEL GAL 1516 76228PROPANE GAL 0
mpany 0. ours mpany 0. ours mpany 0. ours
BP 0| 12.00MHELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
INOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 ELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 10| 120.0
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 1] 12.00MICKEY'S WELDING 0 ESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBUL 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 ICORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 1 3.00QROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER C 0
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0j SCHLUMBERGER 3| 48.0
nchor
Tension | 1 | i ! I 1 | I | |
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
DL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
Comments:
ann ange of Scope ota otal Cost
Phase Prod % Total] NPT % Total]| WOW_ % Total Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Totall Hours UsD
PRE 3150 100.0 31.50
URF 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% 87.50
PROD1 320.50 74.4%| 110.00 25.6% 430.50
0, 0, 0, 0, 0, 0,
indow lop: (Tt : n aity Ftg: (it : cp
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CTID: (in) CT CumFtg: (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 25
ell: CORONA 32-30 Event:
! - ONA o

ORIG DRILLING Date: 2/27/2004
pe DEVELOPMEN
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BP
Operations Report

H&P 179
ORIG DRILLING

Page 1 of 3

Report: 26
Date:  2/28/2004

Operator: BP Rig:
CORONA 32-30 Event:

g
Rig Release:
Spud Date:
WX Date:
Elev Ref:

10 838.0 (ft) Casmg (MD) 2 504 0 (ft) Daily Mud
(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum. Mud:
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD):10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well:
DOL/DFS/Target: 26.44/23.56/20.70
JENNIFER LUCAS
TOM BOYD
TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179

62,974
22,781
972,821

2/5/2004
ROTARY TABLE (RKB)

KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Tot. Personnel: 16

Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

20 DEGS F

Program:
Weather:

Supervisor:

Current Status: WORK STUCK PIPE FREE & POH WITH FISH
4hr Summary: CIRCULATEWORK STUCK PIPE, PUMP H20 PILL, PIPE FREED,CUT N STRIP OVER WL
4hr Forecast STRIP OVER WL, LATCH FISH, POH WITH WL, TOH & LAY DOWN FISH

L amrnern

—'L‘Tiwnlfm—

1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003

2/8/2004

Last Csg Test Press.:

Last BOP Press. Test:

Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 2/28/2004
Non-compliance Issued: N

Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)

Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate Pressure()

No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency insp:N
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ)

Stroke Rate _Pressure()

FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (it}
FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)

est Pressure: 485 (psi)

. |Strokes Llner Size

y B
Daily Slldmg Hrs 0.00 (hr)
Cum. Bit Hrs: () Q

Slack Off Wt.:
Circ. Rate Riser:
Circ. Rate Hole:
Circ. Off Bottom:
Circ. On Bottom:

Ann. Vel. Riser:
Ann. Vel. DC:
Ann. Vel. DP:

(ft/min)
459.0 (ft/min
225.2 (ft/min})

18:30/FLW
10,871, (ft)

Tlme/Loc
Depth:

9 (Ib/100ft2) Solids:
8.8 (cc/30min) Oit:

10 min gels:
Fluid Loss:

Temp:
Density:
Funnel Visc.:
ECD:

98 (°F)
10.90 (ppg)
40 (s/qt)
(ppg)

150 (°F)
36.0 (cc/30min)
2.0 (/32"
15.00 (ppb)

HTHP Temp:
HTHP WL:
Cake:

MBT:

600 (mg/L)
(%)
119.46 (ppb)

19 (cp)
9 (Ib/100ft2)

(ppb)
0.60 (mL)

25.86 (ppb)
0.20/0.5 (mL/mL)

Water:
Qil/Water:

Daily Cuttings:
Cum. Cuttings:
Lost Downhole:
Lost Surface:

CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP

PICK UP STAND & RECONNECT WIRELINE, MAKE UP STAND, TRY TO
RIH BUT PIPE STUCK, WORK STUCK PIPE

BREAK OFF & STAND BACK ONE STAND, HANG OFF WIRELINE
INSIDE DP, PICK UP SINGLE & MAKE UP TOP DRIVE

CIRC & WORK STUCK PIPE, PUMP 40 BBL FRESH WATER SWEEP &

Printed: 3/16/2004 2:12:45PM



BP
Operations Report Page 2 of 3

Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 26
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/28/2004

03.00-09.30 . WATER SWEEP & WORK STUCK PIPE - NO SUCCESS
10,871

WORK STUCK PIPE AND REDUCE MW TO 11.0 PPG, DRILL STRING

STARTED TO FREE UP AT NOON, CONTINUE WORKING PIPE AND

CONDITION MUD, ESTIMATE FREE DOWN TO 5200" BASED ON

STRETCH

BREAK OFF TOP DRIVE & CIRCULATING SUB, THREAD THROUGH

SINGLE JT OF DP & RE-ATTACH WIRELINE, WORK PIPE UP & DOWN

WITH LONGER STROKE, STILL UNABLE TO FREE PIPE BELOW 5200°

DISCONNECT WIRELINE AND HANG OFF INSIDE DP, SCREW IN WITH

10,871 TOP DRIVE, CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WITH UP TO 10 ROUNDS

OF TORQUE - NO GAIN

20:30-22:00 | 1. PUMP 120 BBL FRESH WATER PILL & SPOT INSIDE SURFACE
10,871 CASING, WORKED PIPE FREE ABOUT HALFWAY THROUGH

PLACEMENT OF FRESH WATER PILL

22:00-00:00 | 2. BREAK OFF TOP DRIVE & CIRCULATING SUB, THREAD THROUGH
10,871 SINGLE JT OF DP & RE-ATTACH WIRELINE, CUT & STRIP OVER

MR

[ WORK PIPE FREE X PO WITH l:ﬂei.lur:«.-l.l.&lomv&uoﬂ—
—Tﬂ‘ﬂmﬁ Mz

HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING
HEMPHILL TRUCKING BAKER HUGHES INTEQ
ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER C
HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC

Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.:
Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:

Current Direction:

ange of Scope

Prod % Total % Total] WOW % Totall Prod % Total] NPT % Total
. 100.0
75.00 85.7%| 12.50 14.3%
70.5%| 134.00 29.5%

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:12:45 PM
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CORONA 32-30

BP
Operations Report

Rig: H&P 179
Event  ORIG DRILLING

y 91
; (in) CT CumFtg: (ft)
CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength:  (psi)

LSRV 3:

Drill Solids:

Page 3 of 3

Report: 26
Date:  2/28/2004

(%)

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:12:45 PM



BP

Daily Operations Report Page 1 of
perator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 27
ell: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/29/2004
D : ,871. asing Size: . in osts in: ig Accept:
Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (it} Daily Mud: 1,641 Rig Release:
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum.Mud: 64,614 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
uth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 21,081 WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD):10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 993,902 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 27.44/24.56/20.70
Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 16
Supervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00
Weather: -4 DEGS F
urrent Status: WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS
4hr Summary: CUT & STRIP, LATCH FISH, PULL 3000' PARTED WL, WORK DP FREE,TOH, WO TOOLS
4hr Forecast: PU WIRELINE SPEAR, RABBET DP & TIH, FISH FOR LOST WIRELINE
ays Since Las : ree Days:
Last Csg Test Press.. 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 2/29/2004
No. Stop Cards: 33 Regulatory Agency Insp:N Non-compliance Issued: N
Pump qT Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure{) | Stroke Rate  Pressure()
FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)
est Pressure: 485 (psi)
Kick Tolerance: (ppg)
aily: otating Weight: aily Bit Hrs: r um us - Drilling and Riser
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.: Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump [Type| Eff. StrokesIfirg\er Size| Circ. Rate
OB (min): Slack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs: 0 4] () 0
OB (max): Circ. Rate Riser:
RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser: (ftmin)
[RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min)
org. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/mi
ype: sec gels: a: mg. : m
Time/lLoc: 20:00/FLW 10 min gels: 8 (Ib/100ft?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 13.00 (%)
Depth: 10,871. (ft) Fluid Loss: 6.2 (cc/30min)| CaCl2: (%) Qil: (%)
Temp: 83 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 87.0 (%)
Density: 11.30 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min)| Cl- 600 (mg/L) Oil/water: /
Funnel Visc.: 39 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: (ppg) MBT: 15.00 (ppb) HGS: 134.10 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
PV: 16 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 35.00 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
YP: 6 (Ib/100ft?)| PM: 0.60 (mL) PTIMf: 0.20/0.5 (mL/mL) Lost Surface: (bbi)
Tom-10 s ase) tas| ctivity e peration
Op. Depth | (hr)
00:00-03:00 | 3.00 { PROD1| FISH RH N CUT & STRIP OVER WIRELINE TO 10127, LATCH ONTO LOGGING
10,871 TOOL WITH GRAPPLE, CONFIRM LATCHED ON TO FISH FROM LINE
TENSION
03:00-06:00 | 3.00 |[PROD1| FISH POH N PULL WIRELINE OUT OF ROPE SOCKET & SPOOL ONTO DRUM,
10,871 DISCOVERED WIRELINE PARTED AT ABOUT 3100' LEAVING
APPROXIMATELY 7000' OF WIRELINE INSIDE DRILL PIPE
06:00-06:30 | 0.50 |PROD1| FISH WRKPIP N CIRCULATE & WORK STUCK PIPE FREE

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:13:1S PM



BP
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 27
Event ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/29/2004

06: 30-08 001 1. PULL OUT OF HOLE CAREFULLY WITH FISH
10,871

08:00-11:00 | 3. DRILL MUD U-TUBING UP DRILL PIPE, SCREW-IN WITH TOP DRIVE,
10,871 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, PUMP WEIGHTED TRIP SLUG

11:00-15:00 | 4. POH, FOUND WIRELINE IN LAST JOINT OF HWDP, INSTALL T-BAR
10,871 CLAMP

15:00-16:00 | 1. REVIEW PROCEDURE/JSA ON RETRIEVING WIRELINE, PULL OUT
10,871 AND RECOVER ONLY ABOUT 30' OF WIRELINE, MISSING 7000' OF

WIRELINE & 20' OF BOTTOM PART OF PEX TOOL WHICH CONTAINS

A RADIOACTIVE SOURCE IN THE DENSITY TOOL PORTION

16:00-17:00 | 1. LAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS PLUS RECOVERED PORTION OF PEX
10,871 TOOL, BREAK OFF SUB FROM TIW VALVE

17:00-17:30 | 0. SERVICE RIG
10,871

17:30-18:00 | 0. LAY DOWN LOGGING SHEAVES, CLEAN RIG FLOOR
10,871

WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS TO ARRIVE FROM ROCK SPRINGS

AL ORAWIRELINE FISHING TOLS AL 0O00BRSONZ104 |
—mrlmn_

VIESAVERD

HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING
HEMPHILL TRUCKING

BAKER HUGHES INTEQ
HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC

Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.:
Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:

Current Direction:

Prod % Total % Total] WOW % Totall Prod % Total
31.50 100.0
75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3%

67.0%| 158.00 33.0%
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Operations Report

Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 27
Event ORIG DRILLING Date:  2/29/2004

y Fig: : cp
(in) CT Cum Ftg:  (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
CT Length: (ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
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Operations Report

Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179
Event: ORIG DRILLING

Page 1 of 3

Report: 28
Date:  3/1/2004

9
Rig Release
Spud Date:
WX Date:
Elev Ref:

10 838.0 (ft) Casnng (MD) 2 504 0 (ft) Daily Mud:

(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum. Mud:
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD):10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well:
DOL/DFS/Target: 28.44/25.56/20.70

JENNIFER LUCAS

TOM BOYD

TiIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179

67,131
22,524
1,016,426

2/5/2004
ROTARY TABLE (RKB)

KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Tot. Personnel: 17

Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

-4 DEGS F

Program:
Weather:
urrent Status: WORK/PULL OUT OF HOLE AT 2477 (CSG SHOE AT 2504')
4hr Summary: WO FISHING TOOLS, PU & RIH W/SPEAR TO 3067, JAR & WORK OUT TO 2597
4hr Forecast WORK FISHING TOOLS INTO CSG, POH TO CHECK RECOVERY OF WL

ree ays
4/11/2003

Last Csg Test Press.:
Last BOP Press. Test:
Next BOP Press. Test:

1,500 (psi)
2/8/2004

Last Envir, Incident:

Last Safety Meeting: 3/1/2004

No. Stop Cards: 33 Non-compiiance Issued: N
Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)

Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate Pressure()

atory Agency Insp: N
Slow Pump Rates (Circ)
Stroke Rate  Pressure()

2,513.0 (ft)

12.22 (ppg)

28 (psi)
est Pressure: 485 (psi)
chk Tolerance (ppg)

Strokes Lmer Sizej Circ. Rate

Time/Loc:
Depth:
Temp:
Density:

Funnel Visc.:

ECD:

11:00/PIT
10,871. (ft)
76 (°F)
11.20 (ppg)
39 (s/qt)
(pPg)
17 (cp)

5 (Ib/100ft?)

g
Pick Up Wt.:
Slack Off Wt.:
Circ. Rate Riser:
Circ. Rate Hole:
Circ. Off Bottom:
Circ. On Bottom:

10 min gels:
Fluid Loss:
HTHP Temp:
HTHP WL:
Cake:

MBT:

y B :
Daily Slldlng Hrs:0.00 (hr) Eff.

Cum. Bit Hrs:

Ann. Vel. Riser:

Ann. Vel. DC:
Ann. Vel. DP:

7 (Ib/100ft?) | K+:
6.4 (cc/30min)| CaCl2:
150 (°F) NaCl:

(cc/30min)| Cl-:
1.0 (/32") Sand:
13.75 (ppb) HGS:
(ppb) LGS:
0.23 (mL) Pf/Mf:

0 0

(ft/min)
459.0 (ft/miny
225.2 (ft/miny)

800 (mgiL)
0.35 (%)
123.07 (ppb)
41.74 (ppb)
0.02/0.5 (ml/mL)

Solids: 12.96 (%)
Qil: (%)
Water: 87.0 (%)
Qil/Water: /
Daily Cuttings:

Cum. Cuttings:

Lost Downhole:

Lost Surface:

(bbl)
(bbl)
(bbl)
(bbl)

Operation

WAIT ON WIRELINE FISHING TOOLS TO ARRIVE FROM ROCK
SPRINGS

06:00-08:00
10,871

UNLOAD & PICK UP TOOLS TO FISH WIRELINE, FISHING BHA = WIRE
ROPE SPEAR, X-O, DP PUP JT, X-O, STOP SUB, BUMPER SUB, X-O,
FISHING JAR, DP PUP JT, HWDP

TRIP IN HOLE, RABBET EACH STAND TO BE SURE NO WIRELINE
REMNANTS INSIDE, TRIP IN TO 3067' AND STARTED TO SEE TAKING

Printed: 3/16/2004 2:13:44 PM



BP

Daily Operations Report Page 2 of
Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 28
ell: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/1/2004
rom-lo rs ase| Tas clivity ode peration
Op. Depth | (hr)
11:30-17:00 | 5.50 |PROD1| FISH WRKPIP N PICK UP AND SEEING A LOT OF DRAG, WORK OUT OF HOLE WITH
10,871 ONE STAND AND STOOD BACK IN DERRICK, JARRING WITH VERY
SLOW PROGRESS TO 2910, SAW PRESSURE INCREASE AND
STARTED PUMPING MUD AWAY, SHUT DOWN PUMP
17:00-17:30 { 0.50 |PROD1| FISH MAINT N BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE TO KEEP FROM FREEZING UP WHILE
10,871 JARRING
17:30-18:00 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH RIGSER N SERVICE RIG, COMPLETED A DERRICK INSPECTION DUE TO JARRING
10,871 OPERATIONS
18:00-00:00 | 6.00 |PROD1| FISH WRKPIP N CONTINUE WORKING AND JARRING PIPE UP HOLE, HAVING A LOT
10,871 OF DIFFICULTY JARRING/WORKING FISHING TOOLS UP FROM 2597
! vl
ommation om. Top , grnd Gas , np Gas
em ni sage | On Han em nits sage n Han
DIESEL GAL 1389 954 7@PROPANE GAL 0
mpany o. ours ompany o, ours mpany 0. ours
BP 0| 12.008HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
INOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 10]120.0
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 11 12.00§MICKEY'S WELDING 0 ESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBUL 0 ]
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1| 5.0
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1] 4.00@SIMONS PETROLEUM 1| 3.00gROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER C 0
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2] 32.0
nchor
Tension | [ I | I I I I I I |
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
DL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
IComments:
anne ange of Scope ota otal Cost
Phase Prod % Totall NPT % Totall] WOW_% Totall Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Totall Hours UsSD
PRE 31.50 100.0 31.50
ISURF 75.00 85.7%| 12.50 14.3% 87.50
PROD1 320.50 63.8%| 182.00 36.2% 502.50
0, 0, 0, 0, 0,
Indow Top: : n aily Ftg: R cp
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CTID: (in) CT CumFtg: (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength: (psi) Drill Solids: (%)

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:13:44 PM



BP _
Daily Operations Report Page 3 of 3

Rig: H&P 179 Report: 28
Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/1/2004
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 29
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/2/2004

,871.0 (1 g : 8.0 . g .
10,838.0 (ft) 2,504. : Rig Release:
(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum.Mud: 68,368 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 23,763 WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 1,040,190 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 29.44/26.56/20.70
JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 15
TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00
Weather: -3DEGS F
Current Status: TRIP IN TO LOCATE TOP OF FISH & CONDITION HOLE
4hr Summary: JARWORK WL SPEAR OUT OF HOLE, POH & CUT WL IN 75" SECTIONS
4hr Forecast: POH & LD REST OF WIRELINE, TIH W/ BIT TO LOCATE FiISH TOP

L. ammen

HSE x WellContro} ... .. |

Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/2/2004

No. Stop Cards: 30 Requlatory Agency Insp: N Non-compliance Issued: N
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure()
12.22 (ppg)
28 (psi)
est Pressure: 485 (psi)
Kick Tolerance: (ppg)

ght: y Bi : r np Status -

. Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Eff.Ftrokes Liner Size| Circ. Rate
Slack Off Wit.: Cum. Bit Hrs: () 0] [¢) 0
Circ. Rate Riser:

Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser: (ft/min}
Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/miny
Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min

: 0 sec gels: : 4 :

Time/Loc:  12:00/PIT 10 min gels: 6 (Ib/100ft?) : Solids: 1246 (%)
Depth: 10,871. (ft) Fluid Loss: 7.8 (cc/30min) Oik: (%)
Temp: 71 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) Water: 87.5 (%)
Density: 11.00 (ppg) HTHP WL; (cc/30min) : 700 (mg/L) Oil/water: /
Funnel Visc.: 38 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") 0.25 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl}
ECD: (pp9) MBT: 12.50 (ppb) 108.41 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl}
PV: 16 (cp) Lime: (ppb) 46.30 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbly
YP: 6 (Ib/100ft?) : 0.3 (mL) 0.07/0.5 (mb/mL) | Lost Surface: (bbl)

. _OperationpsSuymmary ... |

rom-10 ase| Tas ode Operation

00:00-00:30 | 0. JAR & WORK WIRELINE SPEAR UPHOLE TO 2590'
10,871

PERFORM DERRICK INSPECTION DUE TO JARRING OPERATIONS

JAR & WORK WIRELINE SPEAR UP INTO SURFACE CASING AT 2477

PULL OUT OF HOLE SLOW WATCHING DRAG CLOSELY INSIDE

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:14:08 PM
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 29
Event ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/2/2004

09:30-10:00 | 0. STOP AND HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PULLING FISHING TOOLS
10,871 ABOVE ROTARY TABLE AND CHECKING WIRELINE FOR

RADIOACTIVE READINGS

10:00-10:30 { 0. CLEAR TOOLS FROM RIG FLOOR AND CATWALK FOR LAYING
10,871 DOWN WIRELINE

10:30-11:00 | O. PULL & WORK LAST STAND AND FISHING TOOLS TO RIG FLOOR,
10,871 CLEAR RIG WHILE SCHLUMBERGER CHECKS WIRELINE FOR

RADIOACTIVITY, RECOVER AND REMOVE BIRD'S NEST OF

WIRELINE AROUND SPEAR & JARS, APPEARS LIKE REST OF

MISSING WIRELINE SUSPENDED AND HANGING DOWNHOLE BASED

ON TENSION & WEIGHT

INSTALL T+ BAR CLAMP, PULL CcuTt & LAY DOWN WIRELINE IN 75

-mum-ml:.(nn*omuam1-1::m-nmwm-l-xemml:'mv—
— ‘nrlmn_

VMIESAVERD

RIVERVIEW RENTALS HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING
MICKEY'S WELDING ESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBUL
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ
ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER C
HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC SCHLUMBERGER

Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
Sea Dir.. Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.:

Sea Period: ig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:

Prod % Total % Total
31.50 100.0
75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3%
320 50 60. 9% 206 00 39. 1%

: CT Cum th (ft) LSRV 3:
cT Length: (ft) CT Strength: (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
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BP
Operations Report Page 1 of

Rig: H&P 179 Report: 30
Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/3/2004

10, 838 0 (ft) Casmg (MD) 2 504 0 (ft) Daily Mud: Rig Release

(ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in)  Cum. Mud: Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (it) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 30.44/27.56/20.70

JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (it)

TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 17

TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

Weather: -4 DEGS F

Current Status: TRIP IN HOLE TO LOCATE FISH TOP
4hr Summary: MU BHA, TIH TO 8200 & STUCK, JAR & BACKREAM, CIRC, TRIP OUT OF HOLE
4hr Forecast TOH TO CHECK BHA, TiH TO COND & LOCATE FISH TOP

: ree Days:
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/3/2004

No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency Insp: N Non-compliance issued: N
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke}) Slow Pump Rates (Kill}
FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate Pressure()
FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)

est Pressure: 485 (psi)
chk Tolerance (ppg)

y .
; Daily Sliding Hrs 0.00 (hr)

Stack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs:

Circ. Rate Riser:

Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser: (ft/min)

Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min

Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min

Time/Loc: 13:00/FLW 10 min gels: 9 (Ib/100ft2) K+: Solids: 13.96 (%)
Depth: 10,871. (ft) Fluid Loss: 6.8 (cc/30min)| CaCl2: Oil: (%)
Temp: 66 (°F) HTHP Ternp: 150 (°F) NaCl: Water: 86.0 (%)
Density: 11.30 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min)f Cl-: 700 (mg/L) Oil/Water: /
Funnel Visc.: 48 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: 0.50 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: (pp9) MBT: 12.50 (ppb) HGS: 119.39 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: {bbl)
25 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 53.16 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
12 (Ib/100ft?) | PM: 0.37 (mL) Pf/MF: 0.03/0.4 (mL/mL) | Lost Surface: (bbi)

—ormm_

Activity Operation

BHPULD BREAK & LAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS - FISHING JARS, BUMPER
SUB, X-08, PUPS

RH MAKE UP BIT AND FLOAT SUB, TiH TO 456, PICK UP DRILLING JARS
AND X-O, TIH TO 2524', INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
CIRCULATE HOLE, BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE

TRIP IN HOLE 2524’ - 5100

Printed: 3/15/2004 2:14:38 PM



BP
Daily Operations Report

Page 2 of
perator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 30
.ell: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/3/2004
rom-1o rs ase| Tas| clivity ode peration
Op. Depth | (hr)
07:00-07:30 | 0.50 [PROD1!} FISH CR N BREAK CIRCULATION & CIRC BOTTOMS UP
10,871
07:30-08:30 | 1.00 |PROD1}| FISH RH N TRIP IN HOLE 5100' - 7529
10,871
08:30-09:30 | 1.00 {PROD1| FISH CRR N BREAK CIRCULATION & CIRC BOTTOMS UP
10,871
09:30-10:00 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH RH N TRIP IN HOLE TO 8200' AND TAKING WEIGHT, PICK UP AND SCREW
10,871 IN TOP DRIVE, HAD ROTATION AND CIRCULATION BRIEFLY THEN
STALLED AND PACKED OFF, DRILL PIPE STUCK
10:00-15:00 | 5.00 [PROD1| FISH JAR N JAR UP AND WORK STUCK PIPE, NO PROGRESS, PICK UP SINGLE
10,871 AND JAR DOWN, GOT 4 MOVEMENT, CONTINUE TO JAR UP AND
DOWN & GAINING SOME MOVEMENT
15:00-19:00 | 4.00 {PROD1| FISH | REAMBK N REGAINED PIPE ROTATION AND BACKREAMED OUT TO 7948
10,871
19:00-20:30 | 1.50 |PROD1|{ FISH CR N REGAINED CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE HOLE AND MIX TRIP SLUG
10,871
20:30-00:00 | 3.50 {PROD1| FISH PCH N PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 2176' - NO PROBLEM GETTING INTO
ormation om. Top , grnd Gas , np Gas
tem nits sage n Han tem nits sage n Han
DIESEL GAL 1912 47378PROPANE GAL 0
mpany 0. ours mpany 0. ours mpany 0. ours
BP 0{ 12.00HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 11 2.0
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 101 120.0!
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLING 1] 12.00§MICKEY'S WELDING 0 ESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBUL 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1] 8.0
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 1 2.00gROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER C 0
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 HLUMBERGER 2| 32.0
nchor
Tension | | [ | [ il L | 1 1
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
DL: Sea Dir. Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
omments:
anne ange of Scope otal otal Cosf
Phase Prod % Totall NPT % Total| WOW % Totall Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Total§ Hours usD
PRE 31.50 100.0 31.50 4
SURF 75.00 85.7%| 12.50 14.3% 87.50
PROD1 320.50 58.2%| 230.00 41.8% 550.50
0, 0 0, 0, 0 0,
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Daily Operations Report

Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 30
Event ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/3/2004

. ly Fig: : P
CcTiD: (in) CT Cum Ftg:  (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
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BP
Daily Operations Report

[
\Current Status: CIRCULATE & EVEN OUT MUD WEIGHT TO 11.0 PPG
24hr Summary: TOH, INSPECT BIT & BHA, TIH, TAKING WEIGHT AT 6020', W&R 6020'-7970'

\
| Page 1 of 3}
kOperator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 31
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/4/2004
|Field:  JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT -
L o Current Well Status
rﬁth MD: 10,871.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: usD Rig Accept:  10:30 2/5/2004
Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (ft) Daily Mud: 549 Rig Release: ‘
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 69,281 Spud Date: 2/5/2004 ‘
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 20,547 WX Date: I
‘,Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 1,082,173 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB) }
! DOL/DFS/Target: 31.44/28.56/20.70
Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft) |
i Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 19 \
\Supervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00 \‘
Weather: -5 DEGS F
|
|

24hr Forecast:

WASH & REAM, TRY TO CLEAN UP HOLE, RUN GR LOG, W&R TO FISH

|Comments:
HSE & Well Control -
| Days Since Last DAFWC. 223 All Free Days: 14 ﬁ
l.ast Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003 |
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004 |
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/4/2004 1
No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency Insp: N Non-compliance Issued: N 4\
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill) |
iFIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure{) |
IFIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg) J
MAASSP: 28 (psi) T
Test Pressure: 485 (psi) \
|Kick Tolerance: (ppg) ‘
Kick Volume: (bbl) | \
Operational Parameters 1
IROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser §
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.: Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump | Type| Eff. [Strokes| Liner Size] Circ. Rate |
{WOB (min): Slack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs: () 0 0 4] l
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser: I
RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser:  (ft/min) \
RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ftY/min \
\Torq. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel DP: 2252 (ft/min !
[ Torq. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Inspect: (hr) 1 ]
Drilling Fluid
Type: FW/GEL 10 sec gels: 4 (Ib/100ft*) | Ca: 450 (mg/L) ES: (mV) 1
TimefLoc: 14:30/FL.W 10 min gels: 9 (Ib/100f?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 12.96 (%)
Depth 10,871.0 (it) Fluid Loss: 6.9 (cc/30min)| CaCl2: (%) Qil: (%) |
Temp: (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 87.0 (%) ‘
‘ Density: 11.10 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min) | CI-: 700 (mg/L) Oil/Water: i
] Funnel Visc.: 41 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: 0.25 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl) ‘
ECD 11.43 (ppg) MBT: 12,50 (ppb) HGS: 112.07 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl) \
\ PV 20 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 48.59 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl) !
9 (Ib/100f?) | PM: 0.29 (mL) PfIME: 0.03/0.4 (mL/mL) | Lost Surface: (bbl) \
- a0 " ] |
| Operations Summary ]
‘ From-To | Hrs | Phase| Task | Activity | Code NPT Operation \
{_Op.Depth | (hr) ‘
\ 00:00-00:30 | 0.50 |PROD1{ FISH LD N PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER & INSTALL FLOW NIPPLE ’
10,871 |
i 00:30-02:30 | 2.00 |PROD1| FISH POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 480" ’
10,871 ,‘
02:30-03:00 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH BHPULD N LAY DOWN DRILLING JARS, PICK UP SINGLE TO STAND BACK ﬁ‘
10,871
03:00-03:30 | 0.50 |PROD1! FISH POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO BIT \
| 10,871 |
1
! |
t |
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| Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 31
Well:  CORONA 32-30 Event:  ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/4/2004
Field:  JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
Operations Summary
From-To | Hrs | Phase| Task Activity Code NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
03:30-04:00 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH | SAFETY N CLEAR RIG WHILE SCHLUMBERGER CHECKED BIT & BHA FOR
10,871 RADIQACTIVITY READINGS
04:00-06:00 | 2.00 [PROD1| FISH INSP N INSPECT BIT & BHA, PACKED WITH CLAY, FORMATION AND A
10,871 COUPLE PIECES OF FIBERGLASS FROM THE BOTTOM OF THE
PEX LOGGING TOOL, REVIEW FINDINGS WITH HOUSTON
OFFICE & AGREE ON PLAN TO GO BACK IN WITH BIT TO LOCATE
TOP OF FISH, CLEAN BIT & BHA
06:00-07:30 | 1.50 |PROD1| FISH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE TO SURFACE CASING SHOE
10,871
07:30-08:00 | 0.50 |[PROD1} FISH PU N INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, CIRC & FILL DRILL PIPE,
| 10,871 BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE B
08:00-11:00 | 3.00 |[PROD1| FISH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE TO 5088, FILL DP, TIH TO 6020' AND STARTED
10,871 TAKING WEIGHT
11:00-00:00 | 13.00 |PROD1| FISH | WASH N SCREW [N WITH TOP DRIVE, WASH & REAM 6020' - 7970', TIGHT |
10,871 AND STICKY AT 7680', 7819, 7865', 7910' & 7955', MOSTLY FINE |
CUTTINGS COMING OVER SHAKER WITH SOME COAL AND |
SHALE PIECES

REDUCE MUD WEIGHT TO 11.0 PPG AT 0600 HRS ON 3-5-04

Mud Log Information

Formation MESAVERDE Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (ft) |Bkgrnd Gas  3,000.00 UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS
Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas 4,500.00 UNITS |Pore. Press (ppg) |
Materials / Consumption

Item Units Usage | On Hand Item Units Usage | OnHand

DIESEL GAL 2390 9547 | PROPANE GAL 0 0
| TRASH-GENERAL REFUSE cuYD 0 0|SMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 0
J Personnel
| Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours |
BP 1) 12.00|HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0 !
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 10| 120.00
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1| 12.00|MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1 8.00
}BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 1|  2.00/ ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0

BJ SERVICES 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0
:PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2| 32.00
WEATHERFORD ENTERRA 3| 48.00

Anchoring / Marine , ‘
Anchor 1 2 3 4 5 [ 7 8 9 10 11 12
Tension

Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:

VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
' Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:

Current Direction:
Comments:
Cumulative Phase Breakdown
\ Planned Change of Scope | Total [ Total Cost
Phase | Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total] Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Hours usD

PRE 31.50 100.0% ] 3180 ;
| SURF 75.00 857%| 1250 14.3% 87.50 ‘
'PROD1 | 32050 55.8%| 254.00 44.2% 574.50 \
| TOTALS | 427.00 61.6%| 26650 38.4% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0%| 693.50

,
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Operator: BP
Weill: CORONA 32-30
:Field: JONAH

Rig: H&P 179
Event: ORIG DRILLING
Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

Report: 31
Date:  3/4/2004

Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling

Window Top: (ft) CT OD: (in) CT Daily Fig: (ft) (cp)
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CT ID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft) (cp)
? CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength: (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
I Window Desc:
\ Remarks

Printed: 3/5/2004 7:12:18 AM
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 32
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/5/2004
.Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
Current Well Status

Depth MD: 10,871.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: usD Rig Accept:  10:30 2/5/2004
Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (ft) Daily Mud: 1,924 Rig Release:
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 71,206 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 24,038 WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 1,118,373 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 32.44/29.56/20.70
Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 18
Supervisor: TiM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

Weather: 24 DEGS F

Current Status: WASH & REAM TO BTM AT 9028’
24hr Summary: W&R TO 7969, STUCK & WORK FREE, RUN GR LOG, WORK PAST 8250', W&R AHEAD
24hr Forecast: W&R TO BTM, CIRC & COND HOLE, DROP GR TOOL, LOG OUT OF HOLE

Comments:
HSE & Well Control
Days Since Last DAFWC: 224 All Free Days: 15
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/5/2004
No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency Insp: N Non-compliance Issued: N
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() Stroke Rate Pressure()
FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)
Test Pressure: 485 (psi)
Kick Tolerance: (ppg)
Kick Volume: (bbl)
Operational Parameters
ROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.: Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump (Type| Eff. | Strokes| Liner Size | Circ. Rate
WOB (min): Slack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs: 4] () () Q)
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser:
RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser:  (ft/min)
RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min
Torg. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min
Torq. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Inspect: (hr)
Drilling Fluid
Type: FW/GEL 10 sec gels: 3 (Ib/100ft?) | Ca: 280 (mg/L) ES: (mV)
Time/lLoc: 14:00/FLW 10 min gels: 9 (Ib/100ft?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 11.97 (%)
Depth: 10,871.0 (ft) Fluid Loss: 7.6 (cc/30min) | CaCl2: (%) Oil: (%)
Temp: 93 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 88.0 (%) |
Density: 10.90 (ppg) HTHP WL (cc/30min) | Cl-: 600 (mg/L) Oil/Water: / ;
Funnel Visc.: 38 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32" Sand: 0.50 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: 11.51 (ppg) MBT: 16.25 (ppb) HGS: 104.77 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
PV: 17 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 44.06 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
YP: 6 (Ib/100ft2) | PM: 0.49 (mL) PfIMF: 0.04/0.4 (mL/mL) Lost Surface: (bbl)
pH: 9.0
Operations Summary
From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
00:00-01:00 | 1.00 {PROD1| FISH REAM N WASH & REAM TO 7969', WON'T CLEAN UP - STICKY
10,871
01:00-01:30 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH WRKPIP N PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 7940', STOP PUMP & ROTATION, TRY TO
10,871 RECIPROCATE PIPE IN ORDER TO LOG, STUCK PIPE, WORK
FREE WITH PUMP AND TORQUE
01:30-02:00 | 0.50 [PROD1{ FISH WRKPIP N PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 7785', STOP PUMP & ROTATION, TRY TO
10,871 RECIPROCATE PIPE IN ORDER TO LOG, STUCK PIPE, WORK
FREE WITH PUMP AND TORQUE

Printed: 3/8/2004 6:11:18 PM



BP
Daily Operations Report

Page 2 of 3{
Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 32 J
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/5/2004 [
| Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT )
Operations Summary \
From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
02:00-02:30 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH | WRKPIP N PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 7600, STOP PUMP & ROTATION, ABLE TO
10,871 RECIPROCATE PIPE FOR 4-5 MINS BUT DRAG INCREASED UNTIL
STUCK (ACTS LIKE DIFFERENTIAL)
02:30-03:00 | 0.50 |PROD1| FISH CIR N SCREW IN TOP DRIVE, TORQUE UP WITH PUMP ON AND ABLE
10,871 TO FREE STUCK PIPE
03:00-06:30 | 3.50 |PROD1| FISH CIR N CIRCULATE AND REDUCE MUD WEIGHT FROM 11.4 TO 11.0 PPG
10,871
06:30-07:00 | 0.50 |PROD1| EVAL RU N RIG UP LOGGERS
10,871
07:00-08:30 | 1.50 [PROD1| EVAL LOG N RUN GAMMA RAY LOG TO CLEAR HOLE SECTION FROM
10,871 RADIOACTIVE SOURCE READINGS - NO INDICATION, LOG FROM
SURFACE TO LOGGERS DEPTH OF 7604'
08:30-09:00 | 0.50 |PROD1| EVAL RD N RIG DOWN LOGGERS
10,871
: 09:00-11:30 | 2.50 [PROD1| FISH RIGSER N CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES AND SAVER SUB ON TOP DRIVE
10,871
11:30-00:00 | 12.50 |PROD1| FISH REAM N CONDITION, WASH & REAM HOLE DOWN TO TRY TO LOCATE
10,871 TOP OF FISH, WORK THROUGH STICKY & TIGHT SECTION FROM
8200'-8250', WASH & REAM AND CHASE LOGGING TOOL TO
BOTTOM AT 8420

WASH & REAM AT 9028' AT 0600 HRS ON 3-6-04

Mud Log Information

|
Formation MESAVERDE

Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (ft) |Bkgrnd Gas  3,000.00 UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS |
Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas 4,500.00 UNITS |Pore. Press (ppg)
o Materials / Consumption
| Item Units Usage | OnHand | Item Units Usage | On Hand
DIESEL GAL 1728 7622) PROPANE GAL 0 0
TRASH-GENERAL REFUSE CU YD 0 0|SMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 0
Personnel
Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours
BP 1] 12.00|HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 10{ 120.00
IHELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1| 12.00|MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
|HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1 8.00
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 0 {ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
:BJ SERVICES 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2| 32.00
WEATHERFORD ENTERRA 3| 48.00
Anchoring / Marine
Anchor 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
|_Tension |
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
Comments:
\
[ Cumulative Phase Breakdown
\ Planned Change of Scope Total Totat Cost
Phase | Prod % Total| NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Prod % Total] NPT % Totall WOW % Total| Hours usD
PRE " 3150 100.0% 31.50| B
SURF 1 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% 87.50 ‘
PROD1 320.50 53.6%| 278.00 46.4% 598.50
| TOTALS 427.00 59.5%| 290.50 40.5% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0%| 717.50

S—

|
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Operator: BP
Well: CORONA 32-30
Field: JONAH

Rig: H&P 179
Event: ORIG DRILLING
Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

Report: 32
Date:  3/5/2004

Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling

Window Top: (ft) CT OD: (in) CT Daily Ftg: (ft) (cp)
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CT ID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft) (cp)
CT Length:  {ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
Window Desc:
Remarks
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' Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 33
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/6/2004
Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
Current Well Status
Depth MD: 10,871.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: USD Rig Accept:  10:30 2/5/2004
Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 () Daily Mud: 2,298 Rig Release:
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 73,503 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 69,237 WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 1,187,610 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 33.44/30.56/20.70
i Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
'Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 18
iSupervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00
Weather: -4 DEGS F

Current Status:

PREPARE TO SEVER DRILL PIPE AT 8171’

24hr Summary: W&R TO BTM, STUCK AT 9310, RUN GR LOG, SOURCE AT 8240', PREP TO SIDETRACK
24hr Forecast: CIRC/WORK PIPE FREE ABOVE 8200',BACK OFF, TOH, PUMP CMT PLUG
Comments:
HSE & Well Control
Days Since Last DAFWC: 225 All Free Days: 16
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
‘Next BOP Press. Test; Last Safety Meeting:  3/6/2004
No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency insp: N Non-compliance Issued: N
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill) |
FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() Stroke Rate Pressure()
[FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
i MAASSP: 28 (psi)
| Test Pressure: 485 (psi)
|Kick Tolerance: (ppg) :
'Kick Volume: _ (bbl) |
Operational Parameters
ROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt. Daity Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump | Type| Eff. |Strokes| Liner Size| Circ. Rate
WOB (min): Slack Off Wit.: Cum. Bit Hrs: () () () 0]
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser:
RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser:  (ft/min)
RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min
Torg. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min
Torq. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Inspect: (hr)
Drilling Fluid
Type: FWI/GEL 10 sec gels: 6 (Ib/100ft?) | Ca: 520 (mg/L) ES: (mV)
Time/Loc: 09:00/FLW 10 min gels: 12 (Ib/100ft?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 11.97 (%)
Depth: 10,871.0 (ft) Fluid Loss: 6.2 (cc/30min) | CaCl2: (%) Oil: (%)
! Temp: 102 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 88.0 (%)
| Density: 10.90 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min) | Cl-: 700 (mg/L) Oil/Water: /
Funnel Visc.: 43 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: 0.30 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: 11.24 (ppg) MBT: 17.50 (ppb) HGS: 104.77 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl}
PV: 21 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 44.06 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
YP: 8 (Ib/100ft2) | PM: 0.38 (mL) PfIMf: 0.02/0.3 (mbL/mL) Lost Surface: (bbl)
pH: 8.5
| Operations Summary
From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
00:00-08:30 | 8.50 |PROD1| FISH REAM N WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM WATCHING FOR TOP OF FISH
10,871 (LOGGING TOOL), WASH TO 9290' AND STALLED TOP DRIVE
08:30-13:00 | 4.50 {PROD1| FISH | WRKPIP N WORK PIPE UP & DOWN FROM 9283' - 9300', ABLE TO ‘
10,871 CIRCULATE & ROTATE WHILE WORKING UP AND DOWN BUT :
TOP DRIVE WOULD STALL WHEN TRYING TO WORK UPHOLE,
REAM & WORK DOWNHOLE TO 9318' AND THEN ONLY ABLE TO
WORK UP TO ABOUT 9300' WHEN TOP DRIVE WOULD STALL
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| Page 2 of 3(
'h?perator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 33 ﬂ
Well:  CORONA 32-30 Event:  ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/6/2004 \
Field:  JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT B ]
] Operations Summary |
| From-To [ Hrs [Phase | Task [ Activity | Code | NPT Operation ‘
| Op. Depth | (hr) |
‘f 13:00-14:00 | 1.00 [PROD1| FISH CIR N CIRCULATE AND PUMP SWEEP WiTH NUT PLUG WHILE j
10,871 WORKING PIPE, PUMP PRESSURE INCREASED & STUCK PIPE AT
l 9310, PACKED OFF J
| 14:00-14:30 | 050 [PROD1 FISH RU N RIG UP LOGGERS TO RUN GAMMA RAY AND RUN FREE POINT |
10,871 |
H4:30-15:30 1.00 |PROD1| EVAL LOG N RUN GAMMA RAY LOG FROM 7300-9312', LOG SHOWED l
| 10871 RADIOACTIVE SOURCE FROM DENSITY TOOL AT ADEPTHOF |
l 8240, NOTIFICATIONS MADE & ORDERS TO ABANDON HOLE (
\ BELOW 8200’ J
[ 15:30-17:00 | 1.50 |PROD1| EVAL LOG N RUN FREE POINT TOOL, DRILL STRING STUCK AT 8200' J
| 10,871
[17:00-19:00 | 2.00 [PROD1| FISH MISC N RiH WITH BACKOFF SHOT, WORK TORQUE IN AND ATTEMPT
{ 10,871 BACKOFF AT 8170 - NO SUCCESS, POH WITH BACKOFF TOOL
{ 19:00-21:00 | 2.00 |PROD1| FISH PERF N RIH WITH PERF GUN AND PERFORATE DRILL PIPE AT 8180', POH
10,871
['21:00-21:30 | 0.50 [PROD1| FISH CIR N MAKE UP TOP DRIVE TO DRILL PIPE, UNABLE TO BREAK
] 10,871 CIRCULATION, WORK PIPE BUT STILL UNABLE TO BREAK CIRC.
| 21:30-23:00 | 1.50 |PROD1| EVAL LOG N RUN FREE POINT TOOL, NO PIPE MOVEMENT BELOW 2709', POH
| 10,871 WITH FREE POINT
23:00-00:00 | 1.00 |PROD1| FISH PERF N RIH WITH PERF GUN AND PERFORATE DRILL PIPE AT 7800’ 7
10,871
[ PREPARE TO SEVER DRILL PIPE AT 0600 HRS ON 3-7-04
Mud Log Information
Formation MESAVERDE Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (fly |[Bkgrnd Gas  3,000.00 UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS |
|Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas 4,500.00 UNITS |Pore. Press (PPg) J
| |

Materials / Consumption

| ltem Units | Usage | OnHand | Item Units Usage [ On Hand |
[DIESEL GAL 2129 5493/ PROPANE GAL 0 FJ
UEASH-GENERAL REFUSE CUYD 0 OJSMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 0;
\ Personnel
\ Company No. | Hours i Company " T No. | Hours Company No. | Hours
[BP 1] 12.00]/HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
‘NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 101 120.00
!HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1( 12.00MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING o] CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1 8.00
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 0 ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
'BJ SERVICES [¢] BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0 }
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2] 3200
rﬂEATHERFORD ENTERRA 3 J
| Anchoring / Marine » J
| Anchor 1 2 3 5 6 7 8 | 9 10 | 1 12
| Tension |
'Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
/VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: / /
}Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current: }
‘ Current Direction:
‘Comments:
Cumulative Phase Breakdown 7J

/ Planned Change of Scope | Total | Total Cost |
| _Phase [ Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Total| Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Hours usb |
\PRE 31.50 100.0% 31.50 ‘
iSURF 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% 87.50 J
’Eom 320.50 51.5%| 302.00 48.5% | 62250 |
TOTALS [ 42700 57.6%| 31450 424%| 000 00% 000 00% 000 00%] 000 0.0%| 74150 k

- _
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‘Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 33
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/6/2004

Field: JONAH

Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling

Window Top: (ft) CTOD: (in) CT Daily Ftg: (ft) LSRV 1: (cp)
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CT ID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft) LSRV 3 {cp)
CT Length:  (it) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
Window Desc:
Remarks
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j?)perator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 34
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/7/2004

LField: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

|
10:30 2/5/2004 (

Current Weli Status
Depth MD: 10,871.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: uUsD Rig Accept:
Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (ft) Daily Mud: 344 Rig Release:
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 73,848 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 52,071 WX Date:
‘Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft} Cum. Well: 1,239,680 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
J DOL/DFS/Target: 34.44/31.56/20.70
Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 22
| Supervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

Weather: 14 DEGS F

' Current Status:  SPOT RED CEMENT ON TOP OF FISH
!_24hr Summary: PERF DP, CIRC, SEVER DP AT 8171', POH, LD JTS, TIH, CIRC & LOWER MUD WT
{24hr Forecast: SPOT CMT PLUG, WOC, TIH, DRESS PLUG, TOH, LD BIT, TIH

| Comments:
[ HSE & Well Contro!
ﬁys Since Last DAFWC: 226 AllFree Days: 17 ]
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003 ]
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/6/2004
'No. Stop Cards: Regulatory Agency Insp: Non-compliance Issued:
( Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill}
|FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() Stroke Rate Pressure() |
IFIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)
Test Pressure: 485 (psi)
Kick Tolerance: (ppg)
:Kick Volume: (bbl)
Operational Parameters
ROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.; Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump |Type| Eff. | Strokes| Liner Size| Circ. Rate
:WOB (min): Slack Off Wit.: Cum. Bit Hrs: () 4] { 0
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser:
|RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser:  (ft/min)
|RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (fmin
i Torq. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP:  225.2 (ft/min f
Torg. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Iinspect: (hr)
B Drilling Fluid
Type: FW/GEL 10 sec gels: 6 (b/100ft?) | Ca: 520 (mg/L) ES: (mV) |
. Time/Loc: 18:00/FLW 10 min gels: 12 (Ib/100ft?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 11.97 (%)
r Depth: 10,871.0 (ft) Fluid Loss: 6.2 (cc/30min) | CaCl2: (%) Oil: (%)
| Temp: 102 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 88.0 (%)
J Density: 10.90 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min) | CI-: 700 (mg/L) Oil/Water: /
\ Funnel Visc.: 43 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32") Sand: 0.30 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: 11.24 (ppg) MBT: 17.50 (ppb) HGS: 104.77 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
‘ PV: 21 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 44.06 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
L YP: 8 (Ib/100ft2) | PM: 0.38 (mL) PfIME: 0.02/0.3 (mL/mL) | Lost Surface: (bbl)
| pH: 8.5
‘ Operations Summary
,‘ From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
| Op. Depth | (hr)
| 00:00-01:00 | 1.00 [PROD1| FISH PERF N PERFORATE DRILL PIPE AT 7780' WITH 8 SHOTS, POH WITH
10,871 WIRELINE
i 01:00-05:00 | 4.00 |PROD1| FISH CIR N MAKE UP TOP DRIVE, ABLE TO BREAK CIRCULATION RIGHT
10,871 AWAY, CIRCULATE AND WORK TENSION IN AND OUT OF
STRING TO TRY TO FREE DP DOWN TO BACKOFF POINT, WORK
TORQUE IN & OUT AND PIPE STARTED ROTATING ON THIRD
‘ TIME, CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON DRILL PIPE SEVERING CHARGE

]
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| Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 34
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/7/2004

' Well:

Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

Field:  JONAH
|

Operations Summary

From-To Hrs Phas?‘ Task Activity Code W NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
05:00-06:00 | 1.00 |PROD1| FISH RU N BREAK OFF AND BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE, RIG UP WIRELINE TO
10,871 RUN SEVERING CHARGE
06:00-06:30 | 0.50 {PROD1| FISH CUTING N RIH AND SEVER HWDP AT 8171', POH
10,871
‘l 06:30-07:00 | 0.50 |PROD1; FISH RD N RIG DOWN FREE PT/BACKOFF TRUCK AND EQPT.
¢ 10,871
{ 07:00-12:30 | 5.50 |PROD1| FISH POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE, PULLED 70-80K LBS OVER SW ON FIRST 2
10,871 STANDS THEN CAME OQUT GOOD
12:30-14:00 | 1.50 {PROD1| FISH | BHPULD N LAY DOWN PERFORATED JOINT OF DRILL PIPE & SEVERED |
10,871 JOINT OF HWDP, CLEAN RIG FLOOR
14:00-15:00 | 1.00 |PROD1}| FISH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE TO 2500
10,871
15:00-17:00 | 2.00 |PROD1} FISH MAINT N CUT AND SLIP DRILL LINE
10,871 |
17:00-17:30 | 0.50 |PROD1| FiSH RIGSER N SERVICE RIG [
10,871
17:30-19:00 | 1.50 |PROD1} FISH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE TO 5000'
| 10,871
19:00-19:45 | 0.75 |[PROD1| FISH CIR N CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, BREAK OFF & BLOW DOWN TOP {
10,871 DRIVE
19:45-21:00 | 1.25 |PROD1| FiSH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE TO 8006
10,871
21:00-22:00 | 1.00 |PROD1| FISH WASH N WASH AND REAM LAST TWO STANDS TO BOTTOM
10,871 N
22:00-00:00 | 2.00 |PROD1| FISH CIR N CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE, REDUCING MUD WEIGHT TO [
10,871 10.0 PPG ;

| _SPOT RED CEMENT ON TOP OF FISH AT 0600 HRS ON 3-8-04

Mud Log Information

Formation MESAVERDE Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (ft) |Bkgrnd Gas UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS
Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas UNITS |Pore. Press (pPg) |
Materials / Consumption ‘
| Item Units Usage | On Hanﬂ Item Units Usage | OnHand
DIESEL GAL 1852 3641 PROPANE GAL 0 0
LRASH-GENERAL REFUSE CU YD 0 OJ SMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 31
Personnel
Company No. | Hours | Company No. | Hours \ Company No. | Hours
BP 1] 12.00;HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 10| 120.00
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1| 12.00MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 |CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1 8.00
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 0 ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 4| 32.00|BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0
PASON 0 HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2| 32.00
WEATHERFORD ENTERRA 3| 48.00 |
Anchoring / Marine B
Anchor 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
Tension
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
Comments:
Cumulative Phase Breakdown
[ Planned Change of Scope Total | Total Cost
Phase Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Total| Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Total| Hours UsD
PRE 31.50 100.0% 31.50 i
TOTALS 427.00 55.8%| 338.50 44.2% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 000 0.0%| 76550 ]
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 34 \
Wel:  CORONA 32-30 Event  ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/7/2004
Field:  JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT }
] Cumulative Phase Breakdown |
ﬁ“ \ Planned [ Change of Scope | Total | Total Cost |
Phase | Prod % Total] NPT % Totall WOW % Total| Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Hours usD |
SURF 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% 87.50 “{
\PROD1 \320.50 49.6%| 326.00 50.4% 646.50 A
[TOTALS 142700 558%)| 338.50 44.2%| 0.00 00%] 000 00% 000 0.0%| 000 0.0% 76550 \
|

Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling

i Window Top: (ft) CTOD: (in) CT Daily Ftg: (ft) LSRV 1: {(cp)
] Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CTID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
t CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Solids: (%)
| Window Desc:

! Remarks

{

|
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'Fperator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 35
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/8/2004
'Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
Current Well Status

Depth MD: 10,871.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: usb Rig Accept:  10:30 2/5/2004

Est. TVD: 10,838.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (ft) Daily Mud: 1,953 Rig Release:

Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 75,800 Spud Date:  2/5/2004

' Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 27,405 WX Date:

‘Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD): 10,838.0 (ft} Cum. Well: 1,267,085 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 35.44/32.56/20.70

Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)

Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 20

Supervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program: Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00

Weather: 6 DEGS F

24hr Forecast:

Current Status:  TRIP IN HOLE TO SET KICKOFF PLUG
24hr Summary. CIRC, SPOT CMT PLUG, TOH, STRAP & PU HWDP, TIH, TAG CMT PLUG, CIRC, TOH
TOH, PU DIVERTER & 2-7/8", TIH, CIRC, SET KICKOFF PLUG, TOH

Comments:

‘L HSE & Well Control

Days Since Last DAFWC: 227 All Free Days: 18

Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003

Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
!Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/8/2004
[No. Stop Cards: 30 Regulatory Agency Insp: N Non-compliance Issued: N

Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)

FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate Pressure()

FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
|MAASSP: 28 (psi)

i Test Pressure: 485 (psi)

Kick Tolerance: (ppg) ‘
i Kick Volume: (bbl) |
‘, Operational Parameters
‘ ROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser

ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.: Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump |Type| Eff. | Strokes| Liner Size| Circ. Rate
rwos (min): Slack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs: 0 O 0 O |
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser: ]
}RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser: (ft/min) |

RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ft/min, }

Torq. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel. DP: 2252 (ft/min ‘

Torg. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Inspect: (hr) L ] |
' Drilling Fluid

Type: FW/GEL 10 sec gels: 17 (b/100ft?) | Ca: 540 (mg/L) ES: (mV)
Time/Loc: 05:00/FLW 10 min gels: 27 (Ib/100ft?) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 9.47 (%)
Depth: 10,871.0 (ft) Fluid Loss: 9.0 (cc/30min) | CaCl2: (%) Oil: (%)
Temp: 94 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 90.5 (%)
Density: 1040 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min) | ClI-: 500 (mg/L) Oil/Water: /

i Funnel Visc.: 48 (s/qt) Cake: 1.0 (/32" Sand: 0.50 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: (ppg) MBT: 17.50 (ppb) HGS: 86.48 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
PV: 25 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 32.67 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
YP: 18 (Ib/100ft2) | PM: 0.45 (mL) PH/Mf: 0.04/0.3 (mL/mL}) Lost Surface: (bbl)
pH: 9.0

Operations Summary

;. From-To Hrs | Phase| Task Activity Code NPT Operation

LOp. Depth | (hr)

“ 00:00-04:30 | 4.50 |PROD1| FISH CIR N CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE, MUD WEIGHT REDUCED TO

10,871 10.4 PPG

04:30-05:00 | 0.50 |PROD1| FISH SAFETY N HELD SAFETY MEETING FOR RIG UP & PUMP CEMENT PLUG
10,871

05:00-06:00 ; 1.00 PROD1| FISH RU N RIG UP BJ CEMENTERS AND PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 3000
10,871 PSI

06:00-06:45 | 0.75 |PROD1REMCM CMT N PUMP RED DYED CEMENT TO ISOLATE RADIOACTIVE SOURCE
10,871 (300' CEMENT PLUG WITH BOTTOM AT 8170'), PUMP 13 BBLS

L

Printed: 3/9/2004 9:18:35 AM
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Operator: BP
Well:

Page 2 of 3
Rig: H&P 179 Report: 35
CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/8/2004

| Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT ]
| Operations Summary
" From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
| Op.Depth | (hr) ]
06:00-06:45 | 0.75 |PROD1/REMCM CMT N MUD CLEAN SPACER, 125 SX (25 BBLS) CLASS G CEMENT WITH
10,871 0.2% CD32 + 0.1% FL63 + 0.25% R3 + 0.2% BA59 FOLLOWED BY 4
BBLS MUD CLEAN SPACER, DISPLACED WITH 107.5 BBLS MUD
06:45-07:30 | 0.75 |PROD1|REMCM POH N BREAK OFF CEMENTING VALVES & SWEDGE AND PULL OUT OF
7,870 HOLE WITH 6 STANDS DRILL PIPE |
07:30-08:30 | 1.00 |PROD1REMCM CIR N CIRCULATE & RIG DOWN CEMENTERS, BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE |
7870
08:30-13:00 } 4.50 |PROD1REMCM POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE
7.870 |
13:00-13:30 | 0.50 |PROD1REMCM LD N LAY DOWN 3 BENT JOINTS DRILL PIPE
7,870
13:30-14:00 | 0.50 {PROD1[REMCM RIGSER N SERVICE RIG
7,870
14:00-16:00 | 2.00 |PROD1REMCM BHPULD N LAY DOWN 6 JTS HWDP TO BE INSPECTED, STRAP & CALIPER 6
7,870 NEW JTS HWDP AND PICK UP IN STANDS
16:00-16:30 | 0.50 [PROD1[REMCM BHAHDL N PICK UP BHA TO TAG AND DRESS OFF CEMENT PLUG, BHA =
7,870 MX-11 BIT, FLOAT SUB, 6-HWDP
16:30-20:00 | 3.50 |PROD1|REMCM RIH N TRIP IN HOLE, FILL PIPE AT 2667' & 5510', TRIP IN TO 7788’
¢ 7,870
| 20:00-21:00 | 1.00 {PROD1REMCM DRLCMT N WASH & REAM FROM 7788’ TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 7869', DRILL
7,910 CEMENT 7869' - 7910'
21:00-22:00 | 1.00 |PROD1|REMCM CIR N CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
7,910
22:00-22:30 | 0.50 |PROD1REMCM CIR N MIX AND PUMP WEIGHTED TRIP SLUG, BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE
7,910
22:30-00:00 | 1.50 |PROD1|REMCM POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE
7,910
TRIP IN HOLE TO SET KICKOFF PLUG AT 0600 HRS ON 3-9-04, TIH AT 5288

Mud Log Information

|
:Formation MESAVERDE

Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (ft) |Bkgrnd Gas UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS
{Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas UNITS |Pore. Press (ppg)
Materials / Consumption
ltem Units Usage [ OnHand | Item Units Usage | OnHand |
DIESEL GAL 1484 9357 PROPANE GAL 0 0
| TRASH-GENERAL REFUSE CcCUYD 0 0| SMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 0
Personnel
Company No. | Hours | Company No. [ Hours | Company No. | Hours |
BP 1| 12.00{HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 10| 120.00
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1} 12.00 MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1] 8.00
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 1| 3.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 4| 32.00 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0
PASON 0 {HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 2| 16.00;
Anchoring / Marine
Anchor 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
Tension
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
Comments:
|
Cumulative Phase Breakdown ‘
Planned \ Change of Scope | Total Total Cost
Phase | Prod % Totall NPT % Totall WOW % Total] Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Hours UsD
PRE | 3150 100.0% | 31.50
TOTALS | 427.00 54.1%| 362.50 45.9% 0.00 0.0%—[ 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 789.50

Printed: 3/9/2004 9:18:35 AM



BP

Daily Operations Report Page 3 of 3|

1Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 35
jWeII: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/8/2004
{Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
| Cumulative Phase Breakdown
1 \ Planned Change of Scope Total | Total Cost
| Phase [ Prod % Total] NPT % Total] WOW % Totall Prod % Total] NPT 9% Total] WOW % Total] Hours usD
|SURF 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% \ 87.50 -
|PROD1 | 320.50 47.8%| 350.00 52.2% | 670.50 .
| TOTALS [ 427.00 54.1%| 362.50 45.9% 000 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0%| 789.50 \
I Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling _
‘ Window Top: (ft) CT OD: (in) CT Daily Ftg: (ft) LSRV 1: (cp)

Mud Sys Ftg: (ft) CT ID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft) LSRV 3: (cp)
/ CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength:  (psi) Drill Sofids: (%)
i Window Desc:
| Remarks

i
r

—

Printed: 3/8/2004 9:18:35 AM
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Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 36
Well: CORONA 32-30 Event: ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/9/2004
Field: JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
Current Well Status
Depth MD: 5,750.0 (ft) Casing Size: 8.625 (in) Costs in: usD Rig Accept:  10:30 2/5/2004
Est. TVD: 5,724.0 (ft) Casing (MD): 2,504.0 (ft}) Daily Mud: 602 Rig Release:
Progress: (ft) Next Casing Size: 4.500 (in) Cum. Mud: 76,402 Spud Date:  2/5/2004
Auth Depth: 10,760.0 (ft) Next Casing (MD): 10,871.0 (ft) Daily Well: 31,792 WX Date:
Hole Size: 7.875 (in) Next Casing (TVD}): 10,838.0 (ft) Cum. Well: 1,298,877 Elev Ref: ROTARY TABLE (RKB)
DOL/DFS/Target: 36.44/33.56/20.70
- Geologist: JENNIFER LUCAS KB Elev: 7,109.00 (ft)
Engineer: TOM BOYD Tot. Personnel: 17
Supervisor: TIM ANDERSON 307-260-7179 Program; Cost Ahead: 0 USD, Days Ahead: 0.00
Weather: 6 DEGS F

Current Status:

WAIT ON CEMENT

24hr Summary: TOH, PU 2-7/8" & DIVERTER, TIH, SPOT PILL, PMP CMT PLUG, TOH, WOC & PU HWDP
24hr Forecast: PU BIT/BHA, TIH & DRESS OFF ST PLUG, TOH FOR DIR DRLG TOOLS
Comments:
HSE & Well Control
Days Since Last DAFWC: 228 All Free Days: 19
Last Csg Test Press.: 1,500 (psi) Last Envir. Incident: 4/11/2003
Last BOP Press. Test:  2/8/2004
Next BOP Press. Test: Last Safety Meeting: 3/8/2004
No. Stop Cards: Regulatory Agency Insp: Non-compliance Issued:
Pump Slow Pump Rates (Circ) Slow Pump Rates (Choke) Slow Pump Rates (Kill)
FIT TVD: 2,513.0 (ft) Stroke Rate  Pressure() | Stroke Rate  Pressure() Stroke Rate Pressure()
FIT EMW: 12.22 (ppg)
MAASSP: 28 (psi)
Test Pressure: 485 (psi)
{Kick Tolerance: (ppg)
‘Kick Volume:  (bbl)
Operational Parameters
ROP Daily: Rotating Weight: Daily Bit Hrs: (hr) Pump Status - Drilling and Riser
ROP Cum.: Pick Up Wt.: Daily Sliding Hrs:0.00 (hr) Pump |Type| Eff. |Strokes| Liner Size | Circ. Rate
WOB (min): Slack Off Wt.: Cum. Bit Hrs: 0 () () 0]
WOB (max): Circ. Rate Riser:
RPM Min.: Circ. Rate Hole: Ann. Vel. Riser:  (ft/min)
RPM DH: Circ. Off Bottom: Ann. Vel. DC:  459.0 (ftmin
Torq. on Bottom: Circ. On Bottom: Ann. Vel, DP:  225.2 (ft/min
Torg. off Bottom: Jar Hrs since Inspect: (hr)
Drilling Fluid
Type: FW/GEL 10 sec gels: 2 (Ib/100ft?) | Ca: 500 (mg/L) ES: (mV)
Time/Loc: 09:00/FLW 10 min gels: 10 (Ib/100ft2) | K+: (mg/L) Solids: 8.97 (%)
Depth: 7,910.0 (ft) Fluid Loss: 12.2 (cc/30min) | CaCl2: (%) Qit: (%)
Temp: 84 (°F) HTHP Temp: 150 (°F) NaCl: (%) Water: 91.0 (%)
Density: 10.30 (ppg) HTHP WL: (cc/30min) | Cl-: 500 (mg/L) Oil/Water: /
Funnel Visc.: 42 (s/qt) Cake: 2.0 (/132" Sand: 0.25 (%) Daily Cuttings: (bbl)
ECD: (ppg) MBT: 17.50 (ppb) HGS: 5.63 (ppb) Cum. Cuttings: (bbl)
PV: 19 (cp) Lime: (ppb) LGS: 30.38 (ppb) Lost Downhole: (bbl)
YP: 4 (Ib/100ft?) | PM: 0.74 (mL) PfIMF: 0.09/0.4 (mL/mL) Lost Surface: (bbl)
pH: 9.5
Operations Summary
From-To Hrs | Phase | Task Activity Code NPT Operation
Op. Depth | (hr)
00:00-02:00 | 2.00 |PROD1|STKOH POH N TRIP OUT OF HOLE
7,910
02:00-04:00 | 2.00 |PROD1|STKOH| BHPULD N PICK UP 2-7/8" TUBING HANDLING EQUIPMENT, PICK UP
7,910 DIVERTER, 5 JOINTS 2-7/8" AND X-O SUB
04:00-07:00 | 3.00 |[PROD1|STKOH RIH N TRIP IN HOLE
7,910
07:00-07:30 | 0.50 |PROD1|STKOH CIR N CIRCULATE & PUMP VISCOUS PILL, SPOT PILL FROM 6200' - 6400'
7,910

Printed: 3/11/2004 6:31:35 AM



BP
Daily Operations Report

|
Page 2 of 3

|Operator: BP Rig: H&P 179 Report: 36
Well.  CORONA 32-30 Event:  ORIG DRILLING Date:  3/9/2004
[Field: _ JONAH Well Type: DEVELOPMENT
7 Operations Summary
‘ From-To | Hrs | Phase| Task Activity | Code NPT Operation
: Op. Depth | (hr)
07:30-09:00 | 1.50 |PROD1|STKOH| WASH N PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 5750', WASH & REAM HOLE WITH
7,910 DIVERTER FROM 5750' - 6200'
09:00-09:30 | 0.50 |PROD1|STKOH| SAFETY N HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP & PUMPING CEMENT
7,910 PLUG
09:30-10:30 | 1.00 |PROD1|STKOH|  CMT N RIG UP BJ CEMENTING EQUIPMENT, PROBLEM WITH AIR VALVE
7,910 ON PUMP TRUCK - FIXED
10:30-12:00 | 1.50 |PROD1[STKOH|  CMT N PUMP SIDETRACK PLUG, PUMP 20 BBLS MUD CLEAN SPACER,
5,750 PUMP 204 SACKS (41 BBLS) OF 16 PPG CLASS G CEMENT +
0.25% R3 + 0.1% FL63 + 0.2% CD32 + 0.2% BA59 FOLLOWED BY 5
BBLS MUD CLEAN SPACER, DISPLACED WITH 72 BBLS OF
DRILLING MUD
12:00-12:30 | 0.50 |PROD1|STKOH|  POH N PULL OUT OF HOLE SLOWLY WITH 10 STANDS DP
5,750
12:30-14:00 | 1.50 |PROD1[STKOH|  CIR N CIRCULATE DRILL PIPE CLEAN, MIX AND PUMP TRIP SLUG
5,750
14:00-18:00 | 4.00 |PROD1|STKOH|  POH N TRIP OUT FROM 5288 TO SURFACE, LAY DOWN 5 JTS 2.875"
5,750 TUBING & XO.
18:00-00:00 | 6.00 |PROD1|STKOH|  WOC N WAIT ON CEMENT.
5,750

0000-0600 WOC & TEST BOPE WHILE WAITING.

Mud Log Information

Formation MESAVERDE Form. Top MD.  10,701.0 (ft) |Bkgrnd Gas UNITS |Trip Gas UNITS
Lithology SHALE Conn. Gas UNITS |Pore. Press (ppg)
Materials / Consumption
Iltem Units Usage | On Hand Item Units Usage | On Hand
DIESEL GAL 1541 7816| PROPANE GAL 0 0
TRASH-GENERAL REFUSE CUYD 0 0|SMARTASH WASTE BBLS 0 0
Personnel
Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours Company No. | Hours
BP 1] 12.00|HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 0 PREMIER POWERPLANTS 0
NOT LISTED 0 RIVERVIEW RENTALS 0 HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 10| 120.00
HELMRICK & PAYNE DRILLIN 1| 12.00| MICKEY'S WELDING 0 CESSAC SPECIALIZED TUBU 0
HEMPHILL TRUCKING 0 CORAB 0 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 1| 10.00
BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 SIMONS PETROLEUM 0 ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING 0
BJ SERVICES 4! 32.00 BAKER HUGHES INTEQ 0 BUNNING, JOHN TRANSFER 0
PASON 0] 12.00,HYLAND ENTERPRISES INC 0 SCHLUMBERGER 0
Anchoring / Marine |
Anchor 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
Tension
Rig Heading: Sea Height: Rig Heave: Riser Tension:
VDL: Sea Dir.: Rig Roll: Riser Angle/Dir.: /
Swell Height: Sea Period: Rig Pitch: Current:
Current Direction:
Comments:
Cumulative Phase Breakdown
Planned Change of Scope Total Total Cost
Phase Prod % Total] NPT % Total| WOW % Total| Prod % Total] NPT % Totall WOW % Total| Hours UsD
PRE 31.50 100.0% 31.50 T
SURF 75.00 85.7%| 1250 14.3% 87.50
PROD1 | 320.50 46.1%| 374.00 53.9% ! 694.50
TOTALS | 427.00 525%| 386.50 47.5% 0.00 0.0%| 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 0.00 0.0% 813.50[

Printed: 3/11/2004 6:31:35 AM
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Operator: BP
Well: CORONA 32-30
Field: JONAH

Rig: H&P 179
Event: ORIG DRILLING
Well Type: DEVELOPMENT

Report: 36
Date:  3/9/2004

Window / Coiled Tubing Drilling

{ Window Top: (ft)
Mud Sys Ftg: (ft)

Window Desc:

CT OD: (in) CT Daily Ftg: (ft)
CTID: (in) CT Cum Ftg: (ft)
CT Length:  (ft) CT Strength: (psi)

LSRV 1: (cp)
LSRV 3: (cp)
Drill Solids: (%)

Remarks

Printed: 3/11/2004 6:31:35 AM



