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From: "Schoenfelder, Robert P." <R.Schoenfelder@WestonSolutions.com>
To: "NRC-HO, Elaine" <esb~nrc.gov>
Date: 12/30/03 2:37PM
Subject: FW: DFP Cost Estimate - pCte 0jo LA 4°

Elaine;
I received Tim's approval on the attached final DFP Cost Estimate and am forwarding it for your review
prior to EIE submittal. One additional change will be made so that the site map in Appendix A shows an
outline of the areas where soil excavation was included In the estimate. I will forward the final piece, the
license application, after Tim reviews it. Regards,
-Bob

- -----Original Message-
> From: Schoenfelder, Robert P.
> Sent: Wednesday, December 17, 2003 4:33 PM
> To: 'Tim Knapp'
> Cc: Schoenfelder, Robert P.
> Subject: DFP Cost Estimate

> Tim;
> The attached Acrobat file is the revised DFP Cost Estimate in complete form - with attachments and
appendices. Let me know when you are ready for me to forward it to Elaine.
> -Bob

> > <<01ReportDFP CostEstFNL.pdf>>
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